SCREEN PRINTED APPAREL
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[ITEM ~ | QTY | Unit Prlce Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price [ Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price \ Ext. Price
T-SHIRT (no pocket) . I | L | - B
B YouthX-Small 150 |$ 425 $ 637.50|$  3.00 S 45000 |$ 297 § 44550 (% 475 $ 71250 |$ 773 $ 115950 [$ 412 $  61800($ 500 $ 75000
| YouthSmall 50 |$ 425 ¢ 21250|$% 3.00 $ 15000 |% 297 _:___S_ 14850 [$ 475 $ 23750 |$ 773§ 38650 ($ 412§ 20600|$ 500 $  250.00
 YouthMedium| 50 [$ 425 § 21250|$ 3.00 § 15000 |$ 297 § 14850 |$ 475 § 237.50|$ 773 $ 38650 |$ 412 $ 20600 |$ 500 $  250.00
- Youthlarge| 50 |$ 425 $ 212.50($ 300 § 15000 |$ 297 $ 14850 |$ 475 § 237.50|$ 773 § 38650 (S 412 § 20600|$ 500 $ 250.00
) YouthX-large 50 |$ 425|$ 212.50|$ 300 $ 15000 |$ 297 $  14850[$ 475 $ 23750|$ 773 $ 38650 (% 412 § 206005 500 $ 250.00
-  AdultSmall 675 |$ 425§ 2,868.75|$  3.00 $ 202500|$ 297 $ 2,00475|$ 585 S 3,94875|$ 773 |$ 5217.75|$ 412 $ 2,781.00 | $  5.00 $ 3,375.00
Adult Medium 675 |$ 425 $ 2,868.75|$  3.00|$ 202500 % 297 $ 2,00475|$ 585 '$ 394875|$ 773 $ 521775|$ 412 $ 2,781.00|$ 500 ' 337500
Adultlarge| 675 |$ 425 $ 2,86875|$ 300 $ 202500($ 297|$ 200475|$ 585 $ 3,94875|% 773 $ 521775|$% 412 $ 2,781.00 |$ 500 $ 3,375.00
 AdultX-large| 375 |$ 425 $ 1,50375|$  3.00 $ 1,12500|% 297 $ 1,11375|$ 585 $ 2,19375|$ 773 $ 289875|5 412 i; 1,545.00 | $  5.00 $ 1,875.00
Adult XX-large| 175 [$ 525 § 91875|$ 3.00 $  525.00 § 479 $  83825|$ 785 $ 1,37375|$ 923 ¢ 161525|$ 576 $ 1,00800|$ 600 $ 1,050.00
Adult XXX-Large! 100 | S 6.25 | § 625.00 | $ 3.00 ‘S 300.00 | § 579 § 579.00 | S 845 S 84500 (S 9.23 i$ 923.00 | $ 691 | § 691.00 | § 7.00 | § 700.00
TOTAL $ 13,231.25 S 9,075.00 S 9,584.75 $17,921.25 : S 23,795.75 $ 13,029.00 $ 15,500.00
T-SHIRT (pocket) | 1 - e | | o |

YouthXSmaH 10 |[NoBid = !_ $ 469 |53 46.90 | N/A _Youth sizeshaveno [ N/A Not available

Youth Small| 10 ; |$ 375|%  3750|$ 469 lS 4690 | N/A | pockets. | |N/A ‘ Not available

- Youth MEdIUI’T‘I‘ 10 P 5 835 \S 3750 |% 460 % 4690 | NA | - INA Not available

- Youth Large| 10 _ s 375 | $ 3750 |5 469 S 46.90 N/A ______‘______ | N/A | Not available -

- Youth X-Large 10 B 5 335|% 3750 i 469 S 46.90 | N/A e | N/A | Not available -
~ AdultSmall 10 ) $ 550 ¢  5500|$ 443 S 4430 i____&i ______ 8250 |$ 1192 |$ 11920 |$ 724 § 7240 |$ 800\5 80.00
Adult Medium 10 | |s 5508 s500[$ 443 S 4430 |$ 825 % 8250 |% 1192 |$ 11920|$ 724 $  7240($ 800 $  80.00
~ Adultlarge 10 ~|$ 5508 sso0|$ 4438  4430|$ 825 $  8250|$ 1192 $ 11920($ 724 $  7240($ 800 $  80.00
A AdultX-large] 10 | | $ 550 $  5500|$ 443§  4430|$ 825 § 8250|$ 1192 $ 11920|$ 724 $  7240|$ 800 '$ 80.00
Adult XX-Large| 10 B |s 550 8 5500|5564 % 5640 [$ 1025 $ 10250 |$ 1342 $  13420|$ 972 S 9720|5900 $  90.00
Adult XXX-Large! 10 S 5.50 § 55.00 | S 6.13 S 6130 | S 11.25 § 11250 (S 13.42 S 13420 |S 1126 | § 112.60 | $ 10.00 ‘S 100.00
TOTAL S 480.00 S 529.40 S 545.00 S 745.20 S 499.40 S 510.00
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SCREEN PRINTED APPAREL
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Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price

~ Youth X-Small ‘ 150 |
YouthSmall 50 | ' e 3
) ~ Youth Medium| 50 - -
o ~ Youthlarge 50 | [
Youth X-Large 50 o J -
~ AdultSmall 675 . |
~ Adult Medium 675 | I .
- Adult Large| 675 |
_ Adultxlarge 375 | |
) Adult XX-Large| 175 I N
Adult XXX-Large| 100
TOTAL
T-SHIRT (pocket) long sleeves ) o S
Youth X-Small 10 I N 0
o ~ Youth Small| 10 B
~ Youth IVledium| 0] | 8 -
A— 7 t{quth Large| 10 } - B
~ Youth X-large 10 | | E—
- Adult Small 10
Adult Medium| 10 |
L Adult Large, 10 -
~ AdultX-Large| 10 | -
- Adult XX-Large, 10 I i
Adult XXX-Large 10

TOTAL

ls 475 3 71250|5 1123 $ 168450
§ 475 $ 23750|$ 1123 § 56150 ) ] 1
e § 475 $ 23750|% 1123 § 56150 | |
| $ 475 8 23750($ 1123 $ 56150 |
] ] s 475 s 23750|$ 1123 $ se1s0| i o
|s 585 § 3904875|$ 1123 $ 758025 |
$ 58 $ 394875|$ 1123 $ 7,580.25 |
) $ 585 $ 3,948.75|$ 11.237; § 7,580.25 ]
|$ 585 $ 219375 |$ 1123 | § 4,21125 - B -
| |s 785 8 137375|$ 1273 $ 2,227.75 B
$ 845 S 84500 (% 1273 $ 1,273.00 | |
1$17,921.25 $34,383.25
~ N/A | not available L.
1 A _ 0 R
| NA B -
_ NA 1 I
_ NA | _ ] -
|$ 1045 $ 10450 I L
$ 1045 $ 10450 - |
| S 1045 $ 10450| . |
| $ 1045/ 10450 -
$ 1245 $ 12450 | |
$ 1345 $ 13450
$ 677.00




SCREEN PRINTED APPAREL
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ITEM QTY | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Prlce ' Ext. Price  Unit Price l Ext. Price Unit Price i Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Prlce Unit Price I Ext. Price | Unit Price  Ext. Price
SWEATSHIRTS (no hood) | 7 - N ] ) 1 - ] 7 .
— YouthX-Small 10 |NoBid s 675 $ 6750 (|$ 783 $ 7830 S__ 9.80 $ 9800 |3 12L5 12140 |$ 865 $ 8650 |$ 1000 $  100.00
: YouthSmall 20 | = $ 6.75__2_ 6750 |$ 7.83 $ '7830($ 980 $ 98.00|$ 1214 $ 12140 5..-....%@ 8650 |$ 1000 $  100.00
- ~ Youth Med_ium} 10 ~|$ 875 \s 6750 |$ 7.83 | $ 7830 |$ 980 |$ 9800 |5 1214 |$ 12140 |$ 865 $ 8650 |% 1000 $ 100.00
u Youth Large 10 | $ 675 $  6750|S 7835 78.30 [$  9.80 | 's 98.00 | $ 1214 § 12140 (|$ 865 '$  8650|$ 10,00 00 $  100.00

Youth X-large| 10 | |5 675\5 67503 783 $ 7830 |$ 980 $ 9800 |5 1214 § 12140|S  B8.65 $ 8650|$ 10.00 $ 100.00

Adult Small 300 s 675 S ”2,025.09 $ 763 $ 2,289.00[$ 1035 $ 3,105.00 |$ 1422 $ 4,266.00 |$  8.65 $ 259500 |% 10.00715 3,000.00

Adult Medium 300 | $ 675 $ 202500|$ 7.63 $ 2,280.00|$ 1035 $ 3,10500|$ 1422 $ 4,266.00|$ 865 $ 259500|% 10.00 S 3,000.00

- Adult Large\ 300 1 ~|$ 675|$ 202500|$ 7.63|$ 2,280.00|$ 1035 | S 3,105.00 | $ 1422 |$ 4,266.00 |$  8.65 s_ 2,595.00 [ $ 10.00 $ 3,000.00
. Adult X-Large 300 18 675 $ 202500|$ 7.63 '$  2,289.00|% 1035 S 3,105.00 [$ 14.22 § 4,26600|$ 865 $ 2595.00|% 10.00 | $ 3,000.00
o  Adult XX- Large| 100 $ 675 $ 675.00[$ 1007 $ 1,007.00$ 1195 $ 1,19500|$ 1622 $ 1,622.00|$ 1056 $ 1,056.00 |5 12.00 5 1,200.00

Adult XXX-Large 50 S 6.7513 33750 | $ 1107 S 553.50 [ $ 13.00 S 650.00 | § 16. 22‘3 811.00 | $ 11.69‘3 584.50 | $ 13.00‘$ 650.00
TOTAL S 9,450.00 $ 11,108.00 $14,755.00 $ 20,104.00 $ 12,453.00 $14,350.00
SWEATSHIRTS (hooded) , L L . N 3 | ,

B Youth X-small 10 | No Bid_ _|& 1¥s|s 117505 L 33§ 113.30 S 1429 $ 14290 |$ 1779 $ 17790 |$ 1143 $ 11430|$ 1500 $ 150.00

~ YouthSmall| 10 $ 1175 $ 11750 [$ 1133 $ 11330 $ ;Mp 14290 [$ 1779 $ 17790 |$ 1143 $ 11430 |$ 1500 $ 150.00

- Youth Medium 10 $ 1175|$ 11750 |$ 1133 |$ 11330 [$ 1429 $ 14290 |$ 1779 $ 17790 |$ 1143 | $ 11430|$ 1500 |5 150.00
o Youth Large 10 i s 1175 5771717.50 $ 1133 |$ 11330 |$ 1429 |$ 14290|$ 1779 |$ 17790 |5 1L 143§ 11430 |$ 1500 S 150.00
i Youth X-large 10 | $ 11 75|$ 117.50 |$ 1133 | $  11330|$ 14.29|$ 14290|$ 1779 |$ 17790 % 1143 § 11430|5 15.00 '$ 150.00
 AdultSmall 300 | |5 n35|s 353500|5 1107|$ 3,321.00 | $§ 1545 $ 4,635.00 [$ 1814 S 544200|5 1143\$ 3,429.00 [ $ 15.00 $ 4,500.00
B Adult Medium| 300 | s 1175 '§ 352500 |$ 1107 $ 3,321.00|% 1545 $ 4,635.00 |$ 1814 $ 5442.00|$ 1143 $ 3,42900($ 1500 |$ 4,500.00
_ Adult Large| 300 | | |$ 1175 $ 352500|% 1107 $ 3,32100|$ 1545 $ 4,635.00|$ 1814 $ 5442.00 |5 1143 | $ 3,429.00 |$ 1500 $ 4,500.00
T ~ Adult X-Large 300 i $ 1175 $ 352500 (% 1107 $ 3,321.00 |$ 1545 § 4,635.00|$ 18.14 |$ 544200 |5 1143 $ 342900 |5 1500 § 4,500.00
Adult XX-Large 100 $ 1175 |$ 117500 |$ 1509 ' $  1,509.00 |$ 17.60 'S 1,760.00 | $ 2064 $ 2,064.00 |$ 1326 $ 1,326.00|$ 17.00 | $ 1,700.00

AdultXXX—Large! 50 $ 1175 | S 587.50 | S 16.97'5 84850 | ¢ 1885 $ 94250 |$ 2064 S 1,03200|$ 1509 S 75450 (% 18.00;$ 900.00

TOTAL $ 16,450.00 S 16,208.00 $21,957.00 $ 25,753.50 $ 16,368.00 $21,350.00




SCREEN PRINTED APPAREL
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- ITEM | QTY | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price ‘ Ext. Price [ Unit Price ‘ Ext. Price Unit Price  Ext. Price

SWEATPANTS L B - I | ] B i |
- ‘Adult Small| 300 | No Bid $ 895 S 26800][s Vg.ﬁs__ﬂ_.oo $ 1492 |$ 4,476.00 '$ 1021 | $ 3,063.00 |$ 15.00 $ 4,500.00
~ AdultMedium 300 | |5 895 § 2685.00|$ 949 $ 2,847.00 |$ 1195 $ 3585.00|$ 1492 $ 447600 [$ 1021 § 3,06300|$ 1500 | $ 4,500.00
-  Adultlarge 300 | % 895 $ 2685005 949 $ 2847.00|$ 1195 § 3,585.00|$ 1492 $ 447600 |$ 1021 $ 3,063.00($ 1500 $ 4,500.00
~ Adultx-large 300 | |5 895 s 268500|$ 949§ 2,807.00|$ 1195 S 3,58500|$ 1492 $ 447600 |$ 1021 $ 3,063.00|$ 1500 $ 450000
Adult XX-Large, 100 | $ 895 $ 89500 |$ 1247 ' $ 1,247.00 |$ 1400 $ 1,400.00 |$ 1642 $ 1,64200|$ 1282 $ 1,28200|$% 1500 $ 1,500.00
Adult XXX-Large| 50 $ 895§ 44750 |$ 1347|% 67350 |$ 1475 ¢ 737.50 |$ 1642 | 82100 |$ 1380 | 690.00 % 1500 |% 750.00
TOTAL $ 12,082.50 $  13,308.50 $12,892.50 $ 20,367.00 $ 14,224.00 $20,250.00
BASKETBALL JERSEY . e I N | B | R
Adultsmall 80 [$ 525 § 42000|$ 995 $ 79600 |$ 591 $ 47280 [$ 1215 § 97200 |$ 1202 $ 96160 |$ 1269 '$ 1,01520 [§ 1300 § 1,040.00
Adult Medium 80 |$ 525 $ 42000|$ 995 $ 796.00($ 591 § 47280 |$ 1215 $ 97200|$ 1202 $ 96160 |$ 1269 $ 1,01520|$ 1300 $ 1,040.00
)  Adutlorge 80 |$ 525§ 42000|$ 995 § 79600 |$ 591 § 47280 |$ 1215 $ 972.00|$ 1202 $ 96160 |$ 1269 $ 101520 |$ 1300 § 1,040.00
. AdultX-large] 20 |§ 525 ¢ 10500|$ 995 % 199.00|$ 591 $ 11820 |$ 1360 $ 27200|$ 1202 | $ 24040 |$ 1260 $ 25380|$ 1300 $ 26000
 AdultxXlarge 10 |$ 825 $  8250($ 995 $ 9950 |8 797 $  7970|$ 1360 $ 136.00($ 1302 $ 13020|$ 1418 $ 14180 |§ 1400 $ 14000
AdultXXX-large 10 |$ 925 $  9250|$ 995 $  9950|$ 919 $ 9190 [ $ 15.00 |$  150.00 [ NOBID S 1567 § 15670|$ 1500 $ 150.00
TOTAL $  1,540.00 $  2,786.00 $  1,708.20 $ 3,474.00 $ 3,255.40 $ 3,597.90 $ 3,670.00
ATHLETICT-sHIRTS | N | ] | I R
~ AdultSmall 300 |NoBid $ 410 $ 1,23000|$ 377 $  1,131.00 L s 860|% 258000|$ 570 $ 1,710.00 |$ 13.00 $ 3,900.00
i Adult Medium 300 7 s 4108 12300(3% 377 $ 113200| |s 900/ 270000|$ 570 $ 1,71000|$ 13.00 ' $ 3,900.00
Adultlarge| 300 | $ 410|% 123000(% 377 ¢ 113100 | § 900 $ 270000 |$ 570 $ 1,71000 |$ 1300 $ 3,900.00
B Adult X-Large| 100 i $ 410 $ 41000|$ 377 $  377.00 . |s se0 $ 86000|$ 570 ¢ 570.00[$ 1300 $ 1,300.00
Adult XX-Large 10 s 4108 4100|$ 507 $ 50.70 N ~ |s 1001 $§ 10010|$ 687 |$ 6870 |$ 1400 $ 140.00
Adult XXX-Large 10 § 410 §  4100|$ 609 $ 60.90 | $ 1001 $ 10010|$ 7.55 $ 7550 |$ 1500 | $  150.00
TOTAL $  4,182.00 S 3,881.60 $ 9,040.20 $ 584420 $ 13,290.00




SCREEN PRINTED APPAREL
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- ITEM QTY | UnitPrice Ext.Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price  Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
ATHLETICSHORTS | e —pn| e s — | | I I
AdultSmall 300 |$ 895 $ 2,685.00|$ 800 $ 240000|$ 619 $ 1,857.00|$ 755 $ 2265005  9.00 '§ 2,70000[$  7.09 $ 2,127.00 % 13.00 '§ 3,900.00
_ Adult Medium 300 |$ 895 |$ 2,685.00 [$  8.00 '$ 2,40000|$ 619 $ 1,857.00 |$ 7.55 $ 2,265.00|$  9.00 '$ 270000 |$ 7.09 $ 2,127.00 $ 13.00 | $ 3,900.00
Adultlarge 300 [$ 895 $ 2,685.00|$ 800 § 240000[$ 619 $ 1,857.00|$ 755 § 2,265.00|$ 900 $ 270000 |$ 709 $ 2127.00 5 13.00 $ 3,900.00
-  AdultX-large 100 [$ 895 $ 895.00[$% 800 $  800.00|$ 619 S  619.00|$ 7.55 ' 755.00|$ 900 $ 90000 |$  7.09 ' 709.00 :;__13.070715”1,300.99_
3  AdultXx-large| 10 |$  9.95 ‘_s 9950 |$ 8008  80.00|$ 743 7430|$% 950 $ 9500($ 1100 $ 11000|$ 851 $ 8510 |$ 1400 $ 140.00
Adult XXX-Large! 10 |$ 1075 % 107.50 | $ 8.00 $ 80.00 S 793 $ 7930 |$ 1160 $ 11600 ($ 1100 S 110.00 |$ 9.95 $ 99.50 [$ 15.00$ 150.00
TOTAL $ 9,157.00 $ 8,160.00 S  6,343.60 $ 7,761.00 $ 9,220.00 $ 7,274.60 $13,290.00
WINDBREAKER (no hood) s B | | B | N |
- AdultSmall 50 | NoBid NoBid | $ 1697 | 84850 |$ 2145 '§ 1,07250 |$ 3861 $ 1,93050|$ 1971 § 98550 |$ 30.00 $ 1,500.00
Adult Medium| 50 | | |s 1697 8 84850 S 2145 S 1,072.50 |$ 3861 '§ 1,93050 [$ 1971 $ 98550 |$ 3000 $ 1,500.00
) AdultLarge| 100 | o ) 5 1697 $  1,697.00 | $ 7271.45"$ 2,145.00 | $  38.61 $ 3,861.00 | $ 1971 $ 1,971.00 |$  30.00 '$ 3,000.00
- ~ Adult X-Large 100 | ~|$ 1697 $  1,697.00 |$ 2145 $ 2,145.00 S 3861 | $ 3,861.00 $ 1971 |$ 1,971.00($ 3000 $ 3,000.00
) ) Adult XX-Large 100 $ 1897 $ 1,897.00 |§ 2370 $ 2,370.00 |$ 4111 $ 4,111.00 |$ 2086 '$ 2,086.00 | $  30.00 | $ 3,000.00
Adult XXX-Large‘ 50 1 | $ 1997 | 998.50 | §  25.99 | $ 1,299.50 | S 4111 $ 2,05550 (% 2314 $ 1,157.00|$ 33.00 | $ 1,650.00
TOTAL S  7,986.50 $10,104.50 $17,749.50 S 9,156.00 $ 13,650.00
WINDBREAKER (hooded) | i j | L B B B 7 B ) | N
o AdultSmall 50 |NoBid | |NoBid | |$ 1353 $ 67650 |$ 2255 6 1,127.50 | $ 4549 $ 2,27450 |$ 3115 $ 1555750 | $ 3500 $ 1,750.00
~ AdultMedium 50 | - - $ 1353 $ 67650 |$ 2255 '§ 1,127.50 |$ 4549 $ 227450 |$ 3115 $ 1,557.50 |$  35.00 ' § 1,750.00
L Adult Large 100 | , $ 1353 |$ 1,353.00 | $ 2255 $ 2,255.00 |$ 4549 $ 4,549.00|$ 3115 '$ 31500 |$ 3500 $ 3,500.00
Adult X-Large| 100 | N ) '$ 13.53 ' 1,35300|$ 2255 $ 2,255.00 |$ 45.49 |$ 4,549.00 |$ 3115 | $ 3,11500 [$  35.00 '$ 3,500.00
| Adult XX-Large| 100 7 $ 1353 $ 1,353.00 |$ 24.85 $ 2,485.00 (%5 4849 s 4,849.00 |$ 3230 $ 3,230.00|$ 3500 $ 3,500.00
Adult XXX-Large, 50 | $ 1353 |5 676.50 [ $ 27.15 | $ 1,357.50 |$ 48.49 $ 2,42450 |6 3458 $ 1,729.00|$ 38.00 $ 1,900.00
TOTAL $  6,088.50 $ 10,607.50 $ 20,920.50 $ 14,304.00 $ 15,900.00




SCREEN PRINTED APPAREL
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. ITEM QTY | Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price  Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Prfce ! Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
V-NECK PULLOVER JACKET I - | I | - | B | l _
Adult Small 50 | No Bid No Bid ! ~|$ 1837 S 918.50 [ $ 2145 $ 1,072.50 $ 3264 $ 163200|5 1514 $ 757.00|$ 17.00 $ 850.00
Adult Medium 50 | ls 1837 s 91850|s 2145 $ 1,07250|$ 3264 § 1,632.00|$ 1514 § 757.00|$ 17.00 $ 850.00
Adult Large, 100 ] | $ 1837 |$ 1,837.00 |$ 2145 $ 214500 |$ 32.64 | $ 3,264.00|$ 1514 $ 151400 |$ 17.00 $ 1,700.00
- Adult X-Large| 100 | X | $ 1837 $ 1,837.00 [$ 2145 $ 2,145.00|$ 32.64 \; 326400 |$ 1514 § 1,514.00 |$  17.00 |$ 1,700.00
Adult XX-Large| 100 ) $ 2037 $ 2,037.00 [$ 23.75|$ 2,375.00[$ 3564 $ 3,564.00 |$ 1628 $ 1,628.00|% 1800 S 1,800.00
Adult XXX-Large, 50 $ 2137 $ 1,06850|S$ 2598 | $ 1,299.00 |$ 3664 S 1,83200|$ 1857 $ 92850 $ 20.00 | $ 1,000.00
TOTAL S 8,616.50 $10,109.00 $ 15,188.00 S 7,098.50 $ 7,900.00
, _ I _ | I i L |
Set up Fee $0.00 | $000 - $0.00 | |5 10.00 ‘$ 22.00 | $0.00 _ E 25.00
| l per color of logo per screen /screen color

of each logo




EMBROIDERED APPAREL
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| ~ |Unit Price ;Exjc. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price !Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price |Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
. ITEM ~ary | i ) I T |
QUARTER-ZIP FLEECE PULLOVER (no hood) ] 1] N | 7_
Youth X-Small 10 | No Bid |s 1610 ¢ 16100|$ 1305 § 13050 | N/A . § 21718 21710 [NA |5 1600 $  160.00
Youthsmall 10 | $ 1610 $ 16100 |$ 1305 §  130.50 [ N/A § 21715 217.10|$ 1586 $ 15860 |$ 1600 $ 16000
B Youth Medium 20  |s 1610 § 32200 |$ 1305 $ 26100 | N/A ] |8 21718 4320|$ 158 $  317.20|$ 1600 $  320.00 |
- ~ Youthlarge, 15 o $ 1610 $ 24150 |$ 1305 ¢ 19575 |N/A $ 2171 $  32565|$ 1586 $  237.90|$ 1600 $  240.00
 YouthX-large| 200 $ 1610 $ 3,22000 [$ 13.05 § 2,610.00 |N/A NO BID ) |s 1586 $ 317200|$ 1600 $ 3,200.00
Adult Small 200 | |5 1610 § 3,22000|$ 1305 $ 2,610.00|$ 21.80 $ 4,360.00 |$ 23.03 | $ 4,606.00 | $ 1455 $ 291000 [§ 1600 § 3,200.00
~ Adult Medium 200 |s 1610 § 322000($ 1305 $ 261000 |$ 21.80 $ 4360.00 | $ 2303 | $ 4,606.00|$ 14.55 $ 2,910.00 |$ 1600 $ 3,200.00
- Adult Large 200 $ 1610 | $ 3,22000|$ 1305 $ 2610.00 |$ 21.80 $ 4,360.00 |$ 2303 $ 460600 |$ 1455 $ 2,910.00 |$ 1600 $ 3,200.00
77777 ~ AdultX-large 200 |s 1610 s 3,22000|$ 13.05 § 2,61000|$ 2180 $ 436000 |$ 2303 $ 4,606.00($ 1455 $ 2,910.00 |$ 16.00 '$ 3,200.00
~ Adultxx-large 10 | § 1610 $ 161.00|$ 1649 |$ 16490 |$ 2365 $ 23650 |$ 2503 § 25030 |$ 1757 § 17570|$ 1700 $  170.00
Adult XXX-Large 10 § 1610 S 16100 |$ 1799 § 17990 |$ 2365 $ 23650 |$ 2503 |§ 25030 [$ 2047 $ 20170 |$ 18.00 |$  180.00
TOTAL $ 17,307.50 $ 14,112.55 $ 17,913.00 $ 20,118.65 $ 15,903.10 $ 17,230.00
QUARTER-ZIP FLEECE PULLOVER (hooded) | TN | N _ .
Youth X-Small| 10 | No Bid | No Bid |s 18118 18110|N/A | NOBID NA $ 2600 $  260.00
B Youthsmall 10 | 1 $ 1811 $ 18110 [ N/A 1 Cwa § 2600 $  260.00
~ YouthMedium 20 | $ 1811 $ 36220 [ N/A | B B N/A ~ |$ 2600 § 52000
- Youth Largei 20 | g S 18.11 | $__ 362.20 | N/A ‘ i . ~|N/A S 26.00 $  520.00 |
~ Youthxlage 15 | 0 lsasu s ommes|nva | | nA - |$ 2600 39000
B Adultsmall| 200 | $ 1811 % 3,622.00 |$ 21.80 $ 4,360.00 | | | 1744 $ 3488005 3600 $ 7,200.00
] Adult Medium 200 |5 1811 $ 3622005 2180 $ 436000 | 7 § 1744 5 348800 | 3600 $ 7,200.00
B Adult Large 200 B $ 1811 § 3,622.00 |$ 21.80 S 4,360.00  |s 1744 s 348800($ 3600 $ 7,200.00
- Adult X-Large 200 | : § 1811 $ 3,622.00 [$ 21.80 $ 4,360.00 | $ 1744 $ 348800 |$ 3600 $ 7,200.00
-  Adult XX-Large| 10 | | § 2011 % 20110 |$ 23.65 $ 23650 s 1892 ¢ 189.20|$ 3700 $  370.00
Adult XXX-Large| 10 | ¢ 2111 §  21110|$ 2365 ¢  236.50 ¢ 2000 $ 20000|$ 3800 § 380.00
TOTAL $ 16,258.45 $ 17,913.00 $ 14,341.20 $ 31,500.00
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B | Unit Price EExt. Price Unit Price !Ext. Price Unit Price |Ext. Price Unit Price”j_Ext. Price.  |Unit Price  |Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
ITEM | ary B - ) I W 1 .
FULL-ZIP FLEECE (no hood) - | | B B w . T
Youth X-Small 10 | No Bid $ 1575 ¢ 15750 (% 1847 §  184.70 | | NOBID | | 1738 ¢ 17380($ 2100 § 21000
7 Youthsmall 10 | |$ 1575 § 15750 ¢ 1847 | $ 18470 | ] $ 1738 $ 17380 |$ 2100 $ 21000
- Youth Medium| 20 7 |$ 1575 ¢ 31500|$ 1847 $  36940| | - ~|s 17388 3a760|$ 2100 $ 42000
Youth Large 15 | $ 1575 § 23625|$ 1847 §  277.05| § 17.38|$ 26070 |$ 2100 $  315.00
 YouthX-large 200 B § 1575 $ 3,150.00 |$ 1847 $ 3,694.00 | T § 1738 $ 347600 |$ 21.00 $ 4,200.00
Adult Small| 200 $ 1575|$ 3,150.00 |$ 1847 | $ 3,694.00 |$ 19.00 $ 3,800.00 § 1853 $ 3,706.00 | $ 2400 $ 4,800.00
] Adult Medium| 200 | |$ 1575 $ 3150.00|$ 1847 |$ 369400 |$ 1900 $ 380000| $ 1853 § 3,706.00 | $ 24.00 $ 4,800.00
B  Adultlarge 200 ) § 1575 $ 3,150.00 |$ 1847 $ 3,694.00 $ 19.00 $ 3,800.00 | $ 18.53 | § 3,706.00 |$ 2400 $ 4,800.00
~ Adultx-large 200 | |3 1575 ¢ 315000 |$ 1847 $ 3,694.00 |$ 19. oo\s 3,800.00 | $ 1853 $ 3,706.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 4,800.00
 Adultxx-large 10 | § 1575 $  157.50 |$ 2147 §  21470|$ 2015 $ 20150 | . |s 1967 8 19670[$ 2500 $ 250.00
Adult XXX-Large| 10 § 1575 % 15750 |§ 2247 |§ 22470 |$ 2245 § 22450 $ 2196 $ 219.60 |$ 27.00 $  270.00
TOTAL $ 16,931.25 $ 19,925.25 § 15,626.00 $ 19,672.20 § 25,075.00
FULL-ZIP FLEECE (hooded) o | B I | ] ] B
B YouthXSmaII\ 10 | NoBid | NoBid |s 1625 s 16250|$ 1885 $ 18850 |NOBID |5 1400 $ 14000 % 1700 $  170.00
Youthsmall 10 | § 1625 $ 16250 |$ 18.85 $ 18850 $ 1400 $ 14000 [$ 1700 $  170.00
Youth Medium| 20 [ § 1625 32500 |$ 1885|$ 37700 § 1400 $  280.00|$ 17.00 $  340.00
 Youthlarge| 15 | - § 1625 $  243.75|$ 1885 § 28275 |5 1400 s 21000|$ 1700 $ 25500
u YouthX-large 200 [ | B $ 1625 $ 3,25000|$ 1885 $ 377000 | s 1400 § 280000|$ 17.00 $ 3,400.00
] ~ AdultSmall 200 | § 1625 $ 3,25000 |$ 2150 $ 4,300.00 $ 1400 $ 280000 |$ 23.00 | § 4,600.00
~ AdultMedium 200 ) | § 1625 $ 3,250.00 |$ 2150 | $ 4,300.00 $ 1400 $ 2,800.00 [$ 23.00 $ 4,600.00
Adult Large| 200 7 R § 1625 § 3,250.00 | $ 2150 | § 4,300.00 $ 1400 $ 2,800.00 |$ 23.00 $ 4,600.00
. Adultx-large 200 | - $ 1625 $ 325000 |$ 2150 $ 4,300.00 | | 1400 § 280000 |$ 23.00 $ 4,600.00
B  AdultXX-large 10 | - |$ 2525 ¢  25250|$ 2450 $ 24500| § 1772 $ 17720 $ 2400 $  240.00
Adult XXX-Large 10 $ 2625 8 26250 |$ 2500 $  250.00 $ 1936 $ 19360 [$ 2500 $ 25000




EMBROIDERED APPAREL
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_____ v e Unit Price Ext.Price  |Unit Price Ext.Price  |Unit Price Ext. Prlce Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price I[E_xt. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price ~ |Unit Price §Ext. Price
ITEM _an ] | | i ] , N
TOTAL S 17,658.75 $ 22,501.75 S 15,140.80 $ 23,225.00
_______ I I R | . | | N .
OXFORD SHIRTS (left breast pocket) - B 7 ‘ b __3_____ B ) ‘ )
- adultsmall 10 |$ 1499 s 14990 | NoBid |8 1997 ¢ 19970 |$ 2185 § 21850 |$ 37,44{?_ 27440 |$ 1510 | $ 15100 |$ 23.00 §  230.00
Adult Medium 10 |$ 1499 § 14990|  |$ 1997 '$ 19970 ($ 21.85|$ 21850 ($ 2744 $ 27440|$ 1510|$  151.00|$ 23.00 $  230.00
] Adultlarge, 20 |$ 1499 $ 299.80 | . |$ 1997 '$ 39940|$ 21.85 $ 437.00|$ 2744 $ 54880 |$ 1510 $ 30200 |$ 2300 S  460.00
 Adultx-large| 20 |$ 1499 $  299.80 | |s 1997 ' § 39940 (¢ 2185 § 437.00|$ 2744 $ 54880 |$ 1510 $ 30200 |$ 2300 $  460.00
 AdultXxlarge 10 |$ 1799 § 17990|  |$ 2397 $ 23970 |$ 2420 $ 24200 |$ 2894 $ 28940($ 16.24 \s 162.40 | $ 2500 $  250.00
Adult XXX-Large 10 S 18.99 , S 189.90 S 24.97 } S 24970 | S 2535 S 253.50 | S 28.94 | S 289.40|S 1853 S 18530 | § 27.00 S 270.00
TOTAL $ 1,269.20 S 1,687.60 S 1,806.50 S 2,225.20 S 1,253.70 $ 1,900.00
OXFORD SHIRT (no pocket) NS ] - I e e I T
AdultSmall 10 |$ 17.99 $ 179.90 | NoBid | $ 1937 'S 19370 | N/A 1 Inoep  |$ 2196 $ 21960|% 3200 $ 32000
B Adult Medium| 10 |$ 1799 $ 17980| | |$ 1937 $ 19370 L 1 C|$ 2196 $ 21960 [$ 3200 $  320.00
 Adultlarge 20 |$ 17.99 $§  359.80 C|$ 1937 _i_ 387.40 N | |s 2196 $ 43920 |$ 3200 $  640.00
7 AdultX-large 20 |$ 17.99 |$  359.80 | ) $ 1937 § 38740| | s 2196 8 43920|$ 3200 §  640.00
 AdultXX-large 10 |$ 1899 $  189.90 7 |s 2237 8 22370 |$ 2310 $  231.00|$ 3400 $ 340,00
Adult XXX-Large. 10 |$ 2099 $  209.90 $ 2337 §  233.70 | | $ 2539 $ 25390 (% 3600 $  360.00
TOTAL S 1,479.20 S 1,619.60 S 1,802.50 S 2,620.00
KHAKI PANTS - L R R o
X-Small (Waist 28-30) \ |
(inseam29) 20 [$ 17.99 $ 359.80 | NoBid | ) - NAL |noBID | ) NOBID | | noBiD
Small (Waist 30-32) (Inseam‘ 1 ‘
30) 20 |$ 1799 § 359.80| i | i | B . 1| e I -
Medium (Waist 32- 34)
: (Inseam32) 20 |35 1799 5 35980 o - B B I R |
Large (Waist 34-36) (Inseam| ; . | ‘ \
33) 20 $ 1799 § 359.80 | f
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B N Unit Price Ext. Price  |Unit Priggr‘Ext. Price  |Unit Price Ext.Price  |Unit Price Ext.Price  [UnitPrice  Ext. P[iﬁ; hﬂg[ice{ixt. Price Unit Price Ext.Price
ITEM v | 1 I N I A
X-Large (Waist 36-38) 1 i |
(Inseam 34)| 20 |$ 1799 $§ 359.80 . ,
TOTAL $1,799.00
_ I N RN S 1 | | I R B B R .
THREE SEASONJACKET L L N . N N e
AdultSmall 20 |NoBid [NoBid ~ [$ 3477 $ 69540 |$ 3225 $ 645.00|$ 2975 § 595.00|$ 3111 S 62220 |$ 60.00 $ 1,200.00
. Adult Medium| 20 | L $ 3477 |$ 69540 |$ 3225 $ 64500 (% 2975 $ 59500 ($ 3111 $  622.20|$ 60.00 $ 1,200.00
. Adultlargel 20 | | $ 3477|$ 69540 (% 3225 § 64500|$ 2975 $ 595.00($ 3111 $  622.20|$ 60.00 $ 1,20000
~ AdultX-large, 20 | ] | $ 3477 § 69540 [$ 32.25|% 64500 [$ 2975 $ 59500 |$ 3111 $ 62220 |$ 60.00 $ 1,200.00
Adult XX-large, 20 | | L |$ 3777 $ 75540 |$ 3455 |6 69100 |$ 3175 $ 63500 |$ 3340 $  668.00|$ 6100 $ 1,220.00
Adult XXX-Large 20 | $ 3877 § 77540|¢ 3565 ¢ 713.00|$ 3175 $ 635.00|$ 3454 S 69080 | $ 63.00 $ 1,260.00
TOTAL $  4,312.40 $ 3,984.00 $ 3,650.00 $  3,847.60 $ 7,280.00
LADIES RAINWEAR JACKET - | ] 1 1 . i N
B  AdultSmall 10 |NoBid | _ NoBid | $ 3111 $ 31110 |$ 2880 $ 28800 (% 4074 $  407.40 $ 2097 § 29970 |$ 3600 $  360.00
- Adult Medium 10 ) i | § 3111 $ 31110 |$ 2880 |$ 28800 |$ 4074 $ 407.40 |$ 2997 |$  299.70 [$ 36.00 $  360.00
- Adult Large 10 B B . l$ 3111 ¢ 311.10|% 2880 $ 28800|$ 4074 $ 40740 |$ 2997 '$ 299.70 | $ 3600 $  360.00
B Adultx-LargQ 10 - I R $ 3111 $ 31110 |$ 2880 $ 28800 (% 4074 ' § 40740 |$ 2997 $ 29970 | $ 3600 §  360.00
~ AdultXX-large 10 | 1 $ 3311 $ 33110 |$ 31.00 '$ 31000 |$ 4224 |$ 42240|$ 3111 $§  311.10|$ 3800 $ 38000
Adult XXX-Large| 10 . $ 3411 $ 34110 [ N/A $ 4224 S 42240 |$ 33.40 S 334.00|$ 40.00 $  400.00
TOTAL $  1,916.60 |S 1,462.00 $ 2,474.40 $  1,843.90 $ 2,220.00
POLO-TYPE UNIFORM SHIRT - - b R | | N ] - T -
- __YouthX-Small‘ 50 |$ 635 $ 31750 ($ ssolsﬂq $ 9375 468.50 | $ 11.55?$ 577.50 | $ 13.107!s 655.00 . Reject
B ~ Youthsmall S0 [$ 635 § 31750|$ 850 $ 425.00($ 937 |$ 46850 |$ 1155 $ 57750 |$ 1320 $ 65500 | i .k -
~ YouthMedium| 50 [$ 635 $ 31750 |$ 850 $ 42500|$ 937 $ 46850 |$ 1155 $ 57750 |$ 13.10 $ 655.00| | ) N
- Youthlarge 50 |$ 635 '§ 31750 |$ 850 ¢ 42500|% 937 $ 46850 |$ 1155 ' 577.50|$ 1310 $  655.00 ] s i
Youth X-large. 100 |$ 635 & 63500|$ 850 $ 85000|$ 937 ¢ 937.00[$ 1155 $ 1,155.00($ 13.10 $ 1,310.00 |
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- , | Unit Price iExtLIDriL Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price W Price  |Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price {Ext. Price Unit P[L(ei Ext. Price
. omm e | | I | L I I I
~ Adultsmall 200 |$ 635 $ 1,27000|$ 850 § 170000 |$ 937 $ 1,874.00|$ 1155 $ 231000|$ 1517 $ 3,034.00 /- D
S AdU|t Medium| 200 |$ 635 $ 1,270.00 $ 850 | $ 1,700.00 |$ 937 $ 1,874.00 S 1_1_.§5'_Sj310.00 $ 1517 $ 3,034.00
7Adu_|t |-3ng| 200 |$ 635 | $ 1,27000|$ 850 $ 1,700.00|$ 9.37 ‘ $ 1,874.00|$ 1155 $ 2,310.00 $ 1517 'S5 3,034.00 | - - B
 Adulxlargel 200 [$ 635 $ 127000($ 850 $ 1,70000|$ 937 $ 187400 |$ 1155 $ 231000|$ 157 $ 3,034.00 | B
 AdutXxlarge 100 |$ 670 $ 670.00|$ 850 $ 850.00|$ 1037 $ 1,037.00 |$ 1265 § 1,26500 (S 1667|5 166700 | )
Adult XXX-LEI‘EE“ 100 |$ 670/$ 67000|% 850 S 850.00|$ 1137 $ 1,137.00|$ 13.85 S 1,385.00 (S 16.67 $ 1,667.00 |
TOTAL S 8,325.00 $ 11,050.00 S 12,481.00 $ 15,355.00 $ 19,400.00
| | | |
One-time digitizing fee, if any | - 50.00 | ‘ ~ $0.00 $0.00 '$  25.00)| B $0.00 ‘ - $0.00 | % 3500
\ per logo | | /design




