
LIBRARY BOOKS

BID TABULATION SHEET
Bids Opened: 11:00 AM 08/24/2016
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 # ISBN # TITLE Superior Childrens Textbook Mrs. Nelson Follett Books N Ingram Advanced Perma- Baker & Eastern

Text Plus Warehouse Library Svcs School Sol Things Library Educational Bound Taylor Book

1 1-457-62890-2 BEDF 2014 Sources for Americas History to 1877  Vol. 1 $36.99 N/A $28.00 $30.44 $32.95 $38.00 $37.83 $30.02 $31.41 $39.80 $33.24

13: 9781457628900 (P)

2 1-457-62891-0 BEDF 2014 Sources for Americas History Sources since 1865 $36.99 N/A $28.00 $30.44 $32.95 $38.00 $37.83 $30.02 $31.41 $39.80 $33.24

9.78146E+12 Vol. 2 (P)

3 1-457-65174-2 BEDF 2014 Americas History Teacher Edition $68.00 N/A $125.00 Sole Source $185.24 $165.00     -- NO BID NO BID NO BID    ----    

13:  9781457651748 (High School) (P)

4 0-321-80924-6 Pren 2014 Chemistry A Molecular Approach $272.34 N/A $245.85 $232.44 $143.74 out of stock $298.06 $239.66 $256.34 NO BID $274.16

13: 9780321809247             qty not available

5 0-06-239734-6 Harp 2015 Peoples History of the United States $10.23 N/A $12.00 $9.00 $11.76 $15.79 $12.19 $9.99 $14.95 $11.79 $12.39

13: 9780062397348 1492 to AD (P)

6 1-457-62893-7 BEDF 2014 Americas History W/Intergrated Media $128.32 N/A $136.00 $118.67 $129.89 out of stock $148.90 $118.38 $123.86 NO BID $131.09

13: 9781457628931 (High School Ed)

7 0-06-231500-5 Harp  2014 Alchemist AD (P) $8.24 N/A $10.17 $7.65 $10.19 $13.42 $10.36 $8.50 $12.71 $10.02 $10.53

13: 9780062315007

8 0-7434-7756-1 SIMO 2004 Merchant of Venice Y/A (P) $3.17 $5.99 $3.60 $2.70 $3.18 $4.73 $3.65 $3.00 $4.48 $3.53 $3.71

13: 9780743477567

9 0-321-71535-7 ADDI 2014 College Physics $264.48 N/A $240.00 $231.84 $255.71 out of stock $281.11 $233.07 $249.29 NO BID $266.62

13: 9780321715357

10 0-13-364749-8 Pren 2009 Conceptual Physics $109.29 N/A $98.47 $68.38 $88.47 $109.00 $119.31 $94.87 $89.50 NO BID $116.85

13: 9780133647495

11 1-68240-455-2 AMSC 2016 United States History Preparing for the exam (P) $25.16 N/A $25.27 $19.90 $22.30 out of stock $25.53 $20.32 NO BID NO BID $22.53

13: 9781682404553

12 1-256-74147-7 PREN 2013 CME Algebra 2 Common Core $102.33 N/A $90.71 $65.98 $54.08 out of stock $80.00 $88.43 NO BID NO BID $97.35

13:  9781256741473

13 1-256-74181-7 PREN 2013 CME Algebra 2 Common Core (Teachers) $121.42 N/A $107.97 Sole Source $0.00 out of stock    -- NO BID NO BID NO BID    --   

13: 9781256741817

14 1-457-60606-2 BEDF 2013 Everythings and Argument (P) $51.63 N/A $43.50 $46.74 $51.18 out of stock    -- $46.65 NO BID NO BID $52.24

13:9781457606069
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15 978007872654-5 Glencoe Health Student Edition (National) $134.02 N/A $71.09 $116.93 $44.85 $118.70   -- $89.56 $78.56 NO BID $142.74

16 978-0-07-872657-6 Glencoe Health National Teacher Wraparound Edition $166.36 N/A $92.00 Sole Source $0.00 $118.70   -- $108.51 NO BID NO BID    ---   

17 978-0-06-239734-8 Howard Zinn  (this line should be deleted per Addendum #1)  - N/A $11.99Removed per adden NB     -- $12.19 deleted per adden    -------- duplicate duplicate

18 9.78032E+12 The Catcher in the Rye $9.08 $15.00 $9.00 $7.05 $7.06 $11.85 $9.15 $7.50 $11.22 $8.85 $9.30

19 9.78074E+12 The Tragedy of Hamlet, Prince Of Denmark $3.27 $5.99 $3.59 $2.70 $3.89 $4.73 $3.65 $3.00 $4.48 $3.53 $3.71

20 9.7815E+12 The House of The Spirits : $9.94 $16.00 $9.60 $7.20 $8.47 $12.64 $9.76 $7.99 $11.97 $9.44 $9.92

21 9.78014E+12 The Odyssey $11.29 $18.00 $10.80 $9.90 $10.63 $14.22 $10.98 $9.00 $13.46 $10.62 $11.16

22 9.7814E+12 Beloved : $9.82 $16.00 $9.60 $8.80 $9.22 $12.64 $9.76 $8.35 $11.97 $9.44 $9.92

23 9.78014E+12 The Adventures Of Huckleberry Finn $3.67 $5.99 $3.59 $3.29 $3.18 $4.73 $3.65 $3.00 $4.48 $3.53 $3.71

24 9.78014E+12 The Grapes of Wrath $11.06 $18.00 $10.80 $10.29 $11.20 $14.22 $10.98 $9.00 $12.72 $10.62 $11.61

25 9.78062E+12 The Things They Carried : $9.64 $15.99 $9.59 $7.20 $9.19 $12.63 $9.75 $8.58 $11.93 $9.43 $9.91

26 9.78035E+12 The Autobiography of Malcolm X $5.02 $7.99 $4.79 $4.39 $5.17 $6.31 $4.87 $4.00 $5.98 $4.71 $4.95

27 978-1402754210 Classic Starts Peter Pan $4.35 $6.95 $4.17 $3.82 $4.09 $5.49 $3.61 $3.50 $4.45 $3.68 $4.31

28 978-0698113824 Lon Po Po $4.37 $7.99 $4.79 $4.39 $4.24 $6.31 $4.87 $4.00 $5.98 $4.71 $4.95

29 978-1587170003 Aesop’s Fables Face to Face with Wolves $13.22 $19.99 $11.99 $1.35 $10.82 $15.79 $10.39 $9.99 $14.95 $10.57 $12.39

30 978-1426306983 Face to Face with Wolves $3.90 $6.95 $4.17 $3.13 $3.68 $5.49 $4.24 $3.59 $5.20 $4.10 $4.31

31 978-1553379546 One well: The Story of Water on Earth $11.88 $18.95 $11.37 $8.91 $10.04 $14.97 $9.85 $9.59 $14.18 $10.02 $11.75

32 978-0545278492 Eight Days: A Story of Haiti  $9.91 $17.99 $10.79 $8.46 $10.38 $14.21 $9.35 $9.00 $13.46 $12.59 $11.15

33 978-0141312354 Frightful’s  Mountain $4.45 $6.99 $4.19 $3.84 $4.54 $5.52 $4.26 $3.59 $5.23 $4.12 $4.33

34 978-1400064168 Unbroken: A World War II Story of Survival, Resilience, and Redemption $9.87 $28.00 $16.80 $15.40 $16.80 $22.12 $14.56 $14.00 $11.97 $9.44 $17.36

35 978-0345511010 A Mighty Long Way: My Journey to Justice at Little Rock Central High School $9.67 N/A $9.60 $8.80 $13.65 $12.64 $9.76 $8.00 $11.97 $9.44 $9.92

36 978-0756545123 Little Rock Girl 1957: How a Photographer Changed the Fight for Integration $5.97 $8.95 $5.46 $5.01 $5.29 $7.07 $5.46 $4.59 $6.81 $5.37 $5.64

37 978-1598454208 Poison Dart Frogs $5.72 $7.95 $5.98 $6.36 $5.05 out of stock   -- $12.12 $7.00 $8.42 out of print

38 978-1433957444 Deadly Poison Dart Frogs $5.03 $6.95 $5.71 $4.48 $4.80 out of stock $7.91 $4.38 $6.10 $7.34 $6.11

39 978-0756682323 Everything You Need to Know about Frogs and Other Slippery Creatures $10.02 $15.99 $9.59 $8.80 $9.22 $12.63 $8.31 $8.58 $11.96 $8.46 $9.91

40 978-1607270690 Bullfrog at Magnolia Circle NO BID N/A NO BID $4.92 out of stock out of stock   --  NO BID $5.20 NO BID out of print

41 978-0374403454 All the Small Poems and Fourteen More $5.88 $8.99 $5.99 $4.67 $5.88 $9.99 $6.09 $5.00 $7.47 $5.89 $7.49

42 978-0375837289 Magic Tree House #37:Dragon of the Red Dawn $2.80 $4.99 $2.99 $2.74 $2.65 $3.94 $3.04 $2.50 $3.73 $2.94 $3.09
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43 978-0375830341 Magic Tree House #33: Carnival at Candlelight $2.80 $4.99 $2.99 $2.74 $2.65 $3.94 $3.04 $2.50 $3.73 $2.94 $3.09

44 978-0375830327 Magic Tree House #34: Season of Sandstorms $2.80 $4.99 $2.99 $2.74 $2.65 $3.94 $3.04 $2.50 $3.73 $2.94 $3.09

45 978-0375867958 Magic Tree House #45: A Crazy Day with Cobras $2.80 $4.99 $2.99 $2.74 $2.65 $3.94 $3.04 $2.50 $3.73 $3.82 $3.09

46 978-1600146749 Exploring Countries: Japan NO BID $6.99 $4.19 $3.84 $4.12 out of stock $4.26 $3.75 $5.23 $6.29 $4.89

47 978-1600146732 Exploring Countries: Italy $5.17 $6.99 $4.19 $3.84 $4.12 out of stock $4.26 $3.75 $5.23 $6.29 $4.89

48 978-1600145551 Exploring Countries: India $5.17 $6.99 $4.19 $3.84 $4.12 out of stock $4.26 $3.75 $5.23 $6.29 $4.89

49 978-1600145926 Exploring Countries: Iraq $18.25 $19.95 $15.57 $3.84 $12.09 $23.20 $18.96 $13.38 $5.23 $19.09 $4.89

50 978-0736848176 The Iroquois: The Six Nations Confederacy $4.98 N/A $4.91 $4.50 $4.76 out of stock  --- $4.25 $6.12 NO BID out of print

51 978-0141301693 Eagle Song $3.03 $4.99 $2.99 $2.74 $2.65 $3.94 $3.04 $2.50 $3.73 $2.94 $3.09

52 978-0153052125 The Keeping Quilt $5.75 N/A $4.79 $3.60 $4.24 $6.31 $4.87 $4.00 $5.98 NO BID out of print

53 978-0802853028 A River of Words: The Story of William Carlos Willi $12.67 $14.45 $10.50 $7.88 $10.29 $13.82 $9.10 $10.88 $13.09 $9.26 $13.13

54 978-1429672139 The Scoop on Clothes, Homes, and Daily Life in Colonial America $4.95 $7.95 $4.86 $4.46 $4.72 $6.40 $4.94 $4.05 $6.06 $4.78 $5.02

55 978-0590451604 If You Lived in Colonial Times $3.79 $6.99 $4.19 $3.29 $4.04 $5.52 $4.26 $3.50 $5.23 $4.12 $4.33

56 978-1604130898 Animal Behavior: Animal Defense $33.03 $35.00 $28.00 $17.50 $28.82 out of stock $33.95 $18.77 $30.80 $26.78 $33.25

57 978-1581960433 Venom $15.99 $14.96 $8.39 $10.97 $7.06 $9.47   -- $7.45 $8.96 $7.07 out of print

58 978-1429679961 Can You Survive in the Wilderness? An Interactive Survival Adventure $5.92 $6.95 $4.17 $3.82 $4.05 $5.49 $4.24 $3.50 $5.20 $4.10 $4.31

59 978-0792258674 Divided Loyalties: The Barton Family during the American Revolution $24.29 N/A $21.70 $11.68 $19.25 $24.95   --  $20.87 $22.33 $25.95 out of print

60 978-1554510870 The Inuit Thought of It: Amazing Arctic Innovations (We Thought of It) $5.09 $9.95 $5.97 $5.47 $5.27 $7.86 $6.07 $5.00 $7.44 $5.87 $6.17

61 978-0786838653 The Lightening Thief $5.58 $7.99 $4.79 $3.76 $6.84 $6.31 $4.87 $4.00 $5.98 $4.71 $4.95

62 978-0440406945 D’Aulaires Book of Greek Myths $12.56 $19.95 $11.97 $10.97 $10.56 $15.76 $12.17 $10.00 $14.92 $11.77 $12.37

63 978-0761156079 World Without Fish NO BID $16.95 $8.97 $9.15 $7.92 out of stock   -- $8.02 $11.18 NO BID $11.21

64 978-0375861253 Flush $4.39 $6.99 $4.19 $3.84 $4.54 $5.52 $4.26 $3.50 $5.23 $4.12 $4.33

65 978-1590787847 Nadia’s Hands $14.00 $9.95 $5.97 $4.48 $5.27 $7.86 $6.07 $5.00 $7.44 $5.87 $6.17

66 978-0446314862 The Kill a Mocking Bird $4.99 N/A $5.39 $4.23 $7.69 $7.10 $5.48 $4.50 $6.72 $5.30 $5.57

67 MOVIE/Dir. Robert Mulligan The Kill a Mocking Bird (movie) $20.00 N/A NO BID $16.49 $9.62 $12.58 $10.34 $12.85 $8.54 NO BID $14.26
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