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1 Thurston Foods Shaheen Bros. Donahue Bros. Conlon Products Sal's Production
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=2

4 BEANS, CANNED

5 1|Baked Bean, #10 can $3.349 ea |$20.09 pk 6/#10 Furman $2.94ea  $17.65 pk 6/10# Hanover $4.12 ea $24.67 pk 6/10 Furman No Bid No Bid

6 2|Black Bean, #10 can $2.92 ea $17.54 pk 6/#10 Furman $2.88ea  $17.28 pk 6/10# Hanover $3.30 ea $19.80 pk 6/10 Furman No Bid No Bid

7 3| Garbanzo Bean, #10 can $3.00 ea $18.05 pk 6/#10 Furman $2.98ea  $17.88 pk 6/10# Hanover $3.42 ea $20.48 pk 6/10 Furman No Bid No Bid

8 4|Kidney Bean, #10 can $3.349 ea |$20.09 pk 6/#10 Furman $3.15ea  $18.90 pk 6/10# Hanover $3.73 ea $22.36 pk 6/10 Furman No Bid No Bid

o | \ \

10 BREAKFAST ITEMS

11 BAGELS, WHOLE GRAIN, IW, FROZEN ‘ ‘ ‘

12 5|Bagel, Flavor Whole Wheat $ .157ea $11.31pk 722z Aesops honey $ .19ea |$13.60 pk 72/20z Muffin Town No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 6|Bagel, Flavor Cinn Raisin $ .157ea $11.31pk 722z Aesops blueberry $ .19ea |$13.60 pk 72/20z Muffin Town No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 7|Bagel, Flavor French Toast $ .157ea $11.31pk 722z Aesops French Toast $ .19ea |$13.60 pk 72/20z Muffin Town No Bid No Bid No Bid

15 BAGELS, WHOLE GRAIN, BULK PACK, FROZEN ‘ ‘ ‘

16 8|Bagel, Flavor Whole Wheat $ .140ea $11.82 pk 84/2z Aesops plain $ .16ea |$12.90 pk 80/2.3 0z Original Bagel No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 9|Bagel, Flavor Cinn Raisin $ .140ea $11.82 pk 84/2z Aesops cinn/raisin $ .165ea |$13.19 pk 80/2.30z Original Bagel No Bid No Bid No Bid

18 10|Bagel, Flavor French Toast $ .140ea $11.82 pk 84/2z Aesops sesame $ .165ea ($13.19 pk 80/2.3 0z Original Bagel No Bid No Bid No Bid
PRE-PACKAGED BREAKFASTS, ASSORTED ‘ ‘ ‘

19 TYPES

20 11|Pre-Packaged Breakfast, ‘ ‘

21 Flavor red sug cinn toast cr $ .834ea $60.07 pk 72ct ES Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid

22| 12|Pre-Packaged Breakast, | | L mpstor resucedsuar

23 Flavor Multi gr cheerios $.834ea  $50.06 pk 60 ct ES Foods Froot Loops/Grahams $ 90ea |$39.80 pk 44/6.10z Kellogg's No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 13| Pre-Packaged Breakfast, ‘ ‘ Jumpstart reduced sugar

25 Flavor Frosted Flakes $ .883ea $38.86 pk 44 ct Kelloggs Frosted Flakes/Grahams $ 90ea |$39.80 pk 44/6.10z Kellogg's No Bid No Bid No Bid

26 CEREAL, BOWL PACK, ASSORTED

27 14| Cereal Bowl, 96ct.

28 Flavor various $ 212ea  |$20.40 pk 96ct Kelloggs Cheerios $ 18ea  $17.49 pk 96ct Gen Mills $ .182ea $17.47 pk 96ct Gen Mills No Bid No Bid

29 15| Cereal Bowl, 96ct.

30 Flavor various $ .180ea |$17.36 pk 96¢ct Gen Mills Cinn Toast Crunch $ .18ea  $17.49 pk 96ct Gen Mills No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 16| Cereal Bowl, 96ct.

32 Flavor various $ .180ea  |$17.34 pk 96 ct Post/MOM Trix $ .18ea  $17.49 pk 96ct Gen Mills No Bid No Bid No Bid

33 CEREAL, OATMEAL, HOT, PLAIN

34 17|Oatmeal, Hot, Plain $ .030ea $24.68 pk 50lb Gilster $2.65ea |$31.80 pk 12/420z Quaker No Bid No Bid No Bid

35 CINNAMON ROLLS, WHOLE GRAIN, PAR-BAKED

36 18|Cinnamon Rolls $ .198ea  |$31.82 pk 160/2.252 | Bridgeford $.14ea  $3453pk 240/1.250z Rich's No Bid No Bid No Bid

37 CINNAMON ROLLS, WHOLE GRAIN, IW, FROZEN ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

38 19|Cinnamon Rolls, IW $ .319ea [$11.49 pk 36/2.75z |Hadley $ 3lea $22.32pk 7220z Sky Blud No Bid No Bid No Bid
CINNAMON CRUMB CAKE, WHOLE GRAIN, IW,

39 EROZEN

40 20|Cinnamon Crumb Cake, IW $ .369ea $26.60 pk 72/3z Sky Blue No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CHURROS, WHOLE GRAIN, FRUIT FILLED,

41 INDIVIDUALY WRAPPED

42 21|Churros,

43 Flavor Apple $ 276ea  |$27.60 pk 100/1.9z |J&J Apple $ 26ea  $25.90 pk 100/1.90z  J&J Snacks No Bid No Bid No Bid

44 22| Churros, ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

45 Flavor Raspberry $ 276ea  |$27.60 pk 100/1.9z |J&J Raspberry $ 26ea  $25.90 pk 100/1.90z  J&J Snacks No Bid No Bid No Bid

46 23| Churros, ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

47 Flavor Original $ 276ea  |$27.60 pk 100/1.9z |J&J cinnamon $ 26ea  $25.90 pk 100/1.90z  J&J Snacks No Bid No Bid No Bid
GRANOLA BARS, WHOLE GRAIN, ASSORTED,

48 INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

49 24|Granola Bar,

50 Flavor Oats & Honey $ .182ea  $26.24 pk 144/.74z  Nat Valley Chewy LowSugar Oat/Raisin $ .25ea  |$24.00 pk 96/.840z Quaker Choc chip & Oatm Rais $ 25ea $29.96 pk 120 Natue Valley No Bid No Bid

51 25| Granola Bar, ‘
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52 Flavor Lo Fat Ch Chip $ .2397ea $28.76 pk 120/.89z Nat Valley Chewy Lowsugar Choc chip__|$ .25 ea |$24.00 pk 96/.840z | Quaker choc chip $ .246ea $29.44 pk 120 | Natue Valley No Bid No Bid

53 26| Granola Bar, ‘

54 Flavor Lo Fat Variety $ .2448ea $29.38 pk 120/.89z Nat Valley Chewy Lowsugar smores $ 25ea  [$24.00 pk 96/.840z | Quaker il Mix Bar $ .389ea $49.80 pk 128 No Bid No Bid
OATMEAL BAR, WHOLE GRAIN, INDIVIDUAL

55 WRAPPED

56 27|Oatmeal Bar,

57 Flavor Butterscotch $ .267ea  $38.51pk 144ct  Betty Crocker |Butterscotch $ 28ea  |$39.70 pk 144/1.240z | Gen Mills apple $ 356ea $25.61 pk 72| Apple Way No Bid No Bid

58 28| Oatmeal Bar, ‘

59 Flavor Choc. Chip $ 267ea  $38.51pk 144ct  Betty Crocker |Choc. Chip $ 28ea  |$39.70 pk 144/1.240z |Gen Mills Pommegram $ 356 ea $25.61 pk 72|Apple Way No Bid No Bid

60 29| Oatmeal Bar, ‘

61 Flavor double ch chip $ .267ea  $38.51pk 144 ct Betty Crocker No Bid Strawberry $ 356ea $25.61 pk 72| Apple Way No Bid No Bid
OATMEAL BITES, WHOLE GRAIN, INDIVIDUAL

62 SERVING

63 30| Oatmeal Bites,

64 Flavor cinnamon $ 42lea  |$15.17 pk 36/1.24z |Nat Valley cinnamon $ 12ea  $24.75pk 210/1.10z  Sky Blue cinnamon bites $ 203 ea $21.83 pk 108 | Apple Way No Bid No Bid

65 31|Oatmeal Bites,

66 Flavor Choc. Chip $ 421ea  [$15.17 pk 36/1.24z |Nat Valley no Bid Blueberry Lemon $ .203 ea $21.83 pk 108 Apple Way No Bid No Bid
CEREAL BAR, WHOLE GRAIN, INDIVIDUAL

67 SERVING

68 32|Cereal Bar,

69 Flavor ap cinn cheerio $ 249ea  $23.92 pk 96 ct Gen Mills NutriGrain Apple/Cinn | .43ea  |$20.64 pk 48/1.30z  |Kellogg's all flavors $ 253 ea $24.21 pk 96 ct Gen Mills No Bid No Bid

70 33|Cereal Bar, ‘

71 Flavor Trix $ 249ea  $23.92 pk 96 ct Gen Mills NutriGrain Strw Yogurt  |$ .43 ea $20.64 pk 48/1.30z Kellogg's No Bid No Bid

72 34|Cereal Bar, ‘

73 Flavor Cinn Toast $ 249ea  $23.92pk 96 ct Gen Mills NutriGrain Raspberry  |$ 43 ea  |$20.64 pk 48/1.30z  |Kellogg's No Bid No Bid
MUFFIN TOPS, WHOLE GRAIN, INDIVIDUALLY

74 WRAPPED, ASSORTED

75 35| Muffin Tops,

76 Flavor Swt Pot CC $ .344ea |$16.52 pk 48/3.1z | Muffintown sw potato/choc chip $ .33ea  $15.80 pk 48/3.10z  Muffin Town No Bid No Bid No Bid

77 36| Muffin Tops, ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

78 Flavor Apple $ 344ea  |$16.52 pk 48/3.1z _|Muffintown __|apple cinn $ .33ea  $15.80pk 48/3.10z  Muffin Town No Bid No Bid No Bid

79 37| Muffin Tops, ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

80 Flavor Blueberry $ 344ea  |$16.52 pk 48/3.1z |Muffintown __|blueberry $ 33ea  $15.80 pk 48/3.10z  Muffin Town No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 MUFFIN LOAF, WHOLE GRAIN, ASSORTED, IW ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

82 38| Muffin Loaf, ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

83 Flavor Banana $ 349ea |$16.79 pk 48/3.62_|Muffintown __|banana $ .33lea  $15.90 pk 48/3.600z  Muffin Town No Bid No Bid No Bid

84 39| Muffin Loaf, ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

85 Flavor Zucchini $ 349ea [$16.79 pk 48/3.62  |Muffintown Zucchini $ 331ea  $15.90 pk 48/3.60z  Muffin Town No Bid No Bid No Bid

86 40| Muffin Loaf,

87 Flavor no Bid no Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ULTIMATE BREAKFAST ROUND (UBR), WHOLE

88 GRAIN, ASSORTED. IW

89 41| UBR, Flavor Cinnamon $ 357ea |$44.98pk 126/2.2z |Richs cinnamom $ .15ea  $36.45pk 240/1.50z  Rich's No Bid No Bid No Bid

90 42| UBR, Flavor Choc. Chip $ 357ea $44.98 pk 126/2.2z Richs Oatmeal Choc. Chip  [$ .36ea |$45.90 pk 126/2.20z |Advance Pierre No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAKFAST SANDWICH, EGG/CHEESE ON WG

91 BUN, IW

92 43| Egg/Cheese Bun $ 383ea  $38.35pk 100/2.3z  Advance $ 39ea  |$38.48 pk 100/2.40z _|Advance Pierre No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAKFAST SANDWICH,

93 EGG/VEGETABLE/CHEESE ON WG BUN. IW

94 44| Egg/Vegetable/Cheese Sandwich $ 395ea  $39.53 pk 100/2.35 Advance $ 40ea  |$39.90 pk 100/2.40z _|Advance Pierre No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAKFAST SANDWICH, EGG/CHEESE ON WG

95 ENGLISH MUFFIN, IW

96]  45|Egy/Cheese English Muffin $ 543ea  $52.13 pk 96/3.252 Bakecraft No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAKFAST SANDWICH, CHICKEN SAUSAGE ‘

97 ON WG BISCUIT. IW

98 46| Chicken Sausage Biscuit $ 408ea  $81.78 pk 200/2.15z Bakecraft $ 73ea  |$72.90 pk 100ct Tyson No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAKFAST SANDWICH, SAUSAGE ON WG ‘

9 MAPLE PANCAKE, IW
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100]  47|Sausage on Pancake $ 357ea  $14.28pk 40ct Jimmy Dean No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GLAZED PANCAKES, WHOLE GRAIN, FROZEN,

101 ASSORTED

102 48| Glazed Pancakes,

103] Flavor Blueberry $ 349ea  $27.95pk 80/3z Max Blueberry $ 35ea  |$28.00 pk 80/30z ConAgra No Bid No Bid No Bid

104] 49| Glazed Pancakes,

105| Flavor Strawberry $ 357ea |$25.73pk 72/3.172_|Pilisbury ) $34ea  $27.20pk 80/2.990z  ConAgra No Bid No Bid No Bid

106 50|Glazed Pancakes,

107] Flavor Maple $ 336 ea  $26.93pk 80/3z  ES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GLAZED FRENCH TOAST, WHOLE GRAIN,

108] FROZEN. ASSORTED

109 51|Glazed French Toast,

110} Flavor cinnamon $ 35ea $25.20 pk 72/2.64z Pillsbury $ 37ea  |$26.75pk 72/2.640z _|Gen Mills No Bid No Bid No Bid

111 52| Glazed French Toast, ‘

112| Flavor Choc. Chip $ 368ea  $26.53 pk 72/3.03z Pillsbury triple berry $ .37ea  [$26.75pk 72/2.640z | Gen Mills No Bid No Bid No Bid
GLAZED WAFFLES, WHOLE GRAIN, FROZEN,

113] ASSORTED

114] 53| Glazed Waffles,

115| Flavor Blueberry $ 351ea  $2532pk 72/2.3z  Pillsbury blueberry $ 36ea $26.10 |72/2.470z | Gen Mills No Bid No Bid No Bid

116 54| Glazed Waffles, ‘ ‘

117] Flavor Maple $ 35lea  $25.32 pk 72/2.3z  Pillsbury Maple $ 36ea $26.10 |72/2.470z _|Gen Mills No Bid No Bid No Bid

11] PANCAKES, WHOLE GRAIN, FROZEN ‘ ‘

119 55| Pancakes $ .10ea  $14.88pk 144/1.14z A $ .1lea  |$15.84pk 144/1.20z |Pinnacle No Bid No Bid No Bid

120) FRENCH TOAST, WHOLE GRAIN, FROZEN ‘ ‘ ‘

121 56| French Toast, ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

122] Flavor cinn $ .303ea  $21.88 pk 72/2.382 AJ plain $ 32ea  |$23.04 pk 72/2.550z _|Pinnacle No Bid No Bid No Bid

123 57| French Toast, ‘ ‘

124] Flavor sticks S .084ea $14.74 pk 175/.85z Al French Toast Sticks $ .09 ea $15.75 pk 175/.850z | Pinnacle No Bid No Bid No Bid

125] WAFFLES, WHOLE GRAIN, FROZEN

126 58| Waffles,

127] Flavor Original $ .1lea  [$17.11pk 144/1.39 |AJ plain $.1lea  $15.84pk 18/8ct Pinnacle No Bid No Bid No Bid

128 59| Waffles,

129) ) sticks $.175ea  $25.30pk 144/1.1z Chef America No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
APPLE FILLED BREADSTICK, WHOLE GRAIN, IW,

130) FROZEN

131 60| Apple Filled Breadstick $ 454ea  $32.69 pk 72/3.12z  Bosco $ 48ea  |$34.60 pk 72ct Bosco No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAKFAST ULTRA BREAD SLICE, WHOLE

132 GRAIN, IW, FROZEN

133] 61|Breakfast Bread,

134] Flavor Banana $ .454ea  |$31.78 pk 70/3.4z__|Superbak Banana $ 45ea $31.49 pk 70/20z Sky Blue No Bid No Bid No Bid

135 62| Breakfast Bread, ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

13¢] Flavor Zucchini $ 454ea  |$31.78 pk 70/3.4z_|Superbak chocolate $ 45ea  $31.49 pk 70/20z Sky Blue No Bid No Bid No Bid

137 63| Breakfast Bread, ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

133 Flavor pumpkin $ 454ea |$31.78 pk 70/3.42_|Superbak pumpkin $ 45ea  $31.49 pk 70/202 Sky Blue No Bid No Bid No Bid

139 64| Breakfast Bread, ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

140 Flavor berry $ 454ea  |$31.42 pk 70/3.4z  |Sky Blue Blueberry $ 45ea $31.49 pk 70/20z Sky Blue No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAD - BREAKFAST NUGGET, WHOLE GRAIN,

143 FROZEN

142 65| Breakfast Nugget $2.35 ea $23.52 pk 180/.85z State Fair No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAD - CROISSANTS, WHOLE GRAIN, PRE-

143] SLICED. FROZEN

144] 66| Croissant, pre-sliced $ 249ea  $35.96 pk 144/2.2z Hadley No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAD - CIABATTA, WHOLE GRAIN, PRE-

145| SLICED. FROZEN

146 67 |Ciabatta, pre-sliced,

147 Flavor $ 263 ea  |$31.62 pk 120/2.5z_|Wenner Iplain S 24ea 22.58 pk 96/1.80z Gen Mills No Bid No Bid No Bid
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143 68| Ciabatta, pre-sliced,

149) Flavor $ 232ea $2232pk 96/1.8z  Pillsbury No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAD - SANDWICH ROLL, MULTI GRAIN, ‘

150] FROZEN

151] 69| Sandwich Roll $ 150ea  $14.48 pk 8/12ct  Homstead $ 3lea  |$29.76 pk 8/12ct Piantedosi No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAD - GORDITA-STYLE, WHOLE GRAIN, ‘

152 FROZEN

153] 70| Gordita-Style $ 742ea  $71.28pk 96/4.3z  old el paso No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

154 BREAD - 8” WHOLE GRAIN WRAPS, ASSORTED

155] 71|Whole Grain Wraps, 8", Whole Wheat $ .09ea  [$13.01pk 12/12ct |solis whole wheat $ 08ea  $11.95pk 12/12ct Father Sam's No Bid

156} Flavor ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘ No Bid No Bid

157 72| Whole Grain Wraps, 8, ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

158} Flavor spinach $ .159ea [$19.14 pk 12/10 10" |Josephs white whole wheat $ .10ea $14.95 pk 12/12ct Father Sam's No Bid No Bid No Bid

159 73| Whole Grain Wraps, 8,

160) Flavor tomato basil $ 137ea  $16.50 pk 10/12 10" Josephs jalapeno cheddar $ 14ea  |$20.35pk 12/12ct Father Sam's No Bid No Bid No Bid

161 BREAD — SALAD CROUTONS ‘

162) 74|Salad Croutons, Plain $1.733ea  $17.33 pk 10lb sugar fds $4.49ea  |$17.95 pk 4/400z2 Marzetti No Bid No Bid No Bid

163 75| Salad Croutons, Seasoned $1.68ea  $16.85pk 4251b T Marzetti $4.48ea  |$17.90 pk 4/2.54 Sugar Foods $4.49 ea $17.96 pk 4-2.54 Flavor Fresh No Bid No Bid
BREAD — BUTTERMILK BISCUIT, WHOLE GRAIN, ‘ ‘

164] FROZEN

165]  76|Buttermilk Biscuit $ .122ea  $12.23pk 100/2.1z  Advance $ .13ea [$13.40 pk 100/2.10z _|Advance Pierre No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAD — HONEY CORN BISCUIT, WHOLE GRAIN,

166} FROZEN

167]  77|Honey Corn Biscuit $.193ea  $32.56pk 168/2.75z Richs $ .20ea  [$32.85pk 168/2.750z_|Rich's No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAD — MINI GARLIC TOAST, WHOLE GRAIN, ‘

168 FROZEN

169] 78| Mini Garlic Toast $.105ea  $21.71pk 205/.75z T Maretti $ .1lea  [$22.55pk 205ct Marzetti No Bid No Bid No Bid

170) BREAD - TORTILLA CHIPS, BULK ‘ ‘

17 79| Tortilla Chips $1.188ea $7.13pk 6/11b Solis $1.94ea  |$15.50 pk 8/160z FritoLay $2.95 ea $17.70 pk 624 No Bid No Bid

172 BREAD - TOSTADO BOWL, BULK ‘ ‘

173] 80| Tostado Bowl $ 966ea  $69.55 pk 6/12ct  Smkewood No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BREAD — OVEN FIRED FLATBREAD, WHOLE

174 GRAIN

175] 81| Oven Fired Flatbread $ .18lea  $35.45pk 192/2.2z Richs $.19ea  [$36.48 pk 192/2.20z _|Rich's No Bid No Bid No Bid

176} BREAD — MINI FLATBREAD, WHOLE GRAIN ‘ ‘

177] 82| Mini Flatbread $ 134ea  $25.90pk 1921z Richs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

178 CHEESE ‘ ‘

179]  83|American, sliced $1.9561b  39.13pk 451 GrtLakes $2.331b  [$46.50 pk 4/5t Schreiber No Bid No Bid No Bid

180] 84| Provolone $2.441b  $21.96 pk 9lb  Cortona $2.491b  [$89.64 pk 3/12# Saputo No Bid No Bid No Bid

181]  85|Swiss $2.901b  $46.40 pk 2/8lb  GrtlLakes $2.951b  [$47.20 pk 2/g#avg  |Cabot No Bid No Bid No Bid

182] 86| Italian, Grated ‘52.525 b $13.13 pk ‘1/5 Ib ‘Be"a $2461b  $49.10 pk 4/54 Cheese Merchants $3.261b $16.30 pk s# S' Anastasi No Bid No Bid

183] 87| Cheese Sauce, ltalian Style $5.57ea  |$44.56 pk ‘3/141 ‘ Foothill $5.44ea  $43.50 pk 8/3202 Nestle $8.00 ea $64.00 pk 8/32 Nestle No Bid No Bid

184] 88| String Cheese Portions $ 185ea  $17.83 pk 96/1z Bongard $ 21ea  |$20.59 pk 96/10z Saputo No Bid No Bid No Bid

89

185

186} CONDIMENTS

187] 90| Tomato Catsup, 1 0z. cups $6.59ea  $6.59 pk 100/1z  Dia Crys $ .08ea  |$8.00pk 100/10z __|Diamond Crystal $ .08lea $20.26 pk _ [250ct Red Gold No Bid No Bid

188]  91|Mustard Packet $4.25/500  $4.25 pk 500ct  American $ .03/500 |$12.95 pk 500/5.5¢  |Heinz $ .015/500 $7.08 pk 500ct Clover No Bid No Bid

189] 92| Mayonnaise Packet $14.00/500 $14.00 pk 500ct  Americana $.06/200 |$12.00 pk 200/12g  |Heinz $ .036/200 $7.17 pk 200ct Clover No Bid No Bid

190]  93|Relish Packet $5.05/200  $5.05 pk 200ct  Americana $.04/200 |$8.00 pk 200/9 Heinz $ .043/200  |$8.47 pk 200 ct Clover No Bid No Bid

191 94 Dill Pickles, 5 gal bucket

192 Sliced $18.61/5 gal| $18.61 pk 59 Regal $18.42/5gal $ 18.42 pk 5 gal Gielow $21.51/5gal 5gl Pocahontas No Bid No Bid

193] 95| Dill Pickles, 5 gal bucket ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘

194] Diced $23.34/5 gal| $23.34 pk 5gal B&G $20.89/5gal $20.89 pk 5 gal Gielow $22.89/5gal sgl Pocahontas No Bid No Bid

195 96| Dill Pickles, 5 gal bucket ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘
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196] Spears $22.70/5 gal| $22.70 pk 5gal Regal $21.19/5gal $21.19 pk 5 gal Gielow No Bid No Bid No Bid
197]  97|Hot Sauce Packet $7.45/200 |$7.45 pk 200ct  |TPete $.03/200 $5.99 pk 200/7g Diamond Crystal No Bid No Bid No Bid
193] 98| Jelly/Jam ¥z oz. cups
199] (200ct box shall have asst. flavors) $6.12/200  $6.12 pk 200ct  DiaCrys $ .06/200 |$11.65 pk 200/12g  |JM Smuckers $ .055/200 $10.97 pk 200 |Clover No Bid No Bid
200]  99|Maple Syrup Packet, 1 0z. $4.37/100  $4.37 pk 10071z American $ .20/100 |$19.85 pk 100/10z __|Heinz $ .09/100 $8.94 pk 100/ Clover No Bid No Bid
201] 100|Sweet & Sour Sauce Packet $7.99/100  $7.99 pk 001z PPI $ .14/100 |$14.24 pk 100/10z __|Heinz $.105/100 $10.49 pk 100|Kens No Bid No Bid
202]  101Taco Sauce Packet $5.56/200  $5.56 pk 200ct  BocaG $.02/500 [$11.47 pk 500/9g Heinz No Bid No Bid No Bid
203 102|Mayonnaise, low fat, gal $5.29/gal  $21.10 pk 4119 Kens $5.50/ gal [$21.98 pk 4/1gal Oasis $5.63/gal $22.52pk  [4/1 Kens No Bid No Bid
204]  103|Margarine, cups (600 ct) $17.24/600 $17.24 pk 600/5gm  Smt Balanc $ .03/600 [$19.20 pk 600/6g Promise No Bid No Bid No Bid
205] 104 Margarine $ .7171b  [$21.52 pk ‘30’1 b ‘M'dat'anﬂc $.521b  $15.60 pk 30/1# Oasis No Bid No Bid No Bid
206] 105|Salad Dressing, Fat Free, 1.50z pouch, (60 ct) ‘ ‘
207 Creamy ltalian $6.89/60  $6.89 pk 60/1.5z  Kens Lt $ .27/60  |$15.95 pk 60/1.50z  |Marzetti No Bid No Bid No Bid
208| 106 | Salad Dressing, Fat Free, 1.50z pouch, (60 ct) ‘ ‘
209 Italian $6.77/60  $6.77 pk 60/1.5z  Kens $ .12/60  |$7.29 pk 60/1.50z Marzetti $ .117/60 $6.98 pk 60ct Kens No Bid No Bid
210 107 |Salad Dressing, Fat Free, 1.50z pouch, (60 ct) ‘ ‘
211 Ranch $8.75/60  $8.75 pk 60/1.5z  Kens $ .17/60  |$9.95 pk 60/1.50z  |Marzetti $ .15/60 $8.99 pk 60ct Kens No Bid No Bid
212] 108|Salad Dressing, Fat Free, 1.50z pouch, (60 ct) ‘ ‘
213 Caesar $11.05/60 $11.05 pk 60/1.5z  Kens Lt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
214 109|Salad Dressing, Fat Free, packets, (200 ct) ‘ ‘
215 Creamy ltalian $7.67/200  $7.67 pk 200ct  DiaCryst No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
216 110|Salad Dressing, Fat Free, packets, (200 ct) ‘ ‘
217 Italian $7.06/200  $7.06 pk 200ct  PPI $.05/200 |$9.59 pk 200/12g  |Heinz No Bid No Bid No Bid
218] 111|Salad Dressing, Fat Free, packets, (200 ct) ‘ ‘
219 Ranch $7.92/200 $7.92 pk 200ct  DiaCrys $ .05/200 |$9.90 pk 200/12g Diamond Crystal No Bid No Bid No Bid
220] 112|Salad Dressing, Fat Free, ‘ ‘
221 Gallons ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘ No Bid No Bid
222 Creamy Italian $8.79/gal  $35.17 pk 4i1g Cains $ .05/gal |$9.90 pk 200/12g | Diamond Crystal No Bid
223] 113|Salad Dressing, Fat Free, No Bid No Bid
224) Gallons
225 Italian $4.715/gal |$18.86 pk 4llg Kens $4.06/gal  $16.24 pk 4/1gal Marzetti $4.85 /gal $19.42 pk 4/1 Kens No Bid No Bid
226] 114|Salad Dressing, Fat Free, ‘ ‘
227 Gallons ‘ ‘
228] Ranch $7.79/gal  |$31.16 pk 4l1g Kens $7.36 /gal  $29.45 pk 4/1gal Marzetti $8.02/gal $32.08 pk 4/1 Kens No Bid No Bid
229 115|Salad Dressing, Fat Free,
230 Gallons
231 Caesar $8.417/gal  $33.67 pk 4l1g Cains No Bid $10.39/gal $41.56 pk 4/1 Kens No Bid No Bid
232] 116|Salad Dressing, Fat Free,
233 Gallons
234] French $6.74/gal  |$26.97 pk 4l1g Cains $5.35/gal  $21.38 pk 4/1gal Marzetti No Bid No Bid No Bid
235]  117|Tomato Salsa, Chunky,
236) Gallons $7.305/gal  $29.22 pk 4/138z  Mesa Gran $8.66/gal |$34.65 pk 4/1gal DeiFratelli $9.41 /gal $37.64 pk 4/1 Pocahontas No Bid No Bid
237 118| Sweet & Sour Sauce,
23] Gallons $10.31/gal [$10.31 pk 1gal La Choy $8.13/gal  $32.50 pk 4/1gal Gold's $9.65 / gal $38.61 pk 4/1 Kens No Bid No Bid
239] 119|Soy Sauce, Low Salt,
240 Gallons $11.21/gal 11.21pk lgal La Choy $11.35/gal [$11.35 pk 1gal Lachoy $12.28 /gal $36.84pk  |6-1/2gl |Kikoman No Bid No Bid
241] 120|Spaghetti Sauce ‘ ‘
242 Gallons $3.05/gal  $18.31pk 6/#10 Furmans 4.15/ea /gal| $24.90 pk 6/10# DeiFratelli No Bid No Bid No Bid
243]  121|Spaghetti Sauce ‘ No Bid No Bid
244 Pouches ‘53.94 ea ‘sza.ss pk ‘5/1061 ‘Old Colony $3.63ea |$21.75pk 6/10# Neil Jones $2.99 ea $17.95 pk 6/109 Central Valley No Bid No Bid
245 COOKIES/CRACKERS




Miscellaneous Food Products

Date of Bid: 12/20/16

A B C o | E | | G H | [ | J | [ | L M | N | o | I Q R | s | T | I w | X | v [ z] m
1 Thurston Foods Shaheen Bros. Donahue Bros. Conlon Products Sal's Production
Pack
2 | LN# ITEM Description Unit Cost Unit Pack Cost |Pack Size |Brand Description  [Unit Cost | Unit Pack Cost |Pack Size  [Brand Description Unit Cost Unit Pack Cost|Pack Size  |Brand Description | Unit Cost | Unit Pack Cost|Pack Size  [Brand Description | Unit Cost  init Pack Co{Size |Brand
246 122|Graham Crackers, individually wrapped servings
247 Assorted Flavors $ .109ea [$16.39 pk 150/3ct | Nabisco $ 07ea  |$12.98 pk 200/.4902 $ 067 ea $1324pk  200/2ct  NBC No Bid No Bid
$ 33ea $20.31 pk 60 ct Chex Mix
123 | Cookies/Crackers — Snacks Assorted 150/.5z2  Nabisco $ 22ea $38.30 pk 175 Cheezlts
248)] $.1125ea  $18.83 pk $ 3lea $14.92 pk 48/10z Mondelez Offer rejected S 37ea $27.15 pk 72 Oreo No Bid No Bid
249I 124 Saltine Crackers, individually wrapped servings, Plain $ 03lea |$15.56 pk ‘500/2\:! ‘Nablscn $.02¢ea $9.98 pk 500/2ct WSy ‘3 028 ea ‘313‘65 pk 500/2ct ‘NBC
250 EGGS
251 125‘ Scrambled Eggs, Pre-cooked, Frozen (pound) $1411b  $42.33pk 6/5 b Papetti ‘51486 Ib ‘537‘20 pk ‘4/5# ‘Michael Foods ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘
252] 126‘ Scrambled Egg Patty, Pre-cooked, Frozen $ .130ea  $18.85 pk 14471z Papetti ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘
253 FRUIT
254]  127|Applesauce, No Sugar Added, #10 can $2.66ea  $16.01pk 6/#10  Apsnax $4.99ea  |$29.95 pk 6/10# Knouse ‘33,03 ea ‘31&19 pk ‘6/10 ‘Al\antic No Bid No Bid
255]  128|Apricots, Halved, No Sugar Added, #10 can $4.93ea  |$29.58 pk 6/#10 NE $4.79ea  |$28.75 pk 6/10# NE Mktg $4.46 ea $26.78 pk 6/10 Atlantic No Bid No Bid
256]  129|Fruit Cocktail, No Sugar Added, #10 can $4.76ea  |$28.56 pk 6/#10 NE $4.63ea  |$27.75 pk 6/10# NE Mktg $4.61ea $27.66 pk 6/10 Atlantic No Bid No Bid
257]  130|Peaches, Diced, No Sugar Added, #10 can $4.292 ea  |$25.76 pk 6/#10 NE $4.16ea  |$24.95 pk 6/10# NE Mktg $4.00 ea $24.05 pk 6/10 Atlantic No Bid No Bid
258]  131|Pears, Dices, No Sugar Added, #10 can $4.035ea  |$24.21 pk 6/#10 NE $3.98ea  |$23.90 pk 6/10# NE Mktg $3.74ea $22.48 pk 6/10 Atlantic No Bid No Bid
259]  132|Pineapple, Chunk, No Sugar Added, #10 can $4.50ea  |$27.03 pk 6/#10 NE $432ea  |$25.90 pk 6/10# NE Mktg $4.29 ea $25.75 pk 6/10 N. East No Bid No Bid
260]  133|Pineapple, Rings, No Sugar Added, #10 can $4.675ea |$28.05 pk 6/#10 NE $4.83ea  |$28.95 pk 6/10# NE Mktg $4.63 ea $27.81 pk 6/10 N. East No Bid No Bid
261]  134|Blueberries, No Sugar Added, Frozen, (pound) $1.261b  $37.83pk 301b Harvest $1.601b  [$15.98 pk 2/54 Jasper Wyman No Bid No Bid No Bid
262]  135|Strawberries, Whole, No Sugar Added, #10 can $1177ea  $35.33pk 301b Latino $1.54ea  |$15.35 pk 1/10# Jasper Wyman No Bid No Bid No Bid
263] 136| Fruit Juice 100%, 4 oz.
264) Apple $ .104ea |$10.05 pk 96/4z NC $ 10ea  $9.99 pk 96/40z Country Pure No Bid No Bid No Bid
265) 137| Fruit Juice 100%, 4 oz. ‘ ‘
266 Cranberry $ 117ea  [$11.27 pk 96/4z NC $ .17ea  $11.23pk 96/40z Country Pure No Bid No Bid No Bid
267 138| Fruit Juice 100%, 4 oz.
268] Fruit Punch $ .113ea  $10.87 pk 96/4z NC $ .1lea $10.92 pk 96/40z Country Pure No Bid No Bid No Bid
269 139| Fruit Juice 100%, 4 oz.
270 Grape $ .132ea  |$12.69 pk 96/4z NC $ 13ea $12.57 pk 96/40z Country Pure No Bid No Bid No Bid
271]  140|Fruit Juice 100%, 4 oz. ‘ ‘
272] Orange $ .1409 ea |$13.53 pk 96/4z NC S .1dea $13.51 pk 96/40z Country Pure No Bid No Bid No Bid
273] 141| Fruit Juice 100%, 6 oz.
274 Apple $ .157ea  $7.55pk 48/6z  NC $ .16ea  [$7.86pk 48/60z Country Pure No Bid No Bid No Bid
275 142| Fruit Juice 100%, 6 oz.
276 Cranberry No Bid $.18ea  $8.42pk 48/60z Country Pure No Bid No Bid No Bid
277 143| Fruit Juice 100%, 6 oz.
278)] Fruit Punch $ .162ea  $7.80 pk 48/62 NC $ 17ea $7.98 pk 48/60z Country Pure No Bid No Bid No Bid
279 144 Fruit Juice 100%, 6 oz. ‘ ‘
280 Grape $ 218ea  $10.48 pk 48/62 NC $ 22ea $10.59 pk 48/60z Country Pure No Bid No Bid No Bid
281]  145|Fruit Juice 100%, 6 oz. ‘ ‘
282 Orange $ .197ea  $9.47 pk 48/62 NC $ .20ea $9.68 pk 48/60z Country Pure No Bid No Bid No Bid
283]  146|Lemonade Base Fruit Juice, Frozen only $1.87ea  $22.44pk 12/32z NC $1.95ea  |$23.45 pk 12/320z Country Pure No Bid No Bid No Bid
284 147|100% Fruit Juice, Dessert, Frozen cup, 4 oz. ‘ ‘
285 Flavor Blue Rasp $ .260ea  $24.99 pk 96/4z J&) Straw/Pom $ .28ea $26.50 pk 96/4.40z J&J Snacks No Bid No Bid No Bid
286 148|100% Fruit Juice, Dessert, Frozen cup, 4 oz. ‘ ‘
287 Flavor Orange $ .260ea  $24.99 pk 96/4z J&) cherry $ .28ea $26.50 pk 96/4.40z J&J Snacks No Bid No Bid No Bid
288 149|100% Fruit Juice, Dessert, Frozen cup, 4 0z. ‘ ‘
289 Flavor Lime $ .260ea  $24.99 pk 96/4z J&J pineapple $ .28ea $26.50 pk 96/4.40z J&J Snacks No Bid No Bid No Bid
290 150(100% Fruit Juice, Dessert, Frozen cup, 4 0z. ‘ ‘
2914 Flavor grape $ .260ea  $24.99 pk 96/4z J&) watermelon $ .28ea $26.50 pk 96/4.40z J&J Snacks No Bid No Bid No Bid
29)) MEAT
293] 151‘Ch‘ckeﬂ Bacon, Pre-Cooked, Frozen $3.571b  $42.84 pk 400ct 124# Pierce ‘59.39 Ib ‘329.85 pk ‘3.18#avg ‘Kavem ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘
294 152‘Co‘d Cut, German Bologna 1221b _ $19.52 pk 2/8 Ib Kayem ‘51.29 b ‘318.06 pk ‘2 THavg ‘Kavem ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘
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295]  153|Cold Cut, Chicken Breast $3.941b  $55.16 pk 21# Old Neigh $4.141b  |$28.98 pk 2/7#avg | Old Neighborhood No Bid No Bid No Bid
206] 154|Cold Cut, Mortadella $1.591b  $22.26 pk 214 Kayem $1.631b  |$19.56 pk 2/6#avg Kayem No Bid No Bid No Bid
297]  155|Cold Cut, Salami, Cooked $1.701b  $23.80 pk 201# Kayem $2.391b  |$47.80 pk 1/10#avg _|Old Neighborhood No Bid No Bid No Bid
298] 156 Cold Cut, Genoa Salami $3.190b  $31.90 pk 2/5# Hormel $3.631b  |$65.34 pk 3/6#avg __|Carando No Bid No Bid No Bid
99| 157| Cold Cut, Ham, Imported $1571b  $20.44 pk 113#  Hormel $1.981b  |$47.52 pk 2/12#avg _|Polean No Bid No Bid No Bid
300] 158|Cold Cut, Turkey Breast, Roasted/Browned $2.00b  $32.00 pk 2/8tt Jennio $4.231b  [$76.14avgpk  |2/9#avg |lennieO No Bid No Bid No Bid
301 159|Cold Cut, Pastrami, Round $2.421b  $38.72pk Ala# Jennio $4.691b  |$46.90 pk 2/5#avg __|Old Neighborhood No Bid No Bid No Bid
302 160|Beef, Ground, Raw, Frozen $1.77 b $17.70 pk 10# Swift No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
303] 161 Beef, Patty, Fully Cooked, Frozen $2.6671b  $39.78 pk 144/1.952 Advance $3721b  [$111.70 pk 320/1.50z | American Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid
304] 162|Meatballs Fully Cooked, Frozen $1236lb  $12.36 pk 320/.5z  Advance $1.2751b  [$12.75 pk 320/.50z  |Advance Pierre No Bid No Bid No Bid
305]  163|Beef Teriyaki Dippers, Fully Cooked, Frozen ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ $3.421b  $59.85 pk 400/.70z  Advance Pierre No Bid No Bid No Bid
306] 164|Beef, Shaved Steak, Raw, Frozen $2.2571b  $22.58 pk 1o# Advance $2.991b  |$29.95 pk 2/s# Advance Pierre No Bid No Bid No Bid
307] 165|Beef, Meat Pie, Jamaican-Style, Frozen $ .7841b  $39.23 pk 50/5z Scotts No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
308]  166|Pepperoni, Frozen $2.041b  $51.00 pk 25¢# Tyson $2.491b  |$24.95 pk 2/54 Hormel No Bid No Bid No Bid
309 167|Egg Rolls, Frozen
310) Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
311 168|Egg Rolls, Frozen
312 Chicken $ .539ea  [$32.39 pk 60/3z Windsor $ .58ea $32.85 pk 60/30z Windsor No Bid No Bid No Bid
313] 169|Egg Rolls, Frozen
314) Vegetable $ 444ea  $57.73pk 130/3z  MINH $ 48ea  [$28.96 pk 60/30z Windsor No Bid No Bid No Bid
315 170|Egg Rolls, Frozen ‘
316 Pork $ .510ea  $30.60 pk 60/3z Windsor $ 53ea $31.65 pk 60/30z Windsor No Bid No Bid No Bid
317]  17%|Chicken Teriyaki Dippers, Fully Cooked, Frozen $1861b  $34.90 pk (RTHER (HETED $2.041b  [$35.75 pk 400/.750z | Adv Pierre No Bid No Bid No Bid
318] 172 Chicken, Artisan, Smoked, Fully Cooked, Frozen No Bid ‘ ‘ $5.59 Ib $55.90 pk 2/s#avg Hormel No Bid No Bid No Bid
319]  173|Chicken Breast Filets, Fully Cooked, Grilled, Frozen $35190b  $35.19 pk Agi ENED $4.261b  |$42.60 pk 40/407 |Brakebush No Bid No Bid No Bid
30| 174|Chicken Breast Filets, Fully Cooked, Breaded, Frozen $2.8451b  $28.46 pk 2/5# Tyson $3521b  |$35.20 pk 40/40z Brakebush No Bid No Bid No Bid
32a| 175|Chicken, Chunks, Fully Cooked, Frozen $19061b  $57.19 pk 780ct - Tyson $3.681b |$36.75 pk 108 Brakebush No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chicken, Chunks, Buffalo Glazed, Fully Cooked, .
322 178|Frozen $29071b  $58.14pk 487 FRNED $3301b  [$33.00 pk 104 Brakebush No Bid No Bid No Bid
323]  177|Chicken, Drumsticks, Raw, Frozen $2691b  [$56.50 pk ‘96’3'51 ‘Tyw" $2491b  $74.75pk 304 Tyson No Bid No Bid No Bid
324]  178|Chicken, Diced, Fully Cooked, Frozen 827716 $27.71pk i AEUED ‘53.06 b ‘330.59 pk ‘2/5# ‘Tyson No Bid No Bid No Bid
325] 179|Sausage, Sweet ltalian, Fully Cooked, Frozen $2.8961b  [$28.97 pk ‘2/5“ ‘Gema $1.991b  $19.90 pk 2/s# Kayem No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fish, Alaskan Pollock, Breaded, Fully Cooked, .
326] 189\ Erozen $24381b  $24.39 pk e kg $3.501b  |$36.10 pk 46/3.602 | High Liner No Bid No Bid No Bid
327 181|Salmon Burgers, Fully Cooked, Frozen $5.408 Ib $54.08 pk 40/4z FPI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
32g] 182|Fish, Tuna, Pouch pak $7.14ea  |$42.84 pk ‘6/432 ‘SKPJK $8.25ea  |$49.50 pk 6/430z NE Mktg $7.00 ea $42.00pk  6/43 N. East No Bid No Bid
320]  183[Pork, Riblet Style, Frozen $1.8921b  $29.58 pk 100/2.5z  Advance $1.981b  |$30.85 pk 100/2.502 | Adv Pierre No Bid No Bid No Bid
33| 184/ Turkey Sausage Link, Fully Cooked, Frozen $27941b  |$27.95 pk ‘10# ‘J'mmy Dean $2291b  $22.95 pk 160/10z  Jennie O No Bid No Bid No Bid
33|  185| Turkey Breast stick, Frozen, Iw $7.0891b  $212.67 pk 400/1.2z  Jennio $7.721b  |$231.35 pk 400/1.200z |Jennie O No Bid No Bid No Bid
33| 186 Turkey, Scramble, Fully Cooked, Frozen $20541b  $61.65 pk GO e $2.081b  |$62.35 pk 6/54 Adv Pierre No Bid No Bid No Bid
187|Non- Meat Chicken Strips, Frozen $47271b  $47.28 pk 10# Beyond Meat $4.731b  |$47.30 pk 2/5# Beyond Meat No Bid No Bid No Bid
188|Non- Meat Sesame Ginger Popper, Frozen No Bid ‘ ‘ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
189) Non-Meat Beef Crumbles, Frozen $4.5421b  $45.42 pk 20 Beond et $4.641b  |$46.40 pk 25t Beyond Meat No Bid No Bid No Bid
190|Non-Meat Italian Meatballs, Frozen $35041b  $37.15 pk 10.6# Gardenbur No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PASTA
191|Filled Mini Pasta, Whole Grain, Fully Cooked, Frozen $1.80251b  $12.62 pk 200/.56z Pede No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
192 Tortellini, Whole Grain, Fully Cooked, Frozen $1.5191b  $15.19 pk sz (Pt (el S $1.921b  |$22.98 pk /34 Carla’s No Bid No Bid No Bid

193| Pasta, Fully Cooked, Frozen ‘ ‘
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341 Ziti $1.1231b  $22.47 pk 20# Marzetti Rotini No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
342] 194|Pasta, Fully Cooked, Frozen ‘ ‘
343 Spaghetti $1.03631b  $20.73 pk 20# Marzetti $1.191b  [$23.88 pk 1/20# Marzetti No Bid No Bid No Bid
344] 195|Pasta, Fully Cooked, Frozen ‘ ‘
345, Penne $1.1231b  $22.47 pk 20# Marzetti $1.201b  [$14.35 pk 4/3# Marzetti No Bid No Bid No Bid
346] 196|Pasta, Fully Cooked, Frozen ‘
347] Fettuccini $1.371b $16.44 pk 4/34 Marzetti noodles $1.441b $28.75 pk 40/80z Marzetti No Bid No Bid No Bid
348 PIZZA
349 197| Calzones, Cheese, Whole Grain, Frozen $ 748ea  $44.88 pk 60/4.6z  Gilardi No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
350|  198|Stromboli, Meat Lovers, Whole Grain, Frozen $ 750ea  $54.66 pk 72/42z  Giorgio No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pizza, French Bread, Cheese & Garlic, Whole Grain,
351) 19 Frozen $ 659ea  $39.57 pk 504 20208 ScHwans $ .66ea |$39.65 pk 60/5.170z |Schwan's No Bid No Bid No Bid
355] 200 Cheese Sticks, Whole Grain, Frozen $ 205ea  [$39.47 pk ‘192/1'931 Gilardi $ 142ea  $54.45 pk 8/3# Rich's No Bid No Bid No Bid
201 Pizza, Cheese 16-18” Round, Whole Grain, Fresh
353 Baked No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pizza, Cheese, 16-18" Round, Whole Grain, Cryo . )
202|pac $6.712 ea ‘350.41 pk ‘6/16 ‘B'g Daddy $6.99ea |$55.98 pk 8ct Nardone No Bid No Bid $6.25ea  $37.50pk 6 Sal'sPizza
RICE
203|Rice, Brown, Whole Grain, Par Boiled \s 531b ‘313.25 pk ‘25# ‘Rice'a"d $ .48lb  $12.10pk 1/254 Producers Rice Mill $ .609 b $15.22 pk ‘zsw ‘Producer ‘Nc Bid ‘ ‘ No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘
SANDWICHES
Grilled Cheese w/Turkey Bacon, Individually
204 wrapped $ 849ea [$61.19 pk 72/4.31z | Integrated $ 85ea  $60.98 pk 72ct Integrated Food Svc No Bid No Bid No Bid
205| Sunflower Seed Butter & Jelly, Individually Wrapped S 633ea  $60.77pk 96/2.8z  Sunfl ‘S 68 ea ‘SGA 99 pk ‘96/2 80z ‘Mumn Town No Bid No Bid No Bid
SNACKS
206|100 Calorie Type, Whole Grain, Individual Serving ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘
Cheez-It Nacho.187ea  $55.94 pk 300
362 $ .163ea  $28.56 pk 175/.75z  Sunshine $ 30ea $21.82 pk 72/.740z dels Offer rejected Ranch .187ea  $55.94 pk 300 Crave-n- Rave No Bid No Bid
363] 207|100 Calorie Type, Whole Grain, Individual Serving ‘ ‘ ‘
364 Oreo $ .2985ea $21.49 pk 72/.81z  NBC $ .30ea  [$21.57pk 72/.810z dell No Bid No Bid No Bid
365] 208|100 Calorie Type, Whole Grain, Individual Serving ‘ ‘ ‘
366) Chocolate Chip Cookies $ 2985ea $21.49 pk 72/.81z  NBC $ 30ea  |$21.57 pk 72/.810z del No Bid No Bid No Bid
367] 209|100 Calorie Type, Whole Grain, Individual Serving ‘ ‘ ‘
368 Wheat Thins $ 3335ea $24.01pk 72/1.752 NBC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
369] 210|100 Calorie Type, Whole Grain, Individual Serving ‘ ‘ ‘
370 Graham Crackers $.1913ea  $13.77pk 72/1.062 NBC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
371] 211|100 Calorie Type, Whole Grain, Individual Serving ‘ ‘ ‘
372 Pretzels S 244ea  $14.69 pk 60/1z Fresh Kids No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
373] 212|100 Calorie Type, Whole Grain, Individual Serving ‘ ‘ ‘
374 Shortbread Cookie $ 2985ea $21.49 pk 72/.742  NBC $ 30ea |$21.88 pk 72/.740z  |Mondelez No Bid No Bid No Bid
SNACKS-CHIPS, PRETZELS, INDIVIDUAL
375) SFRVINGS
376] 213|Snack Chips ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘
377, Flavor Doritoes $ .2519ea $18.14pk 72ct Frito Lay Sunchips Cheddar $ .26ea  [$27.25pk 104/10z __|Fritolay No Bid No Bid No Bid
37g8] 214|Snack Chips ‘ ‘
379 Flavor Cool Ranch Doritoes $ .2519ea $18.14pk 72ct Frito Lay Sunchips Fr Onion $ .26ea  [$26.65pk 104/10z __|Fritolay No Bid No Bid No Bid
380] 215|Snack Chips ‘ ‘
381 Flavor Baked BBQ Chips $ .2519ea $15.12 pk 60ct Frito Lay Smartfood Wh Cheddar |$ .26ea  |$18.98 pk 72/.50z FritoLay No Bid No Bid No Bid
216 Snack Chips ‘ ‘
Flavor Baked Sour Cream $ .2519ea $15.12pk 60ct Frito Lay Smartfood Caramel  |$ .26ea  |$18.98 pk 72/.502 FritoLay No Bid No Bid No Bid
217|Snack Chips ‘ ‘
Flavor. Baked Original Chips $ .2519ea $15.12 pk 60ct Frito Lay Sunchips Original $ 26ea  |$27.26 pk 104/10z FritoLay No Bid No Bid No Bid
218| Pre-Packaged Snacks, Assorted, ‘ ‘ ‘
Snack/Juice ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘
Pretzel/juice $ 634ea  $19.03 pk 30ct  ESCheezits  |NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Miscellaneous Food Products Date of Bid: 12/20/16
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1 Thurston Foods Shah Bros. Donahue Bros. Conlon Products Sal's Production
Pack
2 | LN# ITEM Description Unit Cost Unit Pack Cost |Pack Size |Brand Description  [Unit Cost | Unit Pack Cost |Pack Size  [Brand Description Unit Cost Unit Pack Cost|Pack Size  |Brand Description | Unit Cost | Unit Pack Cost|Pack Size  [Brand Description | Unit Cost  init Pack Co{Size |Brand
| 389) 219| Pre-Packaged Snacks, Assorted,
390 Snack/Juice
391 Cracker/Juice $ 634ea  $19.03 pk 30ct ES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
392]  220|Pre-Packaged Snacks, Assorted, ‘
303 Snack/Juice ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘
394 Cookie/Juice $ 634ea  $19.03 pk 30ct ES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
395] 221|Pre-Packaged Snacks, Assorted, ‘
396 Snack/Juice ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘
397] Chips/Juice $ .634ea  $19.03 pk 30ct ES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
39g] 222|Premium Granola, Bulk $ .255ea  $38.25pk 150/1.25z ES $11.88ea |$47.50 pk 4/5002 Gen Mills No Bid No Bid No Bid
399) SPICES
400 223‘1“10*’0 Seasoning ‘sz.ss ea ‘32.55 pk ‘3-51 ‘ADOBO con comino $316ea  $37.90pk 12/280z  Goya No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘
| 201} 224‘Ad0b0 Seasoning No Bid ‘ ‘ con pimento $3.16ea  $37.90 pk 12/280z  Goya ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘
402 SOUPS
E VEGETABLES
405|  226)Comn, Whole Kernel, Frozen $ 68Ib  [$13.72 pk 201b Daizy $ 62lb  $12.39pk 1/204 Honor No Bid No Bid No Bid
406] 227|Green Beans, Cut Style, Frozen $ .7011b  |$14.03 pk 201b Daizy $ 581b $11.60 pk 1/20# Honor No Bid No Bid No Bid
407|  228|Green Beans, Breaded, Frozen No Bid ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘ No Bid No Bid No Bid
408] 229|Vegetables, Scandinavian Style, Frozen $.9991b  |$23.98 pk 12/2# Harvest $ 71l $17.10 pk 12/2# Honor No Bid No Bid No Bid
409] 230|Vegetables, Summer Blend, Frozen $ .9390b  $22.54 pk 12/2# Harvest ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘ No Bid No Bid No Bid
410] 231|Vegetables, Mandarin Blend, Frozen $ .7751b  $15.50 pk 20# Harvest ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘ No Bid No Bid No Bid
411]  232)Broccoli Spears, Frozen $ 7021 |$16.85 pk 12/2# __|Nonpar $ 66l $15.74pk 12/24 Honor No Bid No Bid No Bid
412]  233|Carrots, Dices, Frozen $ 5841b  |$11.68 pk 20# Daizy $ 531b $10.60 pk 1/20# Honor No Bid No Bid No Bid
413| 234 Vegetable Juice 100%, 4 oz. $ .222ea [$15.57 pk 7014z NC $.16ea  $10.98 pk 70/40z Country Pure No Bid No Bid No Bid
414]  2835|Vegetable Juice 100%, 6 oz. $ .208ea  $14.61pk 706z NC ‘s 37ea ‘314_97 pk ‘40/5_7501 ‘Cmmw Pure $ .487 ea $2337pk  |48/6 Campbells No Bid No Bid
415] 236 Vegetables, Italian Mix, Frozen \s 9481b  |$18.97 pk ‘20# ‘CHEFS $ .66l $15.95pk 12/24 Honor No Bid No Bid No Bid
416|  237|0nion Rings, Breaded, Frozen $147511b  $28.20 pk 1212 Moores [Nosia | | | No Bid No Bid No Bid
417] 238|Peas, Green, Frozen \s .82471b {$16.49 pk ‘20# ‘Daily $65b  $12.98pk 1/204 Honor No Bid No Bid No Bid
418]  239|Potatoes, Instant, Mashed, 48 oz can $544ea $32.64pk 6/6 # Simplot No Bid $6.03 ea $3623pk  |6/10 Trio No Bid No Bid
419]  240|Potatoes, Sweet, Instant, Mashed $4.335ea  $43.35pk 10/20.17  Basic Amer $4.34ea  [$43.36 pk 10/20.170z |Basic American No Bid No Bid No Bid
420| 241|Potato, Sweet, Wedges, Frozen $1.3461b  $20.20 pk 6/2.5#  Simplot $1361b  |$20.45 pk 6/2.54 McCain No Bid No Bid No Bid
421] 242|Potato, Sweet, Chunks, Frozen $1.2641b  $18.97 pk 6/2.5#  Simplot $1421b  [$21.35 pk 6/2.54 McCain No Bid No Bid No Bid
422]  243|Potato, Red Skin, Chunks, Frozen $.96731b  $29.02 pk 6/5# McCains $1.261b  [$20.10 pk 4/44 McCain No Bid No Bid No Bid
| 423} WATER
424 244‘ Spring Water, Sport Top Bottle, 23.70z \s 3l4ea ‘37.55 pk ‘24/241 ‘Sara‘oga ‘s 32ea ‘37.59 pk ‘zm ‘Crystal Geyser ‘s 30ea ‘38.46 pk ‘23/24 ‘Poland Sp $ .27ea $6.48pk 24 Poland Spring ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘
| 425 245‘ Spring Water, Bottle, 8 0z. $ .112ea  $539pk 48/8z  Nestle ‘s 19ea ‘35.25 pk ‘28/801 ‘Crystal Geyser ‘s 167 ea ‘37.98 pk 48/8 ‘Poland sp ‘s 155 ea ‘57.44 pk ‘ AS‘PoIand Spring ‘No Bid ‘ ‘ ‘
426 YOGURT
427)  246|Fruited Yogurt, Low Fat, 4 oz. ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘
428 Assorted Flavors $ 221ea  $10.63 pk 48/4z Dannon $ 25ea  |$11.96 pk 48/40z Gen Mills No Bid No Bid No Bid
a9 247 E{:\i/loerdsmgun Tubes Low Fat, 4 oz., Assorted $ 345ea  $16.56 pk 4814z Gen Mills No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
430) PAN SPRAY
E 248|Food Release, 14 oz. can ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘
432 Butter Flavor $3.377ea  $20.27 pk 6/172 ButterBud $3.44ea  |$20.65 pk 6/170z Parway Tryson No Bid No Bid No Bid
433] 249|Food Release, 14 oz. can ‘
434 Garlic Flavor $3.377ea  $20.27 pk 6/172 ButterBud $4.10ea  |$24.60 pk 6/140z Parway Tryson No Bid No Bid No Bid
435] 250|Food Release. 14 oz. can ‘
436 Olive Oil $2.017 $12.11 6/172 ___PAM $4.37 $26.20 |6/140z Parway Tryson $4.61 $27.67 |6/16 Pocahontas No Bid No Bid




