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TAWRENCE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016
1 CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP TRONEX THURSTON FOODS CONLON PRODUCTS DONAHUE BROTHERS SHAHEEN BROTHERS INTERBORO PACKAGING
- | | | | | | | | | | 4l | |
UNIT
LN ITEM UNIT PACK UNIT PACK UNIT  UNITPACK  PACK UNIT PACK UNIT  UNITPACK  PACK UNITPACK  PACK UNIT  PACK  PACK
%— ESTQTY |UNITCOST  COST  PACKSIZE|UNITCOST  COST  PACKSIZE| cosT CoST SIZE UNIT COST CoST PACK SIZE COoST CoST Size | uNIT cosT CoST SIZE COST  COST SIZE
5| 1 |Bags, Clear Food 12,500] $0.0268ea  $13.40 pk 500 N/B $.080 ea 20.12pk|  250CT $.033EA|  $33.00 pk 1000/case| $.051ea $25.94 pk 500  $0.036ea $8.90 pk| 1/250CT
6 | 2 |Bags-PaperBrown 256,969 T frac) 490 cn sozpk 2EgocT e SoTk 566/pack| $-636ea So2pk seo|  semines $757pk  4/500€F
8 | 4 [Hdsfor8ezsoupbowt 25,000 N/B N/B $-016ea  $16:83pk  1000CT|  $-0217ea  $21.70pk 1000/case| $-016ea  $16:02pk 1000]  $0.017ea SleSosl
9| 5 |Bewis10-12ezfoamwhip 50,000 N/B N/B $-02237ea  $22.37pk  1000-€F| $-02569ea  $25.69-pk 1000/case|$0-032ea $32.27 pk 1000]  $0.014ea $33.97pk  3/1M
10| 6 |BoxFake-outchicken 425,000 N/B N/B $-6136ea  $30.68pk  50€T $-159ea  $63.66-pk 400fcase| $-1708ea  $42.70pk 250| $0470e $67.90pk  400¢T
11| 7 [Cleaner, Deodorizing Spray 120 btl/cn N/B N/B $5.49ea|  $32.96pk| 6/15.52 $3.19ea  $38.28pk 12/case(200z cans) N/B $3.73 ea $22.38 pk 6/32z
12| 8 |Cleaner, Glass 240 gts. N/B N/B $2.98qt|  $17.92 pk 6/322 $1.625qt  $19.50 pk 12/qts| $1.85qt $16.72 pk 9/32 $1.95 qt $23.40pk|  12/322
13| 9 |Cleaner, Laundry Detergent w/bleach 2,000 Ibs. N/B N/B $2.18 Ib|  $39.26pk|  2/144z $ .90 Ib|  $45.00 pk 50# box N/B $0.496 Ib $39.65pk  80/2.52
14| 10 [Cleaner, Sponges w/scouring 800 N/B N/B $.4265 ea  $17.06 pk 40CT] $.555ea]  $11.10 pk 20/case] $.71ea $14.35 pk 20|  $0.638ea $12.75pk| 1/20CT
15| 11 |Cleaner, Scouring Pads (green) 1,200 N/B N/B $.159 ea $9.54 pk 60 CT| $.206 ea $4.12 pk 20/case] $.30ea $6.08 pk 20| $0.192ea $11.50 pk| 6/10CT
16| 12 |Cups, Portion Control, 40z 250,000 N/B N/B $.013%ea  $34.93pk 2500 CT $.0147ea|  $36.75 pk 2500/case| $.014 ea $35.65 pk 2500] $0.014 ea $34.35pk| 2500 CT
17| 13 |Lid for 40z portion control cup 250,000 N/B N/B $.0092eal  $23.16pk| 2500 CT| $.0109ea|  $27.25 pk 2500/case| $ .009 ea $24.67 pk 2500]  $0.009 ea $22.85pk  2500CT
18| 14 [Cups, Portion Control, 20z 125,000 N/B N/B $ .0084eal  $21.12pk| 2500CT|  $.00884ea|  $22.10 pk 2500/case| $.008 ea $21.02 pk 2500  $0.009 ea $21.58 pk|  2500CT
19| 15 |Lid for 20z portion control cup 125,000 N/B N/B $ .0075ea|  $18.80pk| 2500CT| $.00884eal  $22.10pk 2500/case| $.007 ea $18.52 pk 2500]  $0.007 ea $18.57 pk| 2500 CT
20| 16 |Cups, portion control, 1oz 125,000 N/B N/B $.00785ea  $19.64pk  2500CT|  $.00795ea| $19.875 pk 2500/case| $.008 ea $19.29 pk 2500  $0.008 ea $19.35pk| 2500 CT
21| 17 |Lid for 1oz portion control cup 125,000 N/B N/B $.00686 ea $17.15pk| 2500CT|  $.00795ea| $19.875 pk 2500/case|$ .0067 ea $16.89 pk 2500]  $0.007 ea $16.95 pk| 2500 CT
22| 18 |Cups, 70z plastic 125,000 N/B N/B $.01405ea|  $35.13pk| 2500 CT $.0159ea|  $39.75 pk 2500/case| $.013 ea $34.95 pk 2500  $0.017 ea $33.99 pk|  1960CT
23| 19 [Cups, Coffee, 8oz paper 50,000 N/B N/B $.0380ea|  $38.06 pk| 1000 CT $.029ea  $29.00 pk 1000/case| $.039 ea $39.22 pk 1000]  $0.031ea $30.65 pk| 1000 CT
24| 20 |Lids, for 8oz coffee cup 10,000 N/B N/B $.0229¢ea|  $45.95pk| 2000 CT| $.017ea  $17.00 pk 1000/case| $.034ea $34.95 pk 1000]  $0.022 ea $22.40 pk 1000 CT
25| 21 [Cups, Dessert, 9oz Clear Plastic 50,000 N/B N/B No Bid N/B $.069 ea $69.50 pk 1000]  $0.051 ea $50.65 pk 1000 CT
26| 22 |Lids, Dessert, 90z Clear Plastic 50,000 N/B N/B No Bid N/B $.035ea $88.04 pk 2500  $0.020 ea $19.95pk 1000 CT
27| 23 |Gloves, Disposable 100,000 pair| $0.02816 pr|  $28.16 pk| 1000 ea] $0.0468pr|  $2.34bx| 100gloves| $.0222pr|  $22.28pk| 1000CT|  $.03536pr|  $17.68 pk 1000/case| $.039 pr $19.60 pk 1000]  $0.017 pr $16.90 pk_10/100 CT
28| 24 |Gloves, Rubber 20 pairs N/B $0.0469 pr $2.34 bx 100 gloves $ .53pr $6.36 pk 12 pair $ .92 pr $5.52 pk dozen| $.62pr $44.41 pk 144 $0.508 pr $24.40 pk 48 CT Q
29] 2% |navyy 16,000 NS N8 Ne-Bid §-0205ea  $2050pk 1000/case| N8 $0.022ea  $22.30pk 4f250CF
30| ¢ ONVHHTE) 16,000 N/B NiB $-00355ea  $1421pk  4000CF| $-0030125ea  $12.05pk 4000/<case| $—-005ea $22.20pk 4000] $0.013en $12:88pk  4/250CF m
31| 27 [Nepkins-Dinrer(NAVY) 10,000 N/B N/B No-Bid $-04949ea  $49-49pk 1000/ease N/B $0-056-ea $49.50pk  8/425€F F
32| 28 |Napkins-Dinner (WHITE) 16,000 N/B N/ $00762ea  $22.86pk 3000CT| $-008%6ca  $26:88pk 3000/es| $-014ea $38:26-pk 2800] $0.035ea $34-65pk  8/125€T
34| 36 |PaperBeliSheets 220.000chesis N/B N/B $-0083sht  $50-38pk  6000CT| $-00741sht  $4446pk 6000/es| $-009-sht $56-79-pk 6000] so.008sht $45.90pk 12/500CF
36| 32 [Plates; Foam 62 16,600 N/B NB $-02507ea  $25.07pk  3000-CF $-0261ea  $2630pk 1600fes| $-018ea $18-79-pk 3000| $6-611ea $31-49pk  HIM
37| 33 |Plates; Foam 9> 50,000 N/B N/B $-0473ea $23.65pk  500CT| $-04072ea $20:36-pk 500/es| $-035ea $17:59-pk 500] $0.033ea $16:66-pk 500CT q
38| 34 [Fablecovers;Round(NAVYY) 489 N/B N/B No-Bid N/B $161ea $19.32 pk 12 NA I l I
39| 35 |Fable-Covers-Roune-(WHITE) 4890 N/B N/B Ne-Bid $150ea  $18:00pk 12/es| $161ea $19:32ple 12| $1.994ea $49-85-ple 25€F
40] 36 542 - 489) [ N/B No-Bid $139ea  $3475pk 35/es] $1.07ea 81293 pk 12| $183dea $45-85pk 256F m
41| 37 - = 480 N/B N8 S+28ea  53204pk  25€F $163ea  $638pk 6/pk| $1:67ea  $12.53pk 22| $3586en $39:65pk 25€F
42| 38 [FableSkirting,Plastic{NAV-Y) 249 N/B N/B No-Bid N/B $2.94ea $35.28 pk 12 NA
43| 39 |FableSkirting—Plastic (WHITE) 480 N/B N/B Ne-Bid N/B $2:94ea $3528-pk 32| $9794ea  $HFSIpk  HA2EF
44| 40 |Towels, Disposable (Zapper-type) 5,625 N/B N/B $.8971ea|  $40.37 pk 45CT N/B $.576 ea $25.95 pk 45]  $0.258ea $38.75pk  150CT
45| 4% [Fray-Food b 26,600 N/B N/B $-01903ea  $19:03pk  1000-€T]  $-01695ea  $16.95pk soogfer] sopmien  somopy 1000]  $0-0618ea $18:49pk 1AM
46 2 {BLACK) 256,000 N/B N/B Ne-Bid $-0158ea $39-50-pk 2500/€s N/B $0-011ea $28-50pk  2500€T
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47| 43 |Fray-S-compartFeam 3,250,000 N/B N/B $-0398ea  $19.93pk  500CT $-034ea  $17.00pk 500/es| $-042ea $21.02 pk 500] $0.038ea $18.90pk 4/125CF
48| 44 |Fray-S-compart-Paper 3,250,000 N/B N/B Ne-Bid $.087ea  $43:50pk 506/es| $-689ea $35.85pk 400| $0-670ea $33.90pk  480CF
49| 45 [Fray;3-compartFoilbwiid 20,000 N/B N/B No-Bid $176ea  $44.00pk 250/es| $-072ea $36-23 pk 500 $0-190ea $4755pk  250CF
50 = cover, Plastic 40,000/ N/B N/B $:1215ea $30-39pk  250CT $-1494-ea $29.88 pk 200/es| $-128ea $32.19 pk 250] $0-120ea $29.93 pk 250CF
51| 47 [Ytensil-SperkiKits 3,000,000| $0.0229ea  $2290pk  1000ea N/B $-0166ea  $1665pk  1000CT $0132ea  $1320pk 1000/es| $-014ea $14-30-pk 1000| $0.014ea $1435pk  1000CF
52| 48 |UtensilFork 50,000| $0.01ea  $9.99pk  1000-ea N/B $-00625ea  $6:25pk  1000CT|  $-00588ea  $588pk 1000/cs| $-006-ea $6:70-pk 1000]  $0-007-ea Lo52pk 4
53] 49 |nna ’ 300,000 [ P Somaates  saioct agoscy|  £ocooooes  conok 2oeafe| sores  coonnpr acog| conmnes soocTol b
54| 50 |UtensilKnife 50,000| $0.01ea  $9.99pk  1000-ea N/B $.00625ea  $6:25pk  1000CT|  $-00588ea  $5:88pk 1000/cs| $-006-ea $6:70-pk 1000]  $0-007-ea Lo55pk 4
55) 5% | e ’ 200,000 [ P e e e R 2oeafe| eores  cooonpr acog| conmnes soocTol b
56| 52 |Yiensit—TFeaspoon 50,000] $0.0%ea  $9.99pk  1000-ea N/B £.85025 e $6-25pk  1000CF|  $-00583ea $5-88-pk 1000/cs| $-006-ea $6-70-pk 1000]  $0.007ea $6:55pk 1AM
57 = wrapped 456,660 N/B N/B $:63135ea $31-35pk  1000-€F $-00989-ea $9-89-pk 1000/es| $-61ea $10:84-pk 1000| $6:61tea $30:67-pk M
58| 54 s Foil; = 75+rolls N/B N/B $19.00+ $19.00-pk 1roll $23.20+¢  $23.20pk roll| $14-72+ $14.72 pk 500" $13.95+ $13.95-pk 1rolt
59| 55 s Foil; - 75velis] 2882+ $2882pk TRt N/B $314:46+  $14-46pk 1-.=eu| $23:00+  $23.00pk rol| $2242+ $22.42 pk 500  $20.93+ $20:93-pk Trolt
60| S6 g = F5-rols) N/B e soc7 socr sl ot fooey  sososk eoll] gomasd  smaepr 2e0e £oe $540pk  drel
61| 57 5 = 75-rolls| N/B N/B $12.92¢  $12.92pk 1rolt $11.99+¢  $11.99pk rolt| $18.91+ $18.91pk 2000 $1340+# $13-40-pk 1rolt
62| 58 [Wrap-Sandwich-Wraps 15,000 N/B N/B $.06614ea  $16537pk 2500€F $03ea $79.65-pk 2500| $0.036ea $7250pk  2000CF

63

o |

64

ALL ITEMS HIGHLIGHTED IN GREEN WITH STRIKETHROUGHS HAVE BEEN REJECTED. A NEW CALL FOR BIDS IS AVAILABLE ON JANUARY 14, 2016 AND IS DUE ON FEBRUARY 1, 2016.
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