
Paper, Plastic and Cleaning Products

Lawrence Public Schools

Bid Date: 11/1/18
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1 Bags, Clear Food 12,500 $.0559  ea $27.95  pk 500 No Bid No Bid $  .033 ea $16.50 pk 500/cs $   .10 ea $25.00 pk 250

2 Bags, Crystal Clear 100,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Bags, Paper, Brown 150,000 $  .0199  ea $9.95  pk 500 $  .02 ea $8.17 pk 500 ct $  .0172 ea $8.60 pk 500/pk $  .0239  ea $11.95  pk 500

4 Bowls, Soup, 8oz, w/Lids 25,000 $  .0590 ea $58.95  pk 1000 $  .06 ea $59.53 pk 1000 ct $  .0573 ea $57.30 pk 1000/cs No Bid No Bid

5 Bowls, 10-12 oz. foam w/lip 50,000 $  .0269  ea $26.88  pk 1000 $  .06 ea $61.05 pk 1000 $  .0339 ea $33.90 pk 1000/cs No Bid No Bid

6 Box, Take-out chicken 125,000 $  .1772  ea $70.88  pk 250 $  .018 ea $47.19 pk 250 $  .167 ea $41.75 pk 250/cs $  .20208 ea $50.52 pk 250

7 Cleaner, Disinfectant/Deodorizing Spray 120 btl/cn $4.6583 ea $27.95  pk 12/32z No Bid No Bid $  3.00 ea $36.00 pk 12/15.5oz cans $2.97 ea $35.64 pk 12

8 Cleaner, Glass 240 qts. $27.775  qt $55.55 pk 2/1 Gal $2.25 qt $13.54 pk 6/32 $1.98 qt $23.76 pk 12/cs $2.30 qt $27.60 pk 12

9 Cleaner, Laundry Detergent w/bleach 2,000 lbs. $  .5118  lb $40.95  pk 80/2.5oz $  .75 lb $26.54 pk 35# $  .37  per pk $37.00 pk 1000/1.8oz/cs No Bid No Bid

10 Cleaner, Sponges w/scouring 800 $  .5987 ea $23.95  pk 1/40ct $  .75 ea $15.17 pk 20 ct $  .59 ea $11.80 pk 20/cs $  .63525 ea $25.41  pk 40

11 Cleaner, Scouring Pads (green) 1,200 $  .2487 ea $9.95  pk 40/cs $  .30 ea $6.14 pk 20 ct $  .28 ea $5.60 pk 20/cs $  .254 ea $15.24 pk 60

12 Cups, Portion Control, 4oz, w/Lid 250,000 $  .0231  ea $57.95 pk 2500 $  .02 ea $52.89 pk 2500 $  .0227 ea $56.75 pk 2500/cs $  .027764 ea $69.41 pk 2500

13 Cups, 5oz plastic 10,000 $  .0122 ea $30.38 pk 2500 $  .01 ea $30.94 pk 2500 $  .0106 ea $26.50 pk 2500/cs $  .014996 ea $37.49 pk 2500

14 Cups, 7oz plastic 5,000 $  .0156  ea $38.95  pk 2500 $  .01 ea $38.87 pk 2500 $  .0127 ea $15.24 pk 1200/cs $  .017192 ea $42.98  pk 2500

15 Cups, Coffee, 8oz paper, w/Lids 25,000 $.0488 ea $48.85 pk 1000 $  .07 ea $73.82 pk 1000 $  .049 ea $49.00 pk 1000/cs $ .05294 ea $52.94 pk 1000

16 Cups, Dessert, 9oz Clear Plastic, w/Dome Lid 25,000 $  .0605  ea $60.45  pk 1000 $  .06 ea $60.32 pk 1000 $   .074 ea $74.00 pk 1000/cs No Bid No Bid

17 Cups, 3 Piece Grab N Go Kits 10,000 $  .0466 ea $69.85  pk 1500 $  .11 ea $110.95 pk 1000 $  .149 ea $149.00 pk 1000 No Bid No Bid

18 Gloves, Disposable 100,000 pair

small -  .0099  pr                      

Med - .0099 pr                    

Large - .0231 pr                    

Xlarge - .0231 pr

small - 9.95  pk                      

Med - .9.95 pk                    

Large - 23.10 pk                    

Xlarge - 23.10 pk 1000/each $  .04 pr $20.63 pk 10/100 $   .0188 pr $18.80 pk

10/100's =       

1000/cs   $   .03822 pr $19.11 pk 1000

19 Gloves, Rubber 20 pair

small -  .4125 pr                      

Med - .4708 pr                    

Large - .5625 pr                    

small -  4.95 pk                      

Med -  5.65 pk                    

Large - 6.75 pk                    12/pk $2.46 pr $59.20 pk 48 ct $  .59 pr $7.08 pk 12/pk $  .3858333 pr $4.63 pk 12 pr

BID REJECTED
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20 Napkins, Cocktail/Beverage (NAVY) 10,000 $  .0330 ea $32.95  pk 1000 $  .02 ea $25.77 pk 1000 $  .0265 ea $26.50 pk 1000/cs No Bid No Bid

20a Napkins, Cocktail/Beverage (WHITE) 10,000 $  .0033 ea $13.45  pk 4000 $  .006 ea $22.59 pk 4000 $  .0125 ea $37.50 pk 3000/cs No Bid No Bid

21 Napkins, Dinner (NAVY) 10,000 $  .0659  ea $65.85  pk 1000 $  .06 ea $59.95 pk 1000 $  .0592 ea $59.20 pk 1000/cs No Bid No Bid

21a Napkins, Dinner (WHITE) 10,000 $  .0289  ea $28.95  pk 1000 $  .015 ea $39.54 pk 2800 $  .0099 ea $29.70 pk 3000/cs No Bid No Bid

22 Napkins, Disp. Mega Cartridge 2,000,000 No Bid No Bid $  .008 ea $43.99 pk 6000 $   .0052 ea $41.60 pk 8000/cs No Bid No Bid

23 Paper, Deli Sheets 120,000 sheets$  .0099  sht $59.85  pk 6000 $  .01 sht $58.44 pk 6000 $ .0085 sht $51.00 pk 6000/cs $  .00828 sht $49.68 pk 6000

24 Paper, Pan Liners 50,000 liner $  .0398  Inr $39.85 pk 1000 $  .03 Inr     $31.95 pk 1000 $  .0315 Inr $31.50 pk 1000/cs $   .03425 Inr $34.25 pk 1000

25 Plates, Foam 6” 10,000 $  .0125 ea $12.52  pk 1000 $   .01 ea $12.75 pk 1000 $  .033 ea $33.00 pk 1000/cs No Bid No Bid

26 Plates, Foam 9” 50,000 $  .0399 ea $19.95 pk 500 $  .06 ea $29.30 pk 500 $  .047 ea $23.50 pk 500/cs No Bid No Bid

27 Table covers, Round (NAVY) 480 No Bid No Bid $2.62 ea $31.43 pk 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

27a Table Covers, Round (WHITE) 480 $1.86 ea $46.65  pk 25 $2.62 ea $31.43 pk 12 $1.878 ea $46.95 pk 25/cs No Bid No Bid

28 Table covers 54” x 108” (NAVY) 480 $2.626 ea $65.65 pk 25 $2.84 ea $34.10 pk 12 $1.68 ea $42.00 pk 25/cs No Bid No Bid

28a Table covers 54” x 108” (WHITE) 480 $1.47 ea $36.75 pk 25 $2.84 ea $34.10 pk 12 $1.10 ea $11.00 pk 10/pk No Bid No Bid

29 Table Skirting, Plastic (NAVY) 240 No Bid No Bid $4.01 ea $48.13 pk 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29a Table Skirting, Plastic (WHITE) 480 No Bid No Bid $4.01 ea $48.13 pk 12 $3.20 ea $19.20 pk 6/pk No Bid No Bid

30 Towels, Disposable (Zapper-type) 5,625 $  .2757 ea $41.39 pk 150 $  .51 ea $23.13 pk 45 $  .285 ea $71.25 pk 250/cs No Bid No Bid

31 Tray, Food, 2lb size. 10,000 $  .0243  ea $24.35  pk 1000 $  .028 ea $27.28 pk 1000 $  .01999 ea $19.99 pk 1000/cs $  .02462 ea $24.62 pk 1000

31a Tray, Food, 5lb size. 10,000 $ .0487 ea $24.35 pk 500 $  .058 ea $28.55 pk 500 $  .032 ea $16.00 pk 500/cs $   .05334 ea $26.67 pk 500

32 Tray, 6oz Portion Tray, Plastic (BLACK) 25,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33 Tray, 5-compart, Foam 3,250,000 $  .4350   ea $21.75  pk 50 No Bid No Bid $  .03462 ea $17.31 pk 500/cs No Bid No Bid
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34 Tray, 3-compart, Foil w/lid 20,000 $  .3117  ea $62.35  pk 200 $  .28  ea $56.92 pk 200 $  .168 ea $42.00 pk 250/cs No Bid No Bid

35 Tray, Single-compart w/hinged cover, Plastic 40,000 $  .1733  ea $43.33  pk 250 $  .177 ea $44.27 pk 250 ct $  .1576 ea $31.52 pk 200/cs No Bid No Bid

36 Tray, Two-compart w/hinged cover, Plastic 20,000 $   .1389 ea $34.73  pk 250 No Bid No Bid $  .1576 ea $31.52 pk 200/cs No Bid No Bid

36a Tray, Three-compart w/hinged cover, Plastic 20,000 $  .0657 ea $16.43 pk 250 No Bid No Bid $  .1576 ea $31.52 pk 200/cs No Bid No Bid

37 Utensil, Spork Kits 3,000,000 $  .0210  ea $20.95  pk 1000 $  .015 ea $15.37 pk 1000 $   .013 ea $13.00 pk 1000/cs No Bid No Bid

38 Utensil, Fork, IW 50,000 $  .0129  ea $12.95 pk 1000 $  .012 ea $11.79 pk 1000 $   .0105 ea $10.50 pk 1000/cs No Bid No Bid

39 Utensil, Knife, IW 50,000 $  .0129  ea $12.95  pk 1000 $  .012 ea $11.79 pk 1000 $   .0105 ea $10.50 pk 1000/cs No Bid No Bid

40 Utensil, Teaspoon, IW 50,000 $  .0129  ea $12.95  pk 1000 $  .012 ea $11.79 pk 1000 $   .0105 ea $10.50 pk 1000/cs No Bid No Bid

41 Wrap, Foil, Heavy Duty 12” 75 rolls $21.65  rl $21.65 pk 1/each $17.69 rl $17.69 pk 500' $27.90 rl $27.90 pk 1000' roll $23.23 rl $23.23 pk 1 roll

41a Wrap, Foil, Heavy Duty 18” 75 rolls $31.45  rl $31.45  pk 1/each $22.71 rl $22.71 pk 500' $20.00 rl $20.00 pk 500' roll $25.17 rl $25.17 pk 1 roll

42 Wrap, Poly 12” 75 rolls $10.35  rl $10.35  pk 1/each $15.36 rl $15.36 pk 2000' $9.68 rl $9.68 pk 2000' roll $10.54 rl $10.54 pk 1 roll

42a Wrap, Poly 18” 75 rolls $14.93  rl $14.93  pk 1/each $24.70 rl $24.70 pk 2000' $13.98 rl $13.98 pk 2000' roll $15.73 rl $15.73 pk 1 roll

43 Wrap, Sandwich Wraps 15,000 $  .0516  ea $129.00  pk 2500 $   .03 ea $77.97 pk 2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid


