Lawrence Public Schools

Textbooks and Novels

7/11/18

Superior Text Textbook Warehouse A to Z Books Houghton Mifflin Follett School Barnes & Noble
LINE TITLE PUBLISHER ISBN # Qry | uniTPRICE| EXTENDED [ yniTpRice| EXTENDED | yniTpRICE | EXTENDED | uniT pRICE | EXTENDED fyniT prICE| EXTEND JUNIT PRICE| EXTEND
1 |One Hundred Years of Solitude Harper Perennial Modern Classics 9780061120091] 90 $10.22 $919.80 $18.99| $1,709.10 $9.79 $881.10 NO BID
2 |Dubliners Norton Critical Edition 9780393978513 100 $17.85] $1,785.00 $17.50| $1,750.00 $17.17] $1,717.00 NO BID REJECTED BID REJECTED BID
3 |Wuthering Heights Norton Critical Edition 9780393978896 100 $17.85] $1,785.00 $16.80| $1,680.00 $17.17] $1,717.00 NO BID
4 |invisible Man Vintage Books 9780679732761| 100 $9.28 $928.00 $9.23 $923.00 $9.16 $916.00 NO BID
5 |Rosencrantz and Guildenstern Grove Press 9780802126214| 100 $7.65 $765.00 $9.10 $910.00 $10.44] $1,044.00 NO BID
6 |Frankenstein Norton Critical Edition 9780393927931] 50 $17.26 $863.00 $16.63 $831.50 $16.60 $830.00 NO BID
7 |The Great Gatsby Scribner Edition 9780743273565| 100 $9.36 $936.00 $9.84 $984.00 $9.73 $973.00 NO BID
8 |Entreculturas 1 Wayside Publishing 9781942400523] 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 |Entreculturas 1 Teacher's Edition Wayside Publishing 9781942400479 1 $41.56 $41.56 $56.00 $56.00 $55.74 $55.74 NO BID
10 |Entreculturas 2 Wayside Publishing 9781942400615] 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 |Entreculturas 2 Teacher's Edition Wayside Publishing 9781942400561 1 $41.56 $41.56 $55.90 $55.90 $55.74 $55.74 NO BID
12 |Entreculturas 3 Wayside Publishing 9781942400707) 75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 |Entreculturas 3 Teacher's Edition Wayside Publishing 9781942400653] 1 $41.56 $41.56 $55.92 $55.92 $55.74 $55.74 NO BID
*14 |Avancemos 2 Student Edition Houghton Mifflin Harcourt 9780547871936] 40 $64.85] $2,594.00 $60.44| $2,417.60 $90.99] $3,639.60 $96.35| $3,854.00
*15 |Avancemos 2 Teacher Edition Houghton Mifflin Harcourt 9780547871967 1 $42.95 $42.95 $52.30 $52.30 $120.06 $120.06 $126.60| $126.60
16 |Avancemos 2 Resource Box Houghton Mifflin Harcourt 9780547935218 1 $126.03 $126.03 $175.45 $175.45 $238.05 $238.05 $225.05| $225.05
17 |El Alquimista Harper Collins 9780062511409] 35 $7.20 $252.00 $8.64 $302.40 $7.73 $270.55 NO BID
18 |Esperanza TPRS Publishing 9781935575290] 75 $5.95 $446.25 $6.65 $498.75 $5.72 $429.00 NO BID
19 |Felipe Alou TPRS Publishing 9781935575658 75 $5.95 $446.25 $6.65 $498.75 $5.72 $429.00 NO BID
20 |Guerra Sucia TPRS Publishing 9781934958056 75 $5.95 $446.25 $6.65 $498.75 $5.72 $429.00 NO BID
21 |La Hija Del Sastre TPRS Publishing 9781935575610] 75 $5.95 $446.25 $6.65 $498.75 $5.72 $429.00 NO BID
22 |Como Agua Para Chocolate Vintage Espanol 9780385721233] 75 $9.28 $696.00 $9.20 $690.00 $9.16 $687.00 NO BID
23 |Tejidos Wayside Publishing 9781942400332 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 |Triangulo Aprobado Wayside Publishing 9781938026638] 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 |Azulejo Wayside Publishing 9781942400318] 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
26 |Azulejo Teacher's Edition Wayside Publishing 9781938026249 1 $41.56 $41.56 $55.97 $55.97 $55.74 $55.74 NO BID
27 |La Casa de Bernarda Alba CreateSpace Independent 9781500218881| 35 $7.21 $252.35 NO BID $5.67 $198.45 NO BID
28 \E’\)/(:;Ld History: Preparing for the AP 1\ o 9781531116958| 25 $22.55|  $563.75|  $22.15|  $553.75 s21.69]  $542.25] nNoBID
29 ::::?:‘Sf Statistics for the AP W.H.Freeman 9781464108730| 50 $164.95| $8247.50| $169.28| $8,464.00]  $165.60| $8,280.00 NOBID
30 |Practice of Statistics for the AP W.H.Freeman 9781464154010| 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ $
Exam (TE)
The Constitutional Convention of
*31 |1787: Constructing the American W.W. Norton and Co. 9780393640908] 25 $33.32 $833.00 NO BID $32.05 $801.25 NO BID
Republic (Reacting to the Past)
GRAI\‘ID TOTAL BID PRICE | $23,540.62 | $23,661.89 | $24,794.27 $4,205.65
Expected Delivery Time following receipt of purchase order: 15 business days ARO 5-7 business Days 14-21 days ARO 30 days
Est. Delivery Date 8/1/2018 within 2 weeks 7/31/2018 8/21/2018




