
SECTION 1 - COPPER

Item Description Qty Units

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price

Year 3 
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Year 1 
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2” K-Type copper (20’ lengths) 10 Each  $     149.22  $     149.22  $     149.22  $                4,476.60  $  $  $  NO BID  $  $  $  NO BID 

1” K-Type copper (60’ lengths) 150 Each  $     303.38  $     303.38  $     303.38  $            136,521.00  $  $  $  NO BID  $  $  $  NO BID 

SECTION 1 TOTAL BID PRICE 140,997.60$       NO BID NO BID

SECTION 2 - BRASS

Item Description Qty Units

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price

Year 3 

Bid Price Total Price

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price

Year 3 

Bid Price Total Price

Year 1 Bid 

Price

Year 2 Bid 

Price

Year 3 Bid 

Price Total Price

Year 1 

Bid 

Price

Year 2 

Bid 

Price

Year 3 

Bid 

Price Total Price

Year 1 Bid 

Price

Year 2 Bid 

Price

Year 3 Bid 

Price Total Price

1” female iron pipe x 1” compression adapters 100 Each  $       24.57  $       24.57  $       24.57  $                7,371.00  $    18.65  $    19.96  $    21.36  $                5,997.00  $         20.58  $           20.58  $          21.82  $                6,298.00 

1” male iron pipe x 1” compression adapters 100 Each  $       18.94  $       18.94  $       18.94  $                5,682.00  $    15.48  $    16.56  $    17.72  $                4,976.00  $         17.08  $           17.08  $          18.11  $                5,227.00 

Watts 3/4“ ball valve FXF with brass handle or equal 150 Each  $       11.56  $       11.56  $       11.56  $                5,202.00  $    30.68  $    33.14  $    35.79  $              14,941.00  $         53.76  $           53.76  $          57.00  $              24,678.00 

Watts 1” ball valve FXF with brass handle or equal 150 Each  $       15.74  $       15.74  $       15.74  $                7,083.00  $    38.64  $    41.73  $    45.07  $              18,816.00  $         81.20  $           81.20  $          86.10  $              37,275.00 

¾” three-part union compression comparable to 

Macdonald Mac-Pak 4758 series 75 Each  $       19.26  $       19.56  $       19.56  $                4,401.00  $    15.92  $    17.04  $    18.23  $                3,839.25  $         19.09  $           19.09  $          20.24  $                4,381.50 

1” three-part union compression comparable to 

Macdonald Mac-Pak 4758 series 150 Each  $       21.34  $       21.34  $       21.34  $                9,603.00  $    18.21  $    19.49  $    20.85  $                8,782.50  $         20.09  $           20.09  $          21.30  $                9,322.00 

1 1/2” three-part union compression comparable to 

Macdonald Mac-Pak 4758 series 5 Each  $       75.23  $       75.23  $       75.23  $                1,128.45  $    60.93  $    65.20  $    69.76  $                    979.45  $         67.23  $           67.23  $          71.28  $                1,028.70 

1 ½ “x 2” three part unions compression comparable to 

Macdonald Mac-Pak 4758 series 15 Each  $       91.31  $       91.31  $       91.31  $                4,108.95  $    66.39  $    71.04  $    76.01  $                3,201.60  $         67.57  $           67.57  $          71.64  $                3,101.70 

¾“x 1” three part unions compression comparable to 

Macdonald Mac-Pak 4758 series 50 Each  $       21.58  $       21.58  $       21.58  $                3,237.00  $    18.50  $    19.79  $    21.18  $                2,973.50  $         20.41  $           20.41  $          21.64  $                3,123.00 

2” three-part union compression comparable to 

Macdonald Mac-Pak 4758 series 20 Each  $     101.60  $     101.60  $     101.60  $                6,096.00  $    82.26  $    88.01  $    94.17  $                5,288.80  $         90.75  $           90.75  $          96.22  $                5,554.40 

Bushings 3/4” x 1” brass 150 Each  $         2.31  $         2.31  $         2.31  $                1,039.50  $    17.44  $    18.66  $    19.96  $                8,409.00  $           8.56  $             8.56  $            9.98  $                4,050.00 

Corporations 1” compression 50 Each  $       81.39  $       81.39  $       81.39  $              12,208.50  $    55.48  $    59.36  $    63.51  $                8,917.50  $         59.84  $           59.84  $          64.89  $                9,228.50 

Corporations 3/4” compression 50 Each  $       50.62  $       50.62  $       50.62  $                7,593.00  $    42.18  $    45.13  $    48.29  $                6,780.00  $         45.50  $           45.50  $          49.34  $                7,017.00 

Corporations 2” compression 10 Each  $     248.51  $     248.51  $     248.51  $                7,455.30  $  205.62  $  220.01  $  235.41  $                6,610.40  $       221.81  $         221.81  $        240.52  $                6,841.40 

Corporations 1 ½” compression 10 Each  $     154.85  $     154.85  $     154.85  $                4,645.50  $  124.31  $  133.01  $  142.32  $                3,996.40  $       134.10  $         134.10  $        145.41  $                4,136.10 

1” Straight meter coupling 25 Each  $         7.17  $         7.17  $         7.17  $                    537.75  $    13.07  $    13.99  $    14.96  $                1,050.50  $         14.10  $           14.10  $          15.29  $                1,087.25 

3/4” Straight meter coupling 300 Each  $         5.33  $         5.33  $         5.33  $                4,797.00  $      8.49  $      9.08  $      9.72  $                8,187.00  $           9.16  $             9.16  $            9.93  $                8,475.00 

5/8” Straight meter coupling 100 Each  $         4.26  $         4.26  $         4.26  $                1,278.00  $      7.47  $      7.99  $      8.55  $                2,401.00  $           8.06  $             8.06  $            8.73  $                2,485.00 

SECTION 2 TOTAL BID PRICE 93,466.95$         116,147.40$       143,209.55$       

    SECTION 3 – MAIN VALVES AND BOXES

Item Description Qty Units

Year 1 
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Valve Boxes 5 ¼”complete w/cover 150 Each  $       73.08  $       73.08  $       73.08  $              32,886.00  $  $  $  NO BID  $         87.69  $           87.69  $          87.69  $              39,460.50 

Valve Boxes complete 26/36 w/cover 12 Each  $       73.08  $       73.08  $       73.08  $                2,630.88  $  $  $  NO BID  $         87.69  $           87.69  $          87.69  $                3,156.84 

Valve Box extension 5 ¼” – 12” length 75 Each  $       19.24  $       19.24  $       19.24  $                4,329.00  $  $  $  NO BID  $         25.00  $           25.00  $          25.00  $                5,625.00 

Valve Box cover 5 ¼” 75 Each  $       10.45  $       10.45  $       10.45  $                2,351.25  $  $  $  NO BID  $         14.82  $           14.82  $          14.82  $                3,334.50 

1” Risers 100 Each  $         5.77  $         5.77  $         5.77  $                1,731.00  $  $  $  NO BID  $           9.00  $             9.00  $            9.00  $                2,700.00 

1 1/2” Risers 100 Each  $         7.70  $         7.70  $         7.70  $                2,310.00  $  $  $  NO BID  $         12.00  $           12.00  $          12.00  $                3,600.00 

 Non-Responsive 

 Non-Responsive 

 Non-Responsive 

 Non-Responsive 

 Non-Responsive 

Everett J Prescott Ferguson Waterworks FW Webb Stiles Company, Inc Ti Sales

 Non-Responsive 



2” Risers 100 Each  $         9.62  $         9.62  $         9.62  $                2,886.00  $  $  $  NO BID  $         12.50  $           12.50  $          12.50  $                3,750.00 

Pioneer Valve Box Covers 150 Each  $         8.85  $         8.85  $         8.85  $                3,982.50  $  $  $  NO BID  $         12.55  $           12.55  $          12.55  $                5,647.50 

Gate Valves American or equal (open right) 4” w/ 

accessories, w/ restraint accessories 15 Each  $     471.86  $     471.86  $     471.86  $              21,233.70  $  $  $  NO BID  $       438.01  $         438.01  $        438.01  $              19,710.45 

Gate Valves American or equal (open right) 6” 

w/accessories, w/ restraint accessories 75 Each  $     598.01  $     598.01  $     598.01  $            134,552.25  $  $  $  NO BID  $       555.87  $         555.87  $        555.87  $            125,070.75 

Gate Valves American or equal (open right) 8” w/ 

accessories, w/ restraint accessories 75 Each  $     934.14  $     934.14  $     934.14  $            210,181.50  $  $  $  NO BID  $       882.05  $         882.05  $        882.05  $            198,461.25 

Gate Valves American or equal (open right) 10” w/ 

accessories, w/ restraint accessories 15 Each  $ 1,443.13  $ 1,443.13  $ 1,443.13  $              64,940.85  $  $  $  NO BID  $   1,370.47  $     1,370.47  $    1,370.47  $              61,671.15 

Gate Valves American or equal (open right) 12” w/ 

accessories, w/ restraint accessories 15 Each  $ 1,835.84  $ 1,835.84  $ 1,835.84  $              82,612.80  $  $  $  NO BID  $   1,750.75  $     1,750.75  $    1,750.75  $              78,783.75 

Gate Valves American or equal (open right) 16” w/ 

accessories, w/ restraint accessories (bevel gearing) 6 Each  $ 5,868.71  $ 5,868.71  $ 5,868.71  $            105,636.78  $  $  $  NO BID  $   6,189.85  $     6,189.85  $    6,189.85  $            111,417.30 

SECTION 3 TOTAL BID PRICE 672,264.51$       NO BID 662,388.99$       

SECTION 4 – SERVICE VALVES AND BOXES

Item Description Qty Units

Year 1 
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1” Red head curb stop model #41612 (open right) with 

drain or equal 150 Each  $       95.15  $       95.15  $       95.15  $              42,817.50  $  106.49  $  113.95  $  121.92  $              51,354.00  $       132.55  $         132.55  $        132.55  $              59,647.50 

¾” Red head curb stop model #41612 (open right) with 

drain or equal 75 Each  $       55.63  $       55.63  $       55.63  $              12,516.75  $    77.40  $    82.82  $    88.62  $              18,663.00  $         96.35  $           96.35  $          96.35  $              21,678.25 

1 ½” Red head curb stop (open right) with drain or 

equal 15 Each  $     178.42  $     178.42  $     178.42  $                8,028.90  $  250.63  $  268.17  $  286.95  $              12,086.25  $       311.96  $         311.96  $        311.96  $              14,038.20 

2” Red head curb stop (open right) with drain or equal 15 Each  $     289.91  $     289.91  $     289.91  $              13,045.95  $  334.94  $  358.38  $  383.47  $              16,151.85  $       416.90  $         416.90  $        416.90  $              18,760.50 

Buffalo style curb boxes  or equal 95-E 150 Each  $       35.13  $       35.13  $       35.13  $              15,808.50  $    37.95  $    43.64  $    50.19  $              19,767.00  $         44.19  $           44.19  $          44.19  $              19,885.50 

Buffalo curb box 12” top riser with cover or equal W/ 

lock ring 50 Each  $       26.35  $       26.35  $       26.35  $                3,952.50  $    17.25  $    19.84  $    22.81  $                2,995.00  $         34.25  $           34.25  $          34.25  $                5,137.50 

Buffalo curb box repair cover Inner repair lid – service 

box cover with bolt 150 Each  $         7.31  $         7.31  $         7.31  $                3,289.50  $      6.67  $      7.67  $      8.82  $                3,474.00  $           9.50  $             9.50  $            9.50  $                4,275.00 

SECTION 4 TOTAL BID PRICE 99,459.60$         124,491.10$       143,422.95$       

SECTION 5 - REPAIR PARTS

Item Description Qty Units

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price
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Bid Price

Year 2 
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Stainless steel repair sleeves Macrodresses #SS1 

6”x12w” or equal 15 Each  $       79.65  $       79.65  $       79.65  $                3,584.25  $  $  $  NO BID  $       106.19  $         106.19  $        106.19  $                4,778.55 

Stainless steel repair sleeves Macrodresses #SS1 

6”x12w” or equal 150 Each  $       79.65  $       79.65  $       79.65  $              35,842.50  $  $  $  NO BID  $       106.19  $         106.19  $        106.19  $              47,785.50 

Stainless steel repair sleeves Macrodresses #SS1 

8”x12w” or equal 100 Each  $       92.81 $92.81  $       92.81  $              27,843.00  $  $  $  NO BID  $       123.74  $         123.74  $        123.74  $              37,122.00 

Stainless steel repair sleeves Macrodresses #SS1 

10”x20”w or equal 30 Each  $     188.83  $     188.83  $     188.83  $              16,994.70  $  $  $  NO BID  $       251.76  $         251.76  $        251.76  $              22,658.40 

Stainless steel repair sleeves Macrodresses #SS1 

12”x20”w or equal 30 Each  $     222.79  $     222.79  $     222.79  $              20,051.10  $  $  $  NO BID  $       297.04  $         297.04  $        297.04  $              26,733.60 

Stainless steel repair sleeves Macrodresses #SS1 

4”x12”x1” or equal 15 Each  $       80.39  $       80.39  $       30.39  $                3,617.55  $  $  $  NO BID  $       107.18  $         107.18  $        107.18  $                4,823.10 

Stainless steel repair sleeves Macrodresses #SS1 

6”x12”x1” or equal 25 Each  $       94.11  $       94.11  $       94.11  $                7,058.25  $  $  $  NO BID  $       125.47  $         125.47  $        125.47  $                9,410.45 

Stainless steel repair sleeves Macrodresses #SS1 

8”x12”x1” or equal 15 Each  $     106.79  $     106.79  $     106.79  $                4,805.55  $  $  $  NO BID  $       142.38  $         142.38  $        142.38  $                6,407.10 

Stainless steel repair sleeves Macrodresses #SS1 

10”x20”x1” or equal 15 Each  $     220.45  $     220.45  $     220.45  $                9,920.25  $  $  $  NO BID  $       293.93  $         293.93  $        293.93  $              13,226.85 

Stainless steel repair sleeves Macrodresses #SS1 

12”x20”x1” or equal 15 Each  $     249.57  $     249.57  $     249.57  $              11,230.65  $  $  $  NO BID  $       332.75  $         332.75  $        332.75  $              14,973.75 

Repair couplings Hymax 2” or equal (2-bolt assembly) 6 Each  $       93.67  $       93.67  $       93.67  $                1,686.06  $  $  $  NO BID  $       108.76  $         108.76  $        108.76  $                1,957.68 

Repair couplings Hymax 4” or equal (2-bolt assembly) 16 Each  $     150.34  $     150.34  $     150.34  $                7,600.32  $  $  $  NO BID  $       180.06  $         180.06  $        180.06  $                8,642.88 

Repair couplings Hymax 6” or equal (2-bolt assembly) 150 Each  $     209.69  $     209.69  $     209.69  $              94,360.50  $  $  $  NO BID  $       237.72  $         237.72  $        237.72  $            106,974.00 

Repair couplings Hymax 8” or equal (2-bolt assembly) 50 Each  $     236.74  $     236.74  $     236.74  $              35,511.00  $  $  $  NO BID  $       269.22  $         269.22  $        269.22  $              40,383.00 

 Non-Responsive 

 Non-Responsive 

 Non-Responsive 

 Non-Responsive 



Repair couplings Hymax 10” or equal (2-bolt assembly) 16 Each  $     304.56  $     304.56  $     304.56  $              14,618.88  $  $  $  NO BID  $       342.56  $         342.56  $        342.56  $              16,442.88 

Repair couplings Hymax 12” or equal (2-bolt assembly) 16 Each  $     359.64  $     359.64  $     359.64  $              17,262.72  $  $  $  NO BID  $       418.58  $         418.58  $        418.58  $              20,091.84 

Repair couplings Hymax 16” or equal (4-bolt assembly) 12 Each  $ 1,003.70  $ 1,003.70  $ 1,003.70  $              36,133.20  $  $  $  NO BID  $   1,115.28  $     1,115.28  $    1,115.28  $              40,150.08 

Repair couplings Hymax 20” or equal (4-bolt assembly) 6 Each  $ 1,275.21  $ 1,275.21  $ 1,275.21  $              22,953.78  $  $  $  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

SECTION 5 TOTAL BID PRICE 371,074.26$       NO BID 422,561.46$       

SECTION 6 - WATER PIPE

Item Description Qty Units

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price

Year 3 

Bid Price Total Price

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price

Year 3 

Bid Price Total Price

Year 1 Bid 
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Year 2 Bid 
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Year 3 Bid 
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Year 1 Bid 
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Year 2 Bid 
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Year 3 Bid 

Price Total Price

Ductile water pipe class-52 cement lined 4” or equal 80 ft per ft  $       24.07  $       24.07  $       24.07  $                5,776.80  $  $  $  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Ductile water pipe class-52 cement lined 6” or equal 720 ft per ft  $       18.49  $       18.49  $       18.49  $              39,938.40  $  $  $  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Ductile water pipe class-52 cement lined 8” or equal 720 ft per ft  $       26.12  $       26.12  $       26.12  $              56,419.20  $  $  $  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Ductile water pipe class-52 cement lined 10” or equal 80 ft per ft  $       34.20  $       34.20  $       34.20  $                8,208.00  $  $  $  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Ductile water pipe class-52 cement lined 12” or equal 240 ft per ft  $       43.07  $       43.07  $       43.07  $              31,010.40  $  $  $  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Ductile water pipe class-52 cement lined 16” or equal 240 ft per ft  $       62.27  $       62.27  $       62.27  $              44,834.40  $  $  $  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

SECTION 6 TOTAL BID PRICE 186,187.20$       NO BID NO BID

SECTION 7 – SEWER REPAIR COUPLINGS

Item Description Qty Units

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price

Year 3 

Bid Price Total Price

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price

Year 3 

Bid Price Total Price

Year 1 Bid 

Price

Year 2 Bid 

Price

Year 3 Bid 

Price Total Price

Bid 

Price

Bid 

Price

Bid 

Price Total Price

Year 1 Bid 

Price

Year 2 Bid 

Price

Year 3 Bid 

Price Total Price

Clay to Plastic Sewer Repair Couplings 4” 66 Each  $         4.12  $         4.12  $         4.12  $                    815.76  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Clay to Plastic Sewer Repair Couplings 6” 66 Each  $         8.79  $         8.79  $         8.79  $                1,740.42  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Clay to Plastic Sewer Repair Couplings 8” 92 Each  $       13.53  $       13.53  $       13.53  $                3,734.28  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Clay to Plastic Sewer Repair Couplings 8” x 6” 24 Each  $       16.33  $       16.33  $       16.33  $                1,175.76  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Clay to Plastic Sewer Repair Couplings 10” 92 Each  $       20.30  $       20.30  $       20.30  $                5,602.80  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Clay to Plastic Sewer Repair Couplings 12” 92 Each  $       23.69  $       23.69  $       23.69  $                6,538.44  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Clay to Plastic Sewer Repair Couplings 15” 72 Each  $       37.25  $       37.25  $       37.25  $                8,046.00  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic Sewer Repair Couplings 4” 66 Each  $         4.13  $         4.13  $         4.13  $                    815.76  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic Sewer Repair Couplings 6” 66 Each  $         8.79  $         8.79  $         8.79  $                1,740.42  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic Sewer Repair Couplings 8” 92 Each  $       13.53  $       13.53  $       13.53  $                3,734.28  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic Sewer Repair Couplings 10” 92 Each  $       20.30  $       20.30  $       20.30  $                5,602.80  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic Sewer Repair Couplings 12” 92 Each  $       23.69  $       23.69  $       23.69  $                6,538.44  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic Sewer Repair Couplings 15” 66 Each  $       37.25  $       37.25  $       37.25  $                7,375.50  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic 22.5 Degree Bends 4” 10 Each  $         9.32  $         9.32  $         9.32  $                    279.60  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic 22.5 Degree Bends 6” 24 Each  $       18.42  $       18.42  $       18.42  $                1,326.24  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic 22.5 Degree Bends 8” 24 Each  $       53.59  $       53.59  $       53.59  $                3,858.48  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic 22.5 Degree Bends 10” 24 Each  $     146.66  $     146.66  $     146.66  $              10,559.52  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic 22.5 Degree Bends 12” 24 Each  $     191.23  $     191.23  $     191.23  $              13,768.56  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic 22.5 Degree Bends 15” 10 Each  $     532.43  $     532.43  $     532.43  $              15,972.90  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

 Non-Responsive 

 Non-Responsive 

 Non-Responsive 

 Non-Responsive 



Plastic to Plastic 45 Degree Bends 4” 10 Each  $         9.36  $         9.36  $         9.36  $                    280.80  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic 45 Degree Bends 6” 24 Each  $       18.98  $       18.98  $       18.98  $                1,366.56  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic 45 Degree Bends 8” 24 Each  $       53.10  $       53.10  $       53.10  $                3,823.20  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic 45 Degree Bends 10” 24 Each  $     137.78  $     137.78  $     137.78  $                9,920.16  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic 45 Degree Bends 12” 24 Each  $     200.10  $     200.10  $     200.10  $              14,407.20  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

Plastic to Plastic 45 Degree Bends 15” 10 Each  $     471.68  $     471.68  $     471.68  $              14,150.40  $  $  $  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

SECTION 7 TOTAL BID PRICE 143,174.28$       NO BID NO BID

SECTION 8 – SEWER PIPE

Item Description Qty Units

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price

Year 3 

Bid Price Total Price

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price

Year 3 

Bid Price Total Price

Year 1 Bid 

Price

Year 2 Bid 

Price

Year 3 Bid 

Price Total Price

Bid 

Price

Bid 

Price

Bid 

Price Total Price

Year 1 Bid 

Price

Year 2 Bid 

Price

Year 3 Bid 

Price Total Price

P.V.C. SDR-35 Sewer Pipe 4” 1260 ft per ft  $         1.12  $         1.12  $         1.12 $4,233.60  $  $  $  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

P.V.C. SDR-35 Sewer Pipe 6” 1260 ft per ft  $         2.50  $         2.50  $         2.50  $                9,450.00  $  $  $  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

P.V.C. SDR-35 Sewer Pipe 8” 2100 ft per ft  $         4.52  $         4.52  $         4.52  $              28,476.00  $  $  $  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

P.V.C. SDR-35 Sewer Pipe 10” 2100 ft per ft  $         7.08  $         7.08  $         7.08  $              44,604.00  $  $  $  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

P.V.C. SDR-35 Sewer Pipe 12” 2100 ft per ft  $       10.18  $       10.18  $       10.18  $              64,134.00  $  $  $  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

P.V.C. SDR-35 Sewer Pipe 15” 1260 ft per ft  $       15.11  $       15.11  $       15.11  $              57,115.80  $  $  $  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

SECTION 8 TOTAL BID PRICE 208,013.40$       NO BID NO BID

SECTION 9 – FIRE HYDRANTS AND ACCESSORIES

Item Description Qty Units

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price

Year 3 

Bid Price Total Price

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price

Year 3 

Bid Price Total Price

Year 1 Bid 

Price

Year 2 Bid 

Price

Year 3 Bid 

Price Total Price

Bid 

Price

Bid 

Price

Bid 

Price Total Price

Year 1 Bid 

Price

Year 2 Bid 

Price

Year 3 Bid 

Price Total Price

4 ½ ft. Hydrants 18 Each  $ 1,788.20  $ 1,788.20  $ 1,788.20  $              96,562.80  $  $  $  NO BID  $   1,817.13  $     1,817.13  $    1,817.13  $              98,125.02 

5 ft. Hydrants 18 Each  $ 1,828.79  $ 1,828.79  $ 1,828.79  $              98,754.66  $  $  $  NO BID  $   1,858.36  $     1,858.36  $    1,858.36  $            100,351.44 

5 ½ ft. Hydrants 45 Each  $ 1,869.35  $ 1,869.35  $ 1,869.35  $            252,362.25  $  $  $  NO BID  $   1,899.60  $     1,899.60  $    1,899.60  $            256,446.00 

6 ft. Hydrants 72 Each  $ 1,909.84  $ 1,909.84  $ 1,909.84  $            412,525.44  $  $  $  NO BID  $   1,940.83  $     1,940.83  $    1,940.83  $            419,219.28 

Extension Kit (6”) 20 Each  $     229.60  $     229.60  $     229.60  $              13,776.00  $  $  $  NO BID  $       339.68  $         339.68  $        339.68  $              20,380.80 

Traffic Repair Kit 75 Each  $     114.29  $     114.29  $     114.29  $              25,715.25  $  $  $  NO BID  $       240.59  $         240.59  $        240.59  $              54,132.75 

SECTION 9 TOTAL BID PRICE 899,696.40$       NO BID 948,655.29$       

SECTION 10 – MANHOLE AND CATCH BASIN FRAMES AND COVERS

Item Description Qty Units

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price

Year 3 

Bid Price Total Price

Year 1 

Bid Price

Year 2 

Bid Price

Year 3 

Bid Price Total Price

Year 1 Bid 

Price

Year 2 Bid 

Price

Year 3 Bid 

Price Total Price

Bid 

Price

Bid 

Price

Bid 

Price Total Price

Year 1 Bid 

Price

Year 2 Bid 

Price

Year 3 Bid 

Price Total Price

26” x 6” Manhole Frames and Covers 100 Each  $     264.71  $     264.71  $     264.71  $              79,413.00  $  $  $  NO BID  $       300.00  $         300.00  $        329.51  $              92,951.00 

24” x 24” x 8” Catch Basin Frames and Covers 100 Each  $     276.48  $     276.48  $     276.48  $              82,944.00  $  $  $  NO BID  $       361.19  $         361.19  $        396.72  $            111,910.00 

SECTION 10 TOTAL BID PRICE 162,357.00$       NO BID 204,861.00$       
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