MISCELLANEOUS FOOD PRODUCTS BID DATE: 12/10/18
BID TAB SHEET

Shaheen Brothers Thurston Foods Donahue Brothers Conlon Products Sal's Production Perfecto's Caffe Cool Tropics
Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
LN # [ITEM Unit Cost |Pk Cost |Brand Unit Cost|Pk Cost |Brand Cost Pk Cost |Brand Cost Pk Cost |Brand |Cost Pk Cost |Brand |Cost Pk Cost |Brand |Cost Pk Cost |Brand
1 |Baked Bean, #10 can $3.1083 |$18.65 Hanover $3.39 $20.35 |Furman $4.49 |$26.94 |Pocahontas |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
2 |Black Bean, #10 can $3.0417 |$18.25 Hanover $3.06 $18.36 |Furman $3.43 $20.58 |Pocahontas |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
3 |Garbanzo Bean, #10 can $3.3000 |$19.80 Hanover $3.315 [$19.89 |Furman $3.61 |$21.63 |Pocahontas |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
4 |Kidney Bean, #10 can $3.325 $19.95 Hanover $3.57 $21.42 |Furman $3.92 $23.47 |Pocahontas |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
5 |Pink Beans, #10 can $3.4917 |$20.95 Hanover No Bid |[No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
6 |WG, Bagel, Whole Wheat, 20z $0.2484 |$17.89 Pinnacle $0.164 |$11.83 |Aesops No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $0.364 |$17.49 No Bid |No Bid
7 |WG, Bagel, Cinnamon Raisin, 20z $0.2031 |$16.25 Original Bagel $0.164 |$11.83 |Aesops No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $0.364 |$17.49 No Bid |No Bid
8 |WG, Bagel, French Toast, 20z $0.1979 |$14.25 Muffin Town $0.164 |$11.83 |Aesops No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $0.364 |$17.49 No Bid |No Bid
9 |WG, Bagel, Blueberry, 20z $0.1979 |$14.25 Muffin Town $0.164 |$11.83 |Aesops No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $0.364 |$17.49 No Bid |No Bid
10 |WG, Bagel, Whole Wheat, 20z $0.1806 |$14.45 Original Bagel $0.136 |$11.42 |Aesops No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
11 |WG, Bagel, Cinnamon Raisin, 20z $0.1637 |$13.75 Muffin Town $0.136 |S11.42 |Aesops No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
12 |WG, Bagel, French Toast, 20z $0.1637 |$13.75 Muffin Town $0.136 |$11.42 |Aesops No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
13 |Pre-Packaged Breakfast,
WG, Strawberry Oatmeal Bar]$0.2706 |$25.95 Kellogg $0.959 |$46.02 |ES Foods No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
14 |Pre-Packaged Breakfast,
WG, RS Frosted Flakes|No Bid No Bid $0.847 |$60.96 |ES Foods No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
15 |Pre-Packaged Breakfast,
WG, Rice Chex, Gluten Free|No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
16 |Pre-Packaged Breakfast,
WG, Frosted Mini Wheats|$0.1978 [$18.99 Kellogg No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
17 |Pre-Packaged Breakfast,
WG, Multi Grain Cheerios|No Bid No Bid $0.847 |$50.80 |ES Foods No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
18 |Pre-Packaged Breakfast,
WG, RS Cinnamon Toast Crunch|No Bid No Bid $0.847 |$60.96 |ES Foods No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
19 |Cereal Bowl, 96ct.
WG, Cheerios, 102]$0.1943 |$18.65 General Mills $0.193 |$18.57 |GMills $0.195 |$18.67 |Gen Mills No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
20 |Cereal Bowl, 96ct.
WG, RS Cinnamon Toast Crunch, loz|rejected |rejected $0.193 [$18.57 |GMills $0.195 |$18.67 |Gen Mills No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
21 |Cereal Bowl, 96ct.
WG, RS Trix, 1oz|No Bid No Bid $0.193 |$18.57 |GMills $0.195 |$18.67 |Gen Mills No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
22 |Cereal Bowl, 96ct.
WG, Multi Grain Cheerios, 10z|$0.1943 |$18.65 General Mills $0.193 |$18.57 |GMills $0.195 |$18.67 |Gen Mills No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
23 |Cereal Bowl, 96ct.
WG, Rice Chex, 10z]$0.1943 |$18.65 General Mills $0.193 |$18.57 |GMills No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
24 |Cereal Bowl, 96ct.
WG, RS Cinnamon Flakes, Multi Grain, 10z|No Bid No Bid $0.20 $19.20 |Kelloggs No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
25 |Cereal Bowl, 96ct.
WG, Rice Krispies, 10z|No Bid No Bid $0.20 $19.20 |Kelloggs $0.195 |$18.67 |Gen Mills No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
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26 |Cereal Bowl, 96ct.
WG, Frosted Mini Wheats, 1o0z|No Bid No Bid $0.20 $19.20 |Kelloggs No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
27 |Cereal Bowl, 96ct.
WG, Blueberry Frosted Mini Spooners, 10z|No Bid No Bid $0.318 [$30.55 |Post/Mom |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
28 |Cereal Bowl, 96ct.
WG, Strawberry Frosted Mini Spooners, 1oz|No Bid No Bid $0.318 [$30.55 |Post/Mom |[No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
29 |[Cereal Bowl, 96ct.
WG, Cinnamon Chex, 10z|$0.1943 |$18.65 General Mills $0.193 [$18.57 |GMills No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
30 |Cereal Bowl, 96¢ct
WG, Alpha Bits, 1oz|No Bid No Bid $0.318 [$30.55 |Post/Mom |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
31 |Oatmeal, Hot, Plain $0.8229 |$39.50 Pepsico $0.494 |S24.68 |Gilster $0.198 |$9.49 |Quaker No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
32 |Granola, bulk $12.4125 |$49.65 General Mills $0.143 |$35.41 |Safe & Fair |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
33 |Granola, Individual serving No Bid No Bid $0.173 |$33.29 |Safe & Fair |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
34 |Cinnamon Rolls No Bid No Bid $0.224 |S44.80 |Pillsbury No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
35 |Cinnamon Rolls, IW $0.3736 |$26.90 Super Bakery $0.316 |S11.38 |Hadley No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
36 |Cinnamon Crumb Cake, IW $0.4160 |$29.95 Sky Blue $0.37 $26.62 |Simply No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
37 |Cinnamon Rolls, mini, IW $0.3979 |$28.65 General Mills $0.392 |$28.25 |Pillsbury No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
38 |Churros, Cherry No Bid No Bid $0.334 |$33.39 |J&J Apple No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
39 |Churros, Raspberry $0.3325 |$33.25 J&J Snack $0.334 |$33.39 |J&J No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
40 |Churros, Mango No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
41 |Churros, Original $0.2845 |$28.45 J&J Snack $0.287 |$28.73 |l&J No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
42 |Granola Bar, Oats and Honey $0.1899 |$27.35 General Mills $0.19 $27.34 |NatValley [$0.193 |$27.74 |Appleway No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
43 |Granola Bar, LF Chocolate Chip $0.2388 |$28.65 General Mills $0.24 $28.76 |NatValley |NoBid [No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
44 |Granola Bar, LS Smores No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Betty
45 |Oatmeal Bar, Butterscotch $0.2773 |$39.93 General Mills $0.275 |$39.54 |Crocker No Bid | No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Betty
46 |Oatmeal Bar, Chocolate Chip No Bid No Bid $0.275 |$39.54 |Crocker $0.227 |$48.91 |Appleway No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Betty
47 |Oatmeal Bar, Double Chocolate Chip $0.2773  |$39.93 General Mills $0.275 [$39.54 |Crocker No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
48 |Fruit/Oatmeal Bar, Apple No Bid No Bid $0.259 |$24.88 |Kelloggs $0.221 |$47.75 |Appleway No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Kelloggs
49 |Fruit/Oatmeal Bar, Pomegranate No Bid No Bid $0.259 |S24.88 |Blueberry [$0.221 [$47.75 |Appleway No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
50 |Fruit/Oatmeal Bar, Strawberry $0.2432 |$23.35 Kellogg $0.259 |$24.88 |Kelloggs $0.221 |$47.75 |Appleway No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
51 |Oatmeal Bites, Cinnamon No Bid No Bid $0.27 $32.44 |NatValley |$0.205 [$22.08 |Appleway No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
52 |Oatmeal Bites, Chocolate Chip No Bid No Bid $0.27 $32.44 |NatValley [|NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
53 |Cereal Bar, Apple Cinnamon Cheerios $0.2603  [$24.99 General Mills $0.261 [$25.08 |GMill $0.264 |$25.29 |Gen Mills No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
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54 |Cereal Bar, Trix $0.2603 |$24.99 General Mills $0.261 [$25.08 |GMills $0.264 |$25.29 |Gen Mills No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
55 |Cereal Bar, Cinnamon Toast Crunch $0.2603  [$24.99 General Mills $0.261 [$25.08 |GMills $0.264 |$25.29 |Gen Mills No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
56 |Cereal Bar, Golden Grahams $0.2603 |$24.99 General Mills $0.261 [$25.08 |GMills $0.264 |$25.29 |Gen Mills No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
57 |Muffin Tops, Apple Cinnamon $0.3219 |$15.45 Muffin Town $0.298 |$14.28 |Muffintwn |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
58 |Muffin Tops, Blueberry $0.25 $14.99 Muffin Town $0.298 |$14.28 |Muffintwn |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
59 |Muffin Loaf, Banana $0.3885 [$18.65 Muffin Town $0.338 [$16.22 |Muffintwn |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
60 |Muffin Loaf, Zucchini rejected |rejected $0.338 |$16.22 |Muffintwn |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
61 |Muffin Loaf, Corn $0.3885 [$18.65 Muffin Town $0.213 |$15.30 |Muffintwn |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
62 |UBR, Cinnamon $0.3702 |$46.65 Rich Foods $0.362 |$45.65 |Richs No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
63 |UBR, Chocolate Chip $0.3710 |$46.75 Rich Foods $0.362 |$45.65 |Richs No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
64 |Breakfast Bar w/grape spread No Bid No Bid $0.394 |$29.97 |TastyBR No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
65 |Egg/Cheese on WG English Muffin $0.5201 |$49.93 Advance Pierre $0.504 |$48.42 |Advance No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
66 |Sausage on WG Pancake No Bid No Bid $0.357 |$14.27 |Jlimmy Dean |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
67 |Turkey Bacon/Egg/Cheese on WG Croissant |$0.2234 |$32.18 Schwan $0.945 |$45.38 |BakeCraft |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
68 |Glazed Pancakes, Blueberry No Bid No Bid $0.256 |$18.45 |BakeCraft |[NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
69 |Glazed French Toast, Cinnamon rejected |rejected $0.358 |$25.79 |Pillsbury No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
70 |Glazed French Toast, Chocolate Chip No Bid No Bid $0.354 |$25.50 |Kelloggs No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
71 |Glazed Waffles, Maple No Bid No Bid $0.354 |$25.50 |Kelloggs No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
72 |Pancakes rejected |rejected $0.094 |S13.48 |BakeCraft |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
73 |French Toast, Cinnamon $0.4628 |$66.65 Papetti's $0.433 |S47.63 |SunnyF No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
74 |French Toast Sticks, Cinnamon rejected |rejected $0.109 |$35.19 |Rich Sea No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
75 |Waffles, Original No Bid No Bid $0.12 $17.26 |BakeCraft |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
76 |Waffles, Sticks $0.1840 |$39.75 ConAgra $0.183 [$39.42 |Krustaez No Bid | No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Breadstick, Blueberry with cinnamon sugar
77 |cheese filling $0.4130 |$39.65 ConAgra $0.404 |$38.76 |Conagra No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
78 |Breakfast Bread, Banana rejected |rejected $0.449 |$31.42 |SuperBak No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
79 |Breakfast Bread, Chocolate rejected |rejected $0.460 |S$32.18 |SuperBak No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
80 |Breakfast Bread, Pumpkin $0.4707 |$32.95 Super Bakery $0.46 $32.18 |SuperBak No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
81 |Breakfast Bread, Blueberry $0.4564 |$31.95 Super Bakery $0.449 |S31.42 |SuperB No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
82 |Breakfast Bread, Zucchini No Bid No Bid $0.449 |S31.42 |SuperB No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
83 |WG Corn Muffin $0.21887 |$15.75 Muffin Town $0.380 |$18.22 |BakeCr No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid rejected |rejected No Bid |No Bid
84 |Croissant, pre-sliced No Bid No Bid $0.247 |$35.61 |Hadley No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
85 |WG, Ciabatta, pre-sliced, Plain $0.5658 [$33.95 Traditional Breads |$0.282 [$33.86 |Wenner No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
86 |Whole Grain soft tortilla, 6” $0.0706 |$10.95 Father Sam's $0.074 |$21.36 |Solis No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
87 |Whole Grain Wraps, 8”, Whole Wheat rejected |rejected $0.100 |$14.34 |Solis No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
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88 |Whole Grain Wraps, 8”, Spinach No Bid No Bid $0.212 |$25.40 |Tyson No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
89 |Whole Grain Wraps, 8”, Tomato Basil No Bid No Bid $0.204 |S24.47 |Tyson No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
90 |Salad Croutons, Plain No Bid No Bid $1.854 |$18.54 |SugFoods []$1.93 $19.36 |Pocahontas |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
91 |Salad Croutons, Seasoned rejected |rejected $1.706 |$17.06 |Marzetti $2.01 $20.19 |Pocahontas |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
92 |Buttermilk Biscuit — Plain $0.1629 |$29.65 Rich Foods $0.153 |$27.85 |Richs No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
93 |Buttermilk Biscuit - Blueberry No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
94 |Mini Garlic Toast $0.1754 |$21.93 Flowers Bakery $0.168 |$20.17 |BakeCr No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
95 |Mini Garlic Knots No Bid No Bid $0.224 |$13.41 |Wenner No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
96 |Tortilla Chips rejected |rejected $1.302 |$7.81 Solis $1.75 |$20.97 |Ortega No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
97 |Tortilla Chips, 1 oz No Bid No Bid $0.205 |$24.58 |Shearers No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
98 |Goldfish Bread $0.2138 |$25.65 Campbell's $0.227 |S27.22 |Pepp Farm |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
99 |Oven Fired Flatbread $0.1841 |$35.35 Rich Foods $0.18 $35.19 |Richs No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
100 |Mini Flatbread $0.6354 |$30.50 Rich Foods $0.141 |$27.10 |Richs No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
101 |American, sliced $1.8475 |$36.95 Schreiber Foods $1.758 |$35.17 |Great Lak No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
102 |Provolone $2.69 $41.95 Dot Direct $2.537 |$50.75 |Bongard No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
103 |Cheddar, block $2.21 $2.21 Cabot $1.94 $19.40 |Cabot No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
104 |Cheddar, sliced rejected |rejected $3.00 $36.05 |Bongard No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
105 |Cheddar, shredded $4.0300 |$48.40 Land O Lakes $1.93 $38.65 |Greatlak |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
106 |Mozzarella, shredded $1.9980 |$59.95 Saputo $2.131 |$42.63 |Greatlak [NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
107 |Pepper Jack, sliced $3.9958 |$47.95 Land O Lakes $3.36 $40.35 |Bongard No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
108 |Swiss, block $2.9400 |($2.94 Cabot $3.12 $49.92 |Mama No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
109 |ltalian, Grated $4.4950 |$89.90 Cheese Merchants |$2.683 |$53.65 |Bella No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
110 |Cheese Sauce, Alfredo, Pouch No Bid No Bid $1.835 [$72.94 |LOL $7.79 $62.31 |Nestle No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
111 |String Cheese Portions $0.2239 |$21.50 Frigo $0.17 $27.24 |Great Lake |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
JTM not

112 |Cheese Sauce, Frozen No Bid No Bid $1.738 [$52.14 |frozen No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
113 |BBQ Sauce, 1 oz. cups $0.0856 |$8.56 Diamond Crystal  |$0.087 |$8.67 |Taste Plea |$0.12 |$12.34 |Baby Rays No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid [No Bid
114 |BBQ Sauce, gallons $6.9625 |$27.85 Oasis/AAK $3.953 |$15.81 |PL $6.93 $27.72 |Kens No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
115 |Tomato Catsup, 1 oz. cups $0.8140 |$8.14 Diamond Crystal  |$0.080 |$7.97 FLV FRSH |$0.089 |$8.88 |Flavor Fresh |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
116 |Mustard Packet $9.5300 |$9.53 Diamond Crystal  ]$4.34 $4.34 American |$0.016 |$7.88 Flavor Fresh |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
117 |Mayonnaise Packet $16.3300 |$16.33  |Al Letizio $14.42 |S14.42 |American |$0.036 |$17.78 |Flavor Fresh |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
118 |Relish Packet $7.9300 |$7.93 Diamond Crystal  ]$5.15 $5.15 American |$0.046 |$9.14 Flavor Fresh |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

119 |Dill Pickles, 5 gal bucket
Sliced]$22.7500 [$22.75 Gielow $19.38 |$19.38 |Regal $23.68 [$23.68 |Kaiser No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

120 |Dill Pickles, 5 gal bucket
Diced|$20.7500 |$20.75 Gielow $24.01 |$24.01 |B&G $24.47 |S24.47 |Kaiser No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

121 |Dill Pickles, 5 gal bucket
Spears|$23.6200 |$23.62 Gielow $23.46 |$23.46 |Regal No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid




MISCELLANEOUS FOOD PRODUCTS BID DATE: 12/10/18
BID TAB SHEET

Shaheen Brothers Thurston Foods Donahue Brothers Conlon Products Sal's Production Perfecto's Caffe Cool Tropics
Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
LN # [ITEM Unit Cost |Pk Cost |Brand Unit Cost|Pk Cost |Brand Cost Pk Cost |Brand Cost Pk Cost |Brand |Cost Pk Cost |Brand |Cost Pk Cost |Brand |Cost Pk Cost |Brand
122 |Honey Mustard, 1 oz. cups $10.4800 |$10.48 Diamond Crystal  |$0.091 |$9.11 PPI $0.12  |$12.62 |Kens No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
123 |Hot Sauce, Packet $4.6300 |S4.63 Diamond Crystal  |$0.050 |$10.03 |T/Pete No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
124 |Jelly/Jam % oz. cups
(200ct box shall have asst. flavors)]|$10.7700 |$10.77 Diamond Crystal  ]$6.53 $6.53 Dia Crysta |$13.48 |$13.48 |Smuckers No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
125 |Maple Syrup Packet, Cups 1 oz. $9.3500 |$9.35 Diamond Crystal ]$6.16 $6.16 PPI $9.96 |$9.96 |Flavor Fresh |No Bid [No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
126 |Sweet & Sour Sauce Packet $11.8900 [$11.89 Schwan $8.55 $8.55 PPI $0.11 $11.27 |Kens No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
127 |Taco Sauce Packet $5.7200 |S$5.72 Diamond Crystal  ]$6.48 $6.48 Boca G No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
128 |Mayonnaise, low fat, gal $5.3625 [$21.45 Oasis/AAK $5.91 $23.64 |Kens $6.06 $24.24 |Kens No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
129 |Margarine, cups (600 ct) $0.0265 |$23.85 Oasis/AAK $18.71 |$18.71 |SMT BAL No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
130 |Margarine $0.5783 |$17.35 Oasis/AAK $0.823 |$24.69 |MID ATL No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Schreiber or Land
131 |Cream Cheese, 1 oz pk $0.1910 |$19.10 O Lakes $0.156 |$15.56 |GRNMTN |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
132 |Sour Cream, 1 oz pk $0.1329 |$13.29 Hood $0.147 |$14.69 |LOL No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Salad Dressing, Fat Free, 1.50z pouch, (60
133 |ct)
Italian|$0.2321 [$19.50 Hidden Valley $0.125 |$7.49 Kens $0.127 |$7.60 |Kens No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Salad Dressing, Fat Free, 1.50z pouch, (60
134 |ct)
Ranch|$10.3500 |$10.35 Hidden Valley $0.157 [$9.42 Kens $0.16 |$9.57 |Kens No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Salad Dressing, Fat Free, 1.50z pouch, (60
135 |ct)
Caesar|No Bid No Bid $0.187 |$11.22 |Kens not ff |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Salad Dressing, Fat Free, 12gm packets,
136 |(200 ct)
Italian|No Bid No Bid $6.56 $6.56 DIA CRYS No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Salad Dressing, Fat Free, 12gm packets,
137 /(200 ct)
Ranch|No Bid No Bid $6.27 $6.27 America No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
138 |Salad Dressing, Fat Free, Gallons
Italian]|$8.9750 |$35.90 Hidden Valley $4.899 |$19.59 |Kens $5.04 |$20.17 |Kens No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
139 |Salad Dressing, Fat Free, Gallons
Ranch|$11.9875 [$47.95 Hidden Valley $7.976 |$31.91 |Kens $8.21  |$32.85 |Kens No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
140 |Salad Dressing, Fat Free, Gallons
Caesar|No Bid No Bid $9.374 |$37.50 |Cains $11.40 |$45.62 |Kens No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid [No Bid
141 |Salad Dressing, Fat Free, Gallons
Raspberry Vinaigrette|No Bid No Bid $7.724 |S30.90 |Kens $8.20 $32.81 |Kens No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
142 |Tomato Salsa, Chunky, $8.6575 [$34.63 Ortega $6.737 |$26.95 |Mesa Gran |$11.46 |$45.85 |La Victoria No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
143 |Sweet & Sour Sauce, Gallons No Bid No Bid $9.277 |$37.11 |Kens $9.37 $37.48 |Kens No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
144 |Soy Sauce, Low Salt, Gallons No Bid No Bid $11.21 |$11.21 |LaChoy $5.67 $51.04 |Kikoman No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
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Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
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145 |Spaghetti Sauce
Gallons/Pouches|$3.9080 |$23.45 Don Pepino $3.273 |$19.64 |Furman $3.47 $20.85 |Furman No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
146 |Graham Crackers, IW $0.1993 |$13.50 Honey Maid $0.104 |$15.56 |NBC No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Cookies/Crackers — Cinnamon Teddy
147 |Grahams $0.1517 |$22.75 Teddy Grahams $0.112 |$16.87 |NBC $0.17 $17.37 |[NBC No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
148 |Cookies/Crackers — Animal Crackers $0.2069 [$9.93 Mondelez $0.153 |$22.95 |Keebler $0.20 $9.65 NBC No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
149 |Cookies/Crackers — Mini Chocolate Chip $0.2810 [$20.23 Super Bakery $0.184 |$35.25 |Safe & Fair ]$0.30 $14.71 |NBC No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Cookies/Crackers — Scooby Doo Graham
150 |Crackers No Bid No Bid $0.193 |$40.52 |Keebler No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
151 |Saltine Crackers, IW, Plain $0.0334 |$13.35 Mondelez $0.031 |$15.56 |NBC $0.02 $12.98 |[NBC No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
152 |Scrambled Egg Patty, Pre-cooked, Frozen $0.1342 |$19.33 Papetti's $0.131 |$18.80 |Papetti No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
153 |Colby Cheese Omelet, Frozen $0.3635 |$52.35 Papetti's $0.230 |$33.12 |Papetti No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
154 |Applesauce, Unsweetened, #10 can $3.8250 |$22.95 Knouse Domestic |$4.146 |$24.88 |Knouse $3.20 |$19.25 |NorthEast No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Northeast
Marketing
155 |Fruit Cocktail, Unsweetened, #10 can $4.9833 |$29.90 Imported $6.052 |$36.31 |Seneca $4.70  |$28.25 |NorthEast No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Northeast
Mandarin Oranges, Water and/or 100% Marketing
156 |Fruit Juice, #10 can $5.4833 |$32.90 Imported $5.10 $30.60 |Ambrosia [$5.06 |$30.40 |NorthEast No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Northeast
Peaches, Diced, Water and/or 100% Fruit Marketing
157 |Juice, #10 can $4.2500 |$25.50 Imported $5.88 $35.29 |Delmonte [|$4.08 $24.49 |NorthEast No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Northeast
Pears, Dices, Water and/or 100% Fruit Juice, Marketing
158 |#10 can $4.4166 |$26.50 Imported $6.333 |$38.00 |Delmonte ]$4.15 $24.89 |NorthEast No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Northeast
Pineapple, Chunk, Water and/or 100% Fruit Marketing
159 |Juice, #10 can $3.8250 |$22.95 Imported $3.358 [$20.15 |NOEAST $3.22 $19.34 |NorthEast No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Northeast
Pineapple, Rings, Water and/or 100% Fruit Marketing
160 |Juice, #10 can $4.4166 |$26.50 Imported $4.335 |$26.01 |NOEAST $4.10 $24.60 |NorthEast No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
161 |Plantain Slices, Frozen 24lb case No Bid No Bid $1.581 [$37.94 |COMIDA No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Northeast
Marketing
162 |Fruit Cups — Mixed Fruit $0.3281 [$31.50 Imported $0.56 $26.88 |Delmonte ]$0.30 $29.22 |NorthEast No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
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Northeast
Marketing
163 |Fruit Cups — Diced Peaches $0.3281 [$31.50 Imported $0.539 |$25.86 |Delmonte ]$0.30 $29.22 |NorthEast No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Northeast
Marketing
164 |Fruit Cups — Diced Pears $0.3281 [$31.50 Imported $0.539 |$25.86 |Delmonte ]$0.30 $29.22 |NorthEast No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Blueberries, No Sugar Added, Frozen,
165 |(pound) $1.2250 [S$36.75 Jasper Wyman $1.197 [$35.90 |HARVST No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Strawberries, Whole, No Sugar Added,
166 |(pound) $1.4830 [$14.83 Jasper Wyman $1.234 |$37.03 |LATINO No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
167 |Fruit Pocket, Whole Grain, Frozen No Bid No Bid $0.286 |$34.32 |HORIZON No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

168 |Fruit Juice 100%, 4 oz.

Juicy Juice with

Apple]$0.1975 |$7.90 straw $0.112 |$10.75 |ARDMORE |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

169 |Fruit Juice 100%, 4 oz.
Cranberry]$0.1229 |$11.80 Ocean Spray $0.123 |$11.77 |ARDMORE |[No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

170 |Fruit Juice 100%, 4 oz.
Fruit Punch|rejected |rejected $0.115 |$11.01 |ARDMORE |[NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

171 |Fruit Juice 100%, 4 oz.

Juicy Juice w/

Grape|$0.1975 |$7.90 straw $0.145 |S13.94 |ARDMORE |[NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

172 |Fruit Juice 100%, 4 oz.
Orange|No Bid No Bid $0.138 |S13.26 |ARDMORE |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

173 |Fruit Juice 100%, 6 oz.
Apple]$0.2531  |$8.10 Juicy Juice w/straw |$0.165 |$7.92 ARDMORE |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

174 |Fruit Juice 100%, 6 oz.
Cranberry|No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

175 |Fruit Juice 100%, 6 oz.
Fruit Punch]$0.2531 |$8.10 Juicy Juice w/straw |$0.171  |$8.19 ARDMORE |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

176 |Fruit Juice 100%, 6 oz.
Grape|$0.2531 [$8.10 Juicy Juice w/straw |$0.222  |$10.66 |ARDMORE |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

177 |Fruit Juice 100%, 6 oz.
Orange|$0.2531 |$8.10 Juicy Juice w/straw |$0.203  |$9.74 ARDMORE |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

Country Pure
178 |Lemonade Base Fruit Juice, Frozen only $1.9541 |$23.45 Concentrate $1.658 [$19.89 |ARDMORE |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
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179 |100% Fruit Juice, Dessert, Frozen cup, 4 oz.
Blue Raspberry|No Bid No Bid $0.274 |$26.32  |J&J No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
180 |100% Fruit Juice, Dessert, Frozen cup, 4 oz.
Lime]No Bid No Bid $0.274 |$26.32 |I&J No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
181 |100% Fruit Juice, Dessert, Frozen cup, 4 oz.
Watermelon|$0.2786 |$26.75 J&J Snack $0.274 ($26.32  |J&J No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
182 |100% Fruit Juice, Dessert, Frozen cup, 4 oz.
Mango/Straw/Pom|$0.2786 |$26.75 J&J Snack $0.274 |$26.32 |J&J No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
183 |Cool Tropics Rips, 100 % Fruit Juice
Cool Trop
blue Cool
Sour Apple|No Bid No Bid $0.345 |S20.71 |Raspberry |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $0.34 [$20.55 |[Tropics
184 |Cool Tropics Rips, 100 % Fruit Juice
Cool
Kiwi/Strawberry|No Bid No Bid $0.345 |$20.71 |Cool Tropics|No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $0.34 |$20.55 |Tropics
185 |Cool Tropics Rips, 100 % Fruit Juice
Cool
Mango/Guava/Orange|No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $0.36 [$21.65 |Tropics
186 |Chicken Bacon, Pre-Cooked, Frozen No Bid No Bid $3.655 |$43.86 |Pierce No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
187 |Cold Cut, German Bologna $1.3900 |S$1.39 Kayem $1.23 $19.68 |Kayem No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Old
188 |Cold Cut, Chicken Breast — Plain No Bid No Bid $2.79 $27.95 |Neighbor No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Oold
189 |Cold Cut, Chicken Breast — Honey Mesquite |No Bid No Bid $3.92 $54.88 |Neighbor No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Oold
190 |Cold Cut, Chicken Breast — Buffalo $3.89 $3.89 Old Neighborhood |$3.92 $54.88 |Neighbor No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
191 |Cold Cut, Mortadella $1.6900 |S$1.69 Kayem $1.60 $22.40 |Kayem No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
192 |Cold Cut, Genoa Salami $1.7900 |S1.79 Kayem $2.37 $23.70 |Hormel No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
193 |Cold Cut, Ham, Imported $1.20 $62.50 Hormel 4x6 Ham ]$1.205 |$15.67 |Hormel No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
194 |Cold Cut, Canadian Style Turkey Ham $2.5900 |S$2.59 Jennie-O $3.634 [$90.13 |Jennio No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Cold Cut, Turkey Breast, Oven
195 |Roasted/Browned No Bid No Bid $3.18 $57.24 |Jennio No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
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196 |Cold Cut, Pastrami, Round $4.6900 |S4.69 Old Neighborhood [$2.45 $39.20 |Jennio No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
197 |Egg Rolls, Frozen
Pork|$0.5292 |$31.75 Schwan $0.514 |$30.86 |MINH No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
198 |Mini Egg Rolls, Frozen
Pork|No Bid No Bid $0.338 |$48.69 |MINH No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
199 |WG Filled Tortillas (Tornados) —
Egg, Sausage & Cheese|$0.5618 |$0.5618 |Ruiz $0.559 [$80.48 |RUIZ No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
200 |WG Filled Tortillas (Tornados) —
Ranchero Steak and Cheese|$0.5618 |$80.90 Ruiz $0.559 [$80.48 |RUIZ No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
201 |WG Filled Tortillas (Tornados) —
Southwest Chicken|$0.5618 |$80.90 Ruiz $0.559 |$80.48 |RUIZ No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
202 [Beef, Ground, Raw 80/20, Frozen $2.9200 |$2.92 Packer $1.85 $18.50 |Swift No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
203 |Beef, Patty, Fully Cooked, No TVP Frozen $4.4260 |$92.95 Advance Pierre $2.644 |$46.41 |Advance No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
204 [Meatballs Fully Cooked, Frozen $10.3330 |$77.50 Advance Pierre $1.74 $17.41 |Advance No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
205 |Beef Teriyaki Dippers, Fully Cooked, Frozen |$22.7420 |$99.50 Advance Pierre No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
206 |Beef, Shaved Steak, Raw, Frozen $3.9400 |$3.94 Old Neighborhood [$2.76 $27.60 |Maidrite No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
207 |Beef, Meat Pie, Jamaican-Style, Frozen No Bid No Bid $0.851 |$42.55 |Scotts No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
208 |Pepperoni, Frozen No Bid No Bid $2.09 $52.33 |Tyson No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
209 | Chicken, Popcorn style, Fully Cooked, frozen]$2.8500 |$2.85 Brakebush $1.632 [$32.64 |Proview No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Chicken, Breaded Breakfast Fillet, Fully
210 [Cooked, Frozen $2.6700 Brakebush $2.489 |$74.68 |GoldKist No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Chicken Teriyaki Dippers, Fully Cooked,
211 |Frozen $2.3893 [$44.80 Advance Pierre $2.25 $42.23 |Pierre No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Chicken Korean Dippers, Fully Cooked,
212 |Frozen No Bid No Bid $3.33 $116.63 |Tyson No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Chicken, Artisan, Smoked, Fully Cooked,
213 |Frozen No Bid No Bid $3.315 [S$33.15 |Kayem No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Chicken Breast Filets, Fully Cooked, Grilled,
214 |Fz rejected |rejected $3.539 [$35.39 |Proview No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Chicken Tenderloins, Uncooked, Breaded,
215 |Frozen $5.9600 [$29.80 Brakebush $2.336 [$23.36 |Tyson No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Chicken Breast Filets, Fully Cooked,
216 |Breaded, Frozen $3.8900 [$38.90 Brakebush $2.583 [$25.83 |BrakeBush |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
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Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
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217 |Chicken, Chunks, Fully Cooked, Frozen $3.4600 [$34.60 Brakebush $1.863 |$55.89 |Tyson No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Chicken, Chunks, Buffalo Glazed, Fully
218 |Cooked, Frozen $3.5400 [$35.40 Brakebush $2.11 $21.11 |Tyson No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
219 |Chicken, Drumsticks, Raw, Frozen No Bid No Bid $0.68 $27.20 |PL No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
220 |Chicken Diced, Cooked, Frozen No Bid No Bid $2.764 |$27.64 |Proview No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Chicken, Dark Meat, Strips w/Grill Marks
221 |Fully Cooked, Frozen No Bid No Bid $2.867 |$86.02 |COMIDA No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Fish, Alaskan Pollock, Breaded, Fully
222 |Cooked, Frozen No Bid No Bid $2.587 |$25.87 |Highliner No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Fish, Alaskan Pollock, Sweet Potato Crusted,
223 |Fully Cooked, Frozen rejected |rejected $2.499 |$24.99 |Channel No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Northeast
224 |Fish, Tuna, Pouchpak $13.1250 |$52.50 Marketing $7.948 |$47.69 |Starkist $7.52 $45.15 |NorthEast No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Old Neighborhood
225 [Sausage, Sweet Italian, Fully Cooked, Frozen|$3.9400 |$47.28 |catch weight $2.948 |$29.48 |Genoa No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Advance Pierre
226 |Pork, Riblet Style, Frozen $2.4500 |$55.10 Advance Notice $1.984 [$31.01 |Advance No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
227 |Pork, Shredded, No Seasoning, Frozen No Bid No Bid $3.488 |$97.67 |Advance No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
228 |Turkey Sausage Patty, Fully Cooked, Frozen |$2.5600 |$25.60 Jennie-O $1.734 |S17.34 |Jimmy Dean|No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
229 [Turkey Breast Stick, Frozen, IW, No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Oven Roasted]$6.9500 |$6.95 Jennie-O No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
230 [Turkey Breast Stick, Frozen, IW, No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Smoke House|No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
231 |Turkey Breast Stick, Frozen, IW No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Sweet BBQ|$6.7500 |$6.75 Jennie-O No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
232 |Turkey, Crumble, Fully Cooked, Frozen No Bid No Bid $1.894 |$56.81 |Ad Pierre No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
233 |Hummus, Classic, Cup $0.4146 |$19.90 Cedar's $0.38 $18.26 |Cedars No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
234 |Chicken Strips, Cooked, Frozen No Bid No Bid No Bid |[No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
235 |Non-Meat Beef Crumbles, Frozen No Bid No Bid No Bid |[No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
236 [Non-Meat Italian Meatballs, Frozen $3.5900 |S$3.59 Dr Praegers $3.814 |$40.43 |Garden No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Tortellini, Whole Grain, Fully Cooked,
237 |Frozen $2.1900 [$26.28 Carla's Pasta $2.40 $72.06 |Tasty BR No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Pasta, Fully Cooked, Frozen
238 |Rotini $1.4900 [$17.98 Carla's Pasta $1.165 [$23.31 |Marzetti No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
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Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
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Pasta, Fully Cooked, Frozen
239 (Spaghetti No Bid No Bid $1.075 [$21.49 |Marzetti No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
240 |Pasta, Fully Cooked, Frozen Penne $1.102 $20.50 Carla's Pasta $1.165 [$23.31 |Marzetti No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Northeast
Marketing
241 |Pasta, Dry Penne |$0.4975 [$9.95 imported $0.716 |$14.31 |Dakota $0.78 $18.70 |Anna No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Northeast
Marketing
242 |Pasta, Dry Spaghetti |[50.4975 |$9.95 Imported $0.716 |$14.31 |Dakota $0.78 $18.70 |Anna No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
243 |Pasta, Dry Fettucini |No Bid No Bid $1.347 |$13.47 |Dakota $0.88 $17.60 |Anna No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Mini Ravioli, Breaded, whole grain, frozen
244 |(7 piece) No Bid No Bid $0.416 |$59.09 |Tasty BRA |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Breaded Mozzarella Sticks (5 piece) Whole
245 |Grain, Frozen rejected |rejected $0.596 [$50.03 |Rich SEAP |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Cheese Filled Bread Sticks, 6” Whole Grain,
246 |Frozen No Bid No Bid $0.212 |$40.70 |Gilardi No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
247 |Calzones, Cheese, Whole Grain, Frozen $0.7900 |$37.92 ConAgra $0.697 |$41.82 |Gilardi No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
248 |French Bread, Cheese, Whole Grain, Frozen|$0.6658 |$39.95 Schwan $0.633 |$38.00 |Tony's No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
249 |French Bread, Garlic, Whole Grain, Frozen |$0.8775 |$52.65 Schwan $0.666 [$39.96 |Tony's No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
250 |Pizza, Pinwheels, No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Mozzarella Cheese, Whole Grain|$0.8775 |$52.65 |Schwan $0.691 |$66.35 |ES Foods No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
251 |Pizza, Pinwheels, No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Veggie, Whole Grain|No Bid No Bid $0.732 |$70.27 |ES Foods No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Pizza, Cheese, Fresh, 16-18” Round, Whole Sal's
252 |Grain, Cryo Pac No Bid No Bid No Bid |[No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $6.40 $38.40 |Pizza |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Pizza, Cheese, Frozen, 16-18” Round, Whole Big Daddy
253 |Grain, Cryo Pac $7.4055 |$66.65 Schwan $0.847 |$61.02 |Schwanns |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
254 [Rice, Brown, Whole Grain, Par Boiled $0.6480 [$16.20 Producers $0.638 [$15.95 |Riceland $0.68 $17.15 No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Whole Grain Orzo, Red Quinoa & Vegetable
255 |Blend, Frozen $2.0333  [$30.50 Simplot No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
256 |Grilled Cheese w/Turkey Bacon, IW, Frozen |No Bid No Bid $0.842 |$60.60 |Integrated |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
257 |Grilled Cheese, IW, Frozen No Bid No Bid $0.65 $46.82 |Integrated |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
258 |Roast Turkey on WG Bun, IW, Frozen No Bid No Bid $2.03 $60.89 |ES Foods No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
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Turkey Ham and Cheese on WG Swirl roll,
259 |IW, Frozen (Div Cheese)* No Bid No Bid $0.577 |$57.72 |Integrated |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Sunflower Seed Butter & Grape Jelly, IW,
260 |Frozen No Bid No Bid $0.616 [$59.16 |Sunwise No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Sunflower Seed Butter & Strawberry Jelly,
261 [IW, Frozen $0.7100 |$68.16 Muffin Town $0.616 [$59.16 |Sunwise No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
100 Calorie Type, Whole Grain, Individual
262 |Serving
Cheez-1t]$0.1700 |$29.75 Mondelez $0.156 |$27.29 |Sunshine $0.32 $23.22 |NBC No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
100 Calorie Type, Whole Grain, Individual
263 |Serving
Oreo|$0.1800 |$21.60 Mondelez $0.306 |$22.01 |NBC $0.31 $22.66 |NBC No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
100 Calorie Type, Whole Grain, Individual
264 |Serving
Chocolate Chip Cookies]|$0.2400 |$17.28 Michael's Bakery ]$0.306 |$22.01 |NBC $0.31 |$22.66 |NBC No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
100 Calorie Type, Whole Grain, Individual
265 |Serving
Wheat Thins|$0.3600 |$25.92 Mondelez $0.333 |$24.01 |NBC $0.34 $24.77 |NBC No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
100 Calorie Type, Whole Grain, Individual
266 |Serving
Shortbread Cookies|rejected |rejected $0.306 |$22.01 |NBC $0.31 |$22.66 |NBC No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
100 Calorie Type, Whole Grain, Individual
267 |Serving
Graham Crackers|No Bid No Bid $0.191 [$13.77 |NBC No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
268 |Chex Mix, Cheddar $0.3500 |$21.00 General Mills $0.312 |$18.72 |GMILL $0.33 $19.90 |[NBC No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
269 [Chex Mix, Strawberry Yogurt No Bid No Bid $0.312 [$18.72 |GMILL No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
270 |Snack Chips, Doritos No Bid No Bid $0.267 |$19.24 |Frito Lay No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
271 [Snack Chips, Cool Ranch Doritos No Bid No Bid $0.267 |$19.24 |Frito Lay No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
272 |Snack Chips, Baked Original No Bid No Bid $0.268 |$16.05 |Frito Lay No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
273 |Snack Chips, Baked BBQ No Bid No Bid $0.268 |$16.05 |Frito Lay No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
274 |Snack Chips, Baked Sour Cream No Bid No Bid $0.268 |$16.05 |Frito Lay No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
275 |Snack Chips, Smartfood Delight Popcorn No Bid No Bid $0.267 |$19.24 |Frito Lay No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
276 |Snack Chips, .500z Cape Cod Chip, RF No Bid No Bid $0.119 |$12.34 |Cape Cod No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Cool
Tropics
277 |Snack Chips, TGIF — Cheddar Fries No Bid No Bid $0.310 |$27.89 |SALVEO No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $0.289 |$20.85 |TGIF
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Cool
Tropics
278 |Snack Chips, TGIF — Extreme Heat No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $0.289 |$20.85 |TGIF
279 |Snack Chips, Pita Chips w/sea salt No Bid No Bid $0.313 |$21.89 |Kangaroo |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
280 |Pre-Packaged Snacks, Assorted,
Snack/Juice
Pretzel/Juice]No Bid No Bid No Bid |[No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
281 |Pre-Packaged Snacks, Assorted,
Snack/Juice
Cracker/Juice]$0.5900 |$28.32 Notables $0.714 |$21.42 |ES Foods No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
282 |Pre-Packaged Snacks, Assorted,
Snack/Juice
Cookie/Juice|No Bid No Bid $0.714 |$21.42 |ES Foods No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
283 |Pre-Packaged Snacks, Assorted,
Snack/Juice
Chips/Juice|No Bid No Bid $0.714 |$21.42 |ES Foods No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
284 |Pre-Packaged Snacks, Assorted,
Snack/Juice — Gluten Free Choc
Chip/Juice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
285 |Adobo Seasoning, Light $3.6200 |$43.44 Goya $0.126  |$9.07 Trader No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
286 |Adobo Seasoning, Bitter Orange $3.6200 |$43.44 Goya No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Sazon 6% DV of
Sodium per
287 [Sazon Seasoning $8.9257 |$56.50 package $0.532 |$26.93 |Goya No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Boston
288 |Tomato Soup, Frozen $2.4125 |$28.95 Campbell's $2.937 |$35.24 |Campbells |$11.25 |$22.50 |Chowder No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
289 [Corn, Whole Kernel, Frozen $0.7625 |$15.25 Simplot $0.717 |S14.34 |CHILL No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
290 |Green Beans, Cut Style, Frozen $0.8750 |$17.50 Simplot $0.732 |$14.65 |CHILL No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
291 |Vegetables, Scandinavian Style, Frozen $1.0208 |$24.50 Simplot $0.949 |$22.79 |Harvest No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
292 |Vegetables, Summer Blend, Frozen No Bid No Bid $0.99 $23.77 |Harvest No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
293 |Vegetables, Mandarin Blend, Frozen No Bid No Bid $0.96 $19.20 |Harvest No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
294 |Carrots, Dices, Frozen $0.7990 [$15.98 Simplot $0.625 [$12.51 |CHILL No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Vegetable Juice 100%, 4 oz.  Calypso
295 |Crush No Bid No Bid $0.196 [$13.69 |Ardmore No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Vegetable Juice 100%, 4 oz.  Dragon
296 |Punch No Bid No Bid $0.150 [$10.50 |Ardmore No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Vegetable Juice 100%, 6 oz. Mango
297 |Wango No Bid No Bid $0.209 |$14.60 |Ardmore No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
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298 |Vegetable Juice 100%, 6 oz. Sunset Sip No Bid No Bid $0.209 |$14.66 |Ardmore No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
299 |Vegetables, Italian Mix, Frozen No Bid No Bid $0.99 $19.81 |Chefs No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
300 |Vegetables, Peas, Green, Frozen $1.375 $27.50 Simplot $0.855 [$17.11 |CHILL No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
True Rec
301 |Potatoes, Instant, Mashed, 48 oz can $5.8083 [$34.85 Idahoan $6.076 |$36.45 |Simplot $6.51 $39.05 |Pocahontas |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
302 |Potatoes, Sweet, crinkle Fries $1.4260 |$21.39 McCain $1.444 |$21.65 |McCain No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
303 |Potato, Sweet, Wedges, Frozen $1.4260 [$21.39 McCain $1.44 $21.65 |McCain No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
304 |Potato, Sweet, Chunks, Frozen $1.4260 |$21.39 McCain $1.499 [$22.48 |Simplot No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
305 |Potato, Red Skin, Chunks, Frozen $1.3531 |$21.65 McCain $1.02 $30.60 |McCain No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
306 |Yucca, Steak Cut Fries Frozen No Bid No Bid $2.146 |$51.51 |Comida No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Poland Poland
307 |Spring Water, Sport Top Bottle, 23.70z $0.3604 |$8.65 Crystal Geyser $0.336 |S$8.06 Saratoga $0.31 |$8.74 |Springs $0.325 |$7.80 Springs |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Poland Poland
308 |Spring Water, Bottle, 8 oz. $0.2136 |$5.98 Crystal Geyser $0.126 |$6.06 Nestle $0.17 |$8.50 |Springs $0.165 |$7.92 Springs |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Poland Crystal
309 |Spring Water, Gallon (1) $1.4167 |$8.50 Poland Spring $0.734 [S2.94 Hood $1.33 |$7.98 |Springs $1.30 |$7.80 Geyser |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
310 |Fruited Yogurt, Low Fat, 4 oz.
Strawberry/Bananal$0.2496 [$11.98 General Mills $0.219 |$10.53 |Dannon No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
311 |Fruited Yogurt, Low Fat, 4 oz.
Dannon
Raspberry Rainbow|$0.2496 |$11.98 General Mills $0.219 |$10.53 |strawberry |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
312 |Fruited Yogurt, Low Fat, 4 oz.  Vanilla rejected |rejected $0.219 |$10.53 |Dannon No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
313 |Fruited Yogurt Tubes, Low Fat, 4 oz.,
Strawberry|$0.2287 |$10.98 Dannon $0.321 |$15.42 |GEN Mills No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
314 |Fruited Yogurt Tubes, Low Fat, 4 oz.,
Mixed Berry]No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
315 |Yogurt, Vanilla Pro, 64 oz $3.9883 [$23.93 General Mills $3.874 |$23.25 |GEN Mills |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
316 |Food Release, 14 oz. can
Butter Flavor]$3.4583 [$20.75 Vegaline $4.00 $24.00 |CONAGRA |NoBid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
317 |Food Release, 14 oz. can
Garlic Flavor|$3.4583 |$20.75 Vegaline $3.88 $23.33  |Buttermist |No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
318 |Food Release, 14 oz. can
Olive Qil Flavor|$4.9167 |$29.50 Fvegaline $2.29 $13.74 |CONAGRA |$4.53 $27.20 |Refine No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid




