COLLECTION OF SOLID AND RECYCLABLE WASTE SERVICES SPREADSHEET

MARCH 8, 2019

: E L Harvey & Sons, Inc. e { ¥ i
Description Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5 Year1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5
Base Proposal Price
Proposed Contract Price for current method of collection:
Solid Waste Annual Price $2,414,590.00] $2,535,320.00] $2,662,085.00] $2,795,190.00] $2,934,949.00] $2,800,000.00| $2,884,000.00] $2,970,000.00] $3,060,000.00] $3,152,000.00
Recycled Waste Annual Price $927,828.00] $974,219.00] $1,022,930.00] $1,074,077.00| $1,127,781.00 $735,000.00) $757,000.00] $780,000.00] $805,000.00 $828,000.00
TOTAL BASE PRICE $3,176,000.00| $3,272,000.00| $3,369,000.00| $3,471,000.00| $3,575,000.00] $3,342,418.00] $3,510,539.00] $3,685,015.00| $3,869,267.00| $4,062,730.00] $3,535,000.00 $3,641,000.00| $3,750,000.00| $3,865,000.00| $3,980,000.00
Alternate #1 Proposal Price | | |
Proposed Contract Price for current method of solid waste collection & automated recycling:
Solid Waste Annual Price NO BID NO BID
Recycled Waste Annual Price NO BID NO BID
TOTAL ALT #1 PRICE $3,076,000.00| $3,168,000.00| $3,263,000.00] $3,361,000.00| $3,462,000.00 NO BID
Alternate #2 Proposal Price | | | | |
Proposed Contract Price for current method of solid waste collection,automated recycling and supplying 95 gallon containers (Otto style):
Solid Waste Annual Price NO BID NO BID
Recycled Waste Annual Price
(Contractor must provide its

revenue sharing formula) NO BID NA NA/ NA NA NA
TOTAL ALT #2 PRICE $3,376,000.00| $3,477,000.00| $3,582,000.00| $3,689,000.00| $3,800,000.00 NO BID $50.00 Ton $50.00 Ton] $50.00 Ton $50.00 Ton $50.00 Ton
Alternate #3 Proposal Price | |
iProposed Contract Price for Disposal of Solid and Bulky Waste as of 10/01/19:
[Per Ton | | | NO BID $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $110.00 $115.00




